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Annual Contract for Mulch, Sod, Pine Straw & Ground Prep.

Bid Tbulation: ITB #016-13/ENR Odums Sod, Inc. |  Amerigrow Odums Sod, Inc. | Amerigrow Odums Sod,Inc. | Amerigrow
Item # _ Itern Description Uom Picked-Up Price Delivered Price Delivered & Installed
S0D: Various Types - ALL CERTIFIED KEY
1 |Floratam Persq.Ft. |$ 0.195 No Bid 3 0.21 No Bld 5 0.23 No Bld Primary Awardes
2 Bahia (See Specs) PerSg.Ft. S 0.21 No Bid $ 0.22 No Bld S 0.24 No Bid Secondary Awardes
3 |Palmetto - St Augustine Per Sq.Ft. |$ 0.13 No Bid S 0.14 No Bid $ 0.155 No Bid Mo Award
4 UltimateFlora - Zoysia Per 5q. Ft. No Brd No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 SeaDwarf - Seashore Paspalum Per Sq. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
3 Bermuda Per Sq.Ft. | S 0.22 No Bld s 0.23 No Bid $ 0.25 No Bid
7 Celebration Per 8q.Ft. [ & 0.22 No Bid $ 0.23 No Bld § 0.25 No Bid
8 Tiftway 413 Bermuda (See Specs) Per Sq.Ft. | S 0.23 No Bid s 0.24 Mo Brd $ 0.26 No Bid
Vendor preparation of surface prior to
sod install of any listed sod
(cut/remove vegetation & loosen soll)
for the follewing types: Floratam,
g Bzhia and Bermuda Per Sq. Ft. N/A N/A N/A N/A 5 0.18 No Bid
Mulch: Various Types - ALL CERTIFIED
10 |Mulch Red - Shredded  (See Specs) Per Bag 5 2.10 |8 1.58 S 2.59 1§ 1.68 No Bid S 28.00
Bulk Mulch Red -Shredded (See
11 |Specs) Per &Y $ 25.30 | § 16.00 S 2530 | $ 16.75 No Bid S 28.00
Mulch Red - Shredded (Blown-n) {See
12 [Specs) Per CY N/A - N/A N/A N/A No Bid $ 28.00
18 |Gold Mulch - Shredded {See Specs) Per Bag No Bid S 1.58 No Bid 5 1.68 No Bid S 28,00
Bulk Mulch Gold - Shredded (See
14 [Specs) Per O S 28.60 | $ 16.00 5 28.60 | S 16.75 No Bid S 28.00
Mulch Gold - Shredded (Blown-n)
15 [(see Spacs) Per CY N/A N/A NJA N/A No Bid 5 28.00
Per 2 CubicFt.
16 |Melaleuca 100% (cured) (See Specs) Bag. No Bid $ 148 No Bld § 1,58 No Bid S 27.00
Melaleuca 100% (cured) (Blown-n)
17 (See Specs) Per CY N/A N/A IN/A N/A No Bid S 27.00
Pine Bark Mulch Mini Nuggets (See |Per 2 CubicFt.
18 [Specs) Bag No Bid $ 2.30 Ne Bid $ 240 No Bid 3 42,00
Pine Bark Mulch Mini Nuggets (Blown-
19 [in) (See Specs) Per OY N/A N/A N/A N/A 5 42.00
Pine Straw & Ground Preparation
Certified Playground Woodchip Muldh
(Must meet ASTMF 1292-04 +F 1951)
20 |{See Specs) Per CY No Bid ] 2.30 No Bld S 2,40 N/A N/A
Certified Playground Waoodchip Mulech
(Blown-n} {Must meet ASTMF 1292-
21 |04 + F1951) {See Spacs) Per O N/A N/A N/A NfA No Bid $ 42.00
22 Pire Straw Mulch (See Specs) Per Bale No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid MNo Bid
22 |Pine Straw Muldh (See Specs) Per Truckloacd No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bld No Bid No Bid
Ryegrass sead- Royal Flush Blend-
1/3 Sonata PRG, 1/3 Jet PRG, 1/3
24 |shining Star PRG (P OA FREE} Per PD 5 1.95 No Bld $ 2.44 No Bld § 3.05 Ne Bld
Bermuda Triangle bucket- 3 types
25 |[blended PerPD |$ 16.16 No Bid s 20.20 No Bid 5 25.25 No Bid
26 |Princess 77 Bermudagrass seed Per PD $ 26.09 No Bid 5 32.61 No Bid E 40.76 No Bid
Clarifled Argentine Bahla Grass Seed
27 [(SeeSpecs) Per PD $ 6.08 No Bid $ 7.60 No Bid $ 9.50 No Bid




