
 

 

 

12300 Forest Hill Boulevard • Wellington, Florida 33414 • (561) 791-4000 • Fax (561) 791-4045 

wellingtonfl.gov 

June 27, 2025 

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD 

Pursuant to Wellington’s Purchasing Policies and Procedures, notice is provided as follows: 

INVITATION TO BID: ITB #202517 – Supply and Delivery of Road Base and Asphalt Millings opening Date and 

Time: May 22, 2025, at 11:00 AM (local time) 

1. Wellington has completed its evaluation of ITB #202517 and intends to recommend to Council the award of 

Supply and Delivery of Road Base and Asphalt Millings based on the attached bid tabulation.  

 

2. This Notice is conditioned upon and subject to Wellington’s reservation of rights as contained in the ITB 

documents and approval by the Wellington Council. 

 



SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ROAD BASE AND ASPHALT MILLINGS

PALM BEACH 
AGGREGATES, LLC

AUSTIN TUPLER 
TRUCKING INC.

D.S. EAKINS 
CONSTRUCTION 

CORP

JUD 
SOLUTION,LLC

GREEN DREAM 
INTERNATIONAL

,LLC

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Primary 
Vendor

Secondary 
Vendor Tertiary Vendor

11345 Supply and Delivery of Road Base 1.00 TN $24.55 $28.15 No Bid Non-Responsive/ 
No Samples

Non-Responsive/ 
No Samples

Palm Beach 
Aggregates,LLC

Austin Tupler 
Trucking,INC.

N/A

11346 Pick up Road Base with Wellington Vehicle 1.00 TN $18.00 No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid Palm Beach 
Aggregates,LLC

N/A N/A

12387 Type III DOT Road Base Delivered 1.00 TN $24.55 $30.15 No Bid $36.25 No Bid Palm Beach 
Aggregates,LLC

Austin Tupler 
Trucking,INC.

Jud Solution, LLC

11347 Supply and Delivery of #57 Rock 1.00 TN $41.60 $36.65 No Bid $51.25 $46.74
Austin Tupler 
Trucking,INC.

Palm Beach 
Aggregates,LLC Jud Solution, LLC

11348 Pick up of #57 Rock at Pit with Wellington Vehicle 1.00 TN $35.05 No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid Palm Beach 
Aggregates,LLC

N/A N/A

11843 Rip Rap 6' to 12' Boulder with Wellington Vehicle 1.00 TN $48.80 No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid Palm Beach 
Aggregates,LLC

N/A N/A

11349 Supply and Delivery of RCA ( Recycled Concrete 
Aggregate) - ( Or Equal Product) 1.00 TN No Bid $31.75 $26.50 $29.00 No Bid

D.S. Eakins 
Construction 

Corp
Jud Solution, LLC Austin Tupler 

Trucking,INC.

11350 Pick up of RCA  (Recycled Concrete Aggregate) - (Or 
Equal Product)at Pit with Wellington Vehicle 1.00 TN No Bid Non-Responsive $18.00 Non-Responsive No Bid

D.S. Eakins 
Construction 

Corp
N/A N/A

11844 Supply and Delivery of Asphalt Millings 1.00 CY No Bid $30.70 $32.00
Non-

Responsive/No 
Samples

No Bid Austin Tupler 
Trucking,INC.

D.S. Eakins 
Construction Corp N/A

11845 Pick up of Asphalt Millings with Wellington Vehicle 1.00 CY No Bid Non-Responsive $22.00 Non-Responsive No Bid
D.S. Eakins 
Construction 

Corp
N/A N/A

Legend: 
Green Highlight = Lowest responsive/responsible bidder 
Non-Responsive = Vendor failed to meet one or more mandatory requirements of the solicitation (e.g., missing required samples, bidding under the 25-mile radius category without meeting the distance requirement).
No Samples = Vendor did not submit required product samples as outlined in the solicitation.
No Bid = Vendor did not provide pricing for this specific item.
Primary Vendor:The vendor offering the lowest responsive and responsible bid for the line item. This vendor is designated as the first choice for award and will be used unless performance issues arise.
Secondary Vendor:The vendor offering the next-lowest responsive bid. This vendor serves as a backup and may be used if the primary vendor is unable to perform, fails to deliver, or becomes non-compliant.
Tertiary Vendor: The vendor with the third-lowest responsive bid, designated as an additional backup option if both the primary and secondary vendors are unavailable or unable to fulfill the requirement.

Vendor Award Types

BID TABULATION
BID NO: 202517

Bid Opening Date: May 22, 2025 at 11:00 AM Local Time


