

Council

Anne Gerwig, Mayor
John T. McGovern, Vice Mayor
Michael Drahos, Councilman
Michael J. Napoleone, Councilman
Tanya Siskind, Councilwoman

Manager
Jim Barnes

September 2, 2021

Mike Maggio
Howard Fertilizer and Chemical Co.
1107 Gateway Blvd
Boynton Beach, FL 33426
mmaggio@howardfert.com

RE: ITB#201918 Contract Renewal

Dear Mr. Maggio,

Howard Fertilizer and Chemical Co. is an awardee for contract # 201918 Purchase and Delivery for PW Chemicals. The contract is set to expire on December 9, 2021 and allows for three (3) additional one (1) year renewals by mutual agreement. Wellington would like to exercise the second renewal option through December 8, 2022 under the same terms and conditions as stipulated on Page 12 of the referenced ITB which is conditioned upon subsequent approval by Wellington Council.

Pursuant to sections 215.4725 and 287.135 of the Florida Statutes, by accepting this renewal, AWARDEE certifies that it, its affiliates, suppliers, subcontractors, and consultants who will perform or benefit hereunder, are not on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List and are not participating in a boycott of Israel. If this Agreement is valued greater than \$1 million, AWARDEE further certifies pursuant to sections 215.473 and 287.135, Florida Statutes, that it, its affiliates, suppliers, subcontractors, and consultants who will perform or benefit hereunder, (a) have not been placed on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List or the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List; and (b) do not have business operations in Cuba or Syria. Submitting a false certification shall be deemed a material breach of this Agreement. If the Village determines, using credible information available to the public, that AWARDEE has submitted a false certification, the Village may terminate this Agreement and pursue the remedies set forth in section 287.135, Florida Statutes, and any other available remedies.

The award/renewal is subject to provisions of State Statutes, Palm Beach County Commission on Ethics and Code of Ethics, and Wellington policies. All Awardees must disclose with their Renewal the name of any officer, director, or agent who is also a Wellington employee. Further, all Awardees must disclose the name of any Wellington employee who is employee in the Awardees firm or any of its branches.

If AWARDEE violates or is a party to a violation of the Wellington, Palm Beach County or Florida Code of Ethics with respect to this Renewal, AWARDEE may be disqualified from performing the work described in this Renewal or from furnishing the goods or services for which the AWARDEE submitted and shall be further disqualified from bidding on any future Proposals/Bids for work or for goods or services for Wellington. A

copy of the Wellington, Palm Beach County Commission on Ethics and Code of Ethics and State Ethics Codes is available at the Wellington Clerk's Office, 12300 Forest Hill Boulevard, Wellington, FL 33414. By signing this Renewal Agreement, AWARDDEE acknowledges no such conflict.

Compliance with F.S. 448.095 - Wellington requires all contractors and subcontractors to register with the U.S. Department of Homeland Security's E-Verify system to verify the work authorization status of their newly hired employees. All contractors performing work for Wellington are required to provide proof of registration with the E-Verify System and must provide an affidavit stating that each subcontractor it hires does not employ, contract with, or subcontract with an unauthorized alien.

AWARDEE shall not unlawfully discriminate against any person in its operation and activities or in its use or expenditure of funds in fulfilling its obligations under this Agreement. AWARDDEE shall affirmatively comply with all applicable provisions of the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) in the course of providing any services funded by this Agreement, including Titles I and II of the ADA (regarding nondiscrimination on the basis of disability), and all applicable regulations, guidelines, and standards. In addition, AWARDDEE shall take affirmative steps to ensure nondiscrimination in employment against disabled persons. Such actions shall include, but not be limited to, the following: employment, upgrading, demotion, transfer, recruitment or recruiting advertising, layoff, termination, rates of pay, other forms of compensation, terms and conditions of employment, training (including apprenticeship) and accessibility.

AWARDEE's decisions regarding the delivery of services under this Agreement shall be made without regard to or consideration of race, age, religion, color, gender, sexual orientation, gender identity, gender expression, national origin, marital status, physical or mental disability, political affiliation, or any other factor which cannot be lawfully used as a basis for service delivery.

Please indicate acceptance or rejection of the renewal and return to my attention by September 17, 2021.

If you should have any questions, please contact me or anyone else in the Purchasing Department.

with proposed price changes

Accept Renewal: Michael Maggio  9/14/2021
Printed Name/Title Signature Date

Reject Renewal: _____
Printed Name/Title Signature Date

Thank you,
Maria Miserendino
561-791-4154
mmiserendino@wellingtonfl.gov

Purchase & Delivery for Public Works Chemicals					
Bid Tabulation - ITB #201918					
REVISED SCHEDULE OF VALUES EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 9, 2020 THROUGH DECEMBER 8, 2021					
VENDORS					
			Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Non-Local	Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Non-Local	SiteOne Landscape Supply, LLC Non-Local
Item #	Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
1C	0-0-22 Kmag (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.25	\$ 0.25	\$ 0.34
2C	12-2-12 Liquid Fert (or equal)	gal	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.84
3C	15-0-12 Liquid Fert (or equal)	lb	\$ 7.12	No Bid	No Bid
4C	15-0-15 w/.67% Ronstar (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.53	No Bid	\$ 0.86
5C	15-0-15 w/merit (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.40	No Bid	\$ 0.43
6C	16-0-8 (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.24	\$ 0.25	\$ 0.24
7C	16-2-16 (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.34	No Bid	\$ 0.35
8C	16-2-16 with Methalated Urea (specific blend)	lb	\$ 0.34	No Bid	No Bid
9C	18-0-18 with Dimension (specific blend)	lb	\$ 0.56	No Bid	\$ 0.69
10C	18-3-6 Liquid Fert (or equal)	gal	\$ 7.17	\$ 13.00	\$ 13.00
11C	20-0-10 (or equal)	gal	\$ 0.33	No Bid	\$ 0.30
12C	21-0-0 (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.24	\$ 0.25	No Bid
13C	24-2-11 (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.31	No Bid	\$ 0.26
14C	30-0-0 Liquid Fert (no substitution)	gal	\$ 6.99	No Bid	\$ 9.58
15C	400 High Mn (no substitution)	gal	\$ 8.00	No Bid	No Bid
16C	8-2-12 (specific blend) *see bid page 16	lb	\$ 0.43	No Bid	\$ 0.54
17C	9-0-24 (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.33	No Bid	\$ 0.41
18C	Chelated Palm Micro Package (or equal)	gal	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.58
19C	Kelp Grow (or equal)	gal	\$ 38.00	\$ 100.00	No Bid
20C	Milorganite (no substitution)	lb	\$ 0.27	\$ 0.24	No Bid
21C	Minars Liquid Fert (no substitution)	gal	No Bid	\$ 12.00	No Bid
22C	Mirimichi Green Carboniz PN (or equal)	lb	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.42
23C	Nature Safe 10-2-8 (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.61	\$ 0.65	No Bid
24C	Soluble Potassim Nitrate (or equal)	lb	\$ 0.62	No Bid	No Bid
25C	Turf Nectar 15-0-0 w/6%Fe (or equal)	gal	\$ 5.79	\$ 7.50	\$ 8.14

Key	
Primary Awardee	Secondary Awardee
No Award Items	Agency Items

Adjusted to 2 decimal points per bid documents

0.42
9.25
0.62
0.49
0.32
0.41
0.41
0.62
9.56
0.40
0.29
0.37
9.00
9.07
0.50
0.42
45.00
0.32
0.65
0.69
7.30

Item #	Item Description	Unit of Measure	VENDORS		
			Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Non-Local	Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Non-Local	SiteOne Landscape Supply, LLC Non-Local
Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price			
	Herbicide				
1H	Atra 4 (no substitution)	gal	\$ 12.00	No Bid	No Bid
2H	Atra-5 (no substitution)	gal	\$ 16.80	No Bid	No Bid
3H	Barricade 4FL (no substitution)	gal	\$ 143.00	\$ 137.00	\$ 143.00
4H	Basagran (no substitution)	gal	\$ 69.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 72.00
5H	Celsius (no substitution)	10 oz	\$ 104.00	\$ 104.00	\$ 104.00
6H	Certainty (no substitution)	oz	\$ 55.36	\$ 68.00	\$ 59.20
7H	Cheeta Pro (no substitution)	gal	\$ 60.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.60
8H	Dimension (no substitution)	gal	\$ 215.50	\$ 215.50	\$ 215.20
9H	Dismiss (no substitution)	64 oz	\$ 460.00	\$ 578.00	\$ 615.00
10H	Dismiss NXT (no substitution)	oz	\$ 10.82	\$ 10.82	\$ 10.29
11H	Dismiss South (no substitution)	16 oz	\$ 119.00	\$ 151.00	\$ 172.00
12H	Drive XLR8 (no substitution)	oz	\$ 0.70	\$ 0.94	\$ 0.80
13H	Echelon 45C (no substitution)	gal	\$ 343.00	\$ 343.00	\$ 326.00
14H	Fusilade II (no substitution)	oz	\$ 2.08	\$ 2.19	\$ 2.27
15H	Garlon (no substitution)	gal	No Bid	\$ 58.00	No Bid
16H	Garlon 3A (no substitution)	gal	No Bid	\$ 58.00	\$ 75.20
17H	Garlon 4 (no substitution)	gal	\$ 95.96	\$ 80.00	No Bid
18H	Iloxan (no substitution)	gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19H	Manor (no substitution)	oz	\$ 8.00	No Bid	No Bid
20H	Manuscript (no substitution)	gal	\$636 a case	\$636 a case	\$159 a gal. = \$636 a case
21H	Monument 75WG (no substitution)	250 gram	\$ 225.00	\$ 225.00	\$250
22H	Primo (no substitution)	gal	\$ 274.00	\$ 290.00	\$ 290.00
23H	Princep (no substitution)	gal	\$ 19.70	\$ 20.00	\$ 22.32
24H	Prosege (no substitution)	oz	\$ 40.75	\$ 43.61	\$ 45.49
25H	Pylex (no substitution)	oz	\$ 66.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 66.00
26H	Quick Silver (no substitution)	oz	\$ 13.63	\$ 20.00	\$ 19.38

Primary Awardee	Secondary Awardee
No Award Items	Agency Items
Adjusted to 2 decimal points per bid documents.	

no bid
24.00
147.30
87.00
107.00
77.81

575.00 per 60z Agency 9.58333333 per oz

135.00
0.96
367.50

688 a case
231.25 per 25 grams
282.20

46.82
68.00
17.00

Item #	Item Description	Unit of Measure	VENDORS		
			Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Non-Local	Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Non-Local	SiteOne Landscape Supply, LLC Non-Local
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
27H	Ranger Pro (or equal)	gal	\$ 11.93	\$ 12.50	\$ 13.30
28H	Revolver (no substitution)	87oz	\$ 595.00	\$ 595.00	\$ 595.00
29H	Reward (no substitution)	2.5 gal	\$ 197.50	\$ 197.50	\$ 197.50
30H	Round Up Pro (no substitution)	gal	\$ 17.72	\$ 21.00	No Bid
31H	Sedge Hammer (no substitution)	oz	No Bid	\$ 43.61	\$ 39.10
32H	Segment II (no substitution)	gal	\$ 196.00	\$ 215.00	\$ 257.07
33H	Sencor 75DF (no substitution)	lb	\$ 125.00	\$ 79.20	\$ 81.00
34H	Solitare (no substitution)	lb	\$ 90.00	\$ 119.00	\$ 107.25
35H	Specticle (no substitution)	gal	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 1,671.25	\$ 1,700.00
36H	Stonewall (or equal)	lb	\$ 16.85	\$ 10.00	\$ 9.88
37H	Sure Guard (no substitution)	lb	\$ 8.74	\$550.96 a bottle/Sureguard SC, WDG gone	\$ 8.61
38H	Tenacity (no substitution)	gal	\$ 775.00	No Bid	\$ 775.00
39H	Tribute (no substitution)	6 oz	\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00
40H	TriMec Southern (no substitution)	gal	\$ 58.00	\$ 56.70	\$ 61.37
41H	Xonerate (no substitution)	oz	\$ 35.84	\$ 35.84	\$ 34.09
Insecticide					
1I	Arena 25G (no substitution)	lb	\$ 1.85	\$ 1.85	\$ 1.85
2I	Arena 50WDG (no substitution)	2.5 lb	\$ 239.10	\$ 239.10	\$ 597.75
3I	Dylox 5L420 (no substitution)	gal	\$ 70.20	\$ 72.45	\$ 78.00
4I	Essentria (no substitution)	gal	\$ 92.00	No Bid	No Bid
5I	Imdemnify (no substitution)	oz	\$ 99.42	\$ 99.41	\$ 99.42
6I	Meridian .33G (no substitution)	lb	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.20	\$ 2.23
7I	Meridian 25WG (no substitution)	102 oz	\$ 510.00	\$ 510.00	\$ 510.00
8I	Merit 75WP (or equal)	gal	\$3.20 per oz.	\$60 a gal.	No Bid
9I	Nimitz Pro (no substitution)	lb	No Bid	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00
10I	Orthene 75 (no substitution)	lb	\$13.27 per .773 lb bag	No Bid	No Bid

Primary Awardee	Secondary Awardee
No Award Items	Agency Items

Adjusted to 2 decimal points per bid documents.

16.80
626.30

25.00

no bid
85.00

117.00
1730.00

12.00

567.50 per 64oz Agency (Liquid)

798.25
372.60

62.00
38.9375 oz 467.25 Agency 12oz

1.90
386.25
79.76
105

525.30
52.84 per gallon

13.51 per .773 lb bag

Item #	Item Description	Unit of Measure	VENDORS		
			Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Non-Local	Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Non-Local	SiteOne Landscape Supply, LLC Non-Local
Item #	Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
11I	Provaunt (no substitution)	120 oz	\$ 852.00	\$ 852.00	\$ 852.00
12I	Safari (no substitution)	lb	\$ 111.10	\$ 111.10	\$ 111.10
13I	Sevin SL (no substitution)	gal	\$ 41.96	\$ 40.00	\$ 44.92
14I	Talstar (or equal)	gal	\$ 40.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 42.00
15I	Talstar PL (no substitution)	lb	\$ 0.79	\$ 0.90	\$ 0.87
16I	Talstar XTRA (no substitution)	lb	\$ 1.09	\$ 1.17	\$ 1.20
17I	Top Choice (no substitution)	lb	\$ 2.13	\$ 2.10	\$ 2.30
18I	TriStar (no substitution)	gal	\$ 515.00	\$ 515.00	\$ 515.00
19I	Upstar Gold (no substitution)	gal	\$ 47.86	\$ 45.00	No Bid
20I	Zenith 2F (no substitution)	gal	\$ 48.00	No Bid	\$ 52.12
Fungicides					
1F	Armada (no substitution)	lb	\$ 45.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 54.98
2F	BannerMaxx (no substitution)	gal	\$ 218.00	\$ 218.00	\$ 218.00
3F	Banol (no substitution)	2.5 gal	\$ 982.50	\$ 982.50	\$ 982.50
4F	Chipco 26 GT (no substitution)	gal	\$ 130.96	\$ 141.00	\$ 159.20
5F	Chipco Signature XTRA (no substitution)	lb	\$ 30.00	\$ 31.82	\$ 31.82
6F	Cleary's 26/36 FLO (no substitution)	gal	\$ 122.60	\$ 122.60	\$ 122.60
7F	Cleary's 3336 FLO (no substitution)	gal	\$ 93.00	\$ 86.00	No Bid
8F	Concert (no substitution)	2.5 gal	\$ 202.50	\$ 202.50	\$ 202.50
9F	Deconil Ultrax (no substitution)	lb	\$ 12.60	\$ 12.60	\$ 12.60
10F	Deconil Weather Sticker (no substitution)	2.5 gal	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00	\$ 64.00
11F	Eagle 20 EW (no substitution)	gal	\$ 139.00	\$ 158.00	\$ 140.00
12F	Fore 80WP Rainshield (no substitution)	lb	\$ 7.83	\$ 8.75	\$ 37.50
13F	Headway (no substitution)	gal	\$ 438.00	\$ 438.00	\$ 438.00
14F	Heritage TL (no substitution)	lb	\$ 530.00	\$530 a gal.	\$ 530.00
15F	Honor (no substitution)	3 lb	\$ 459.00	\$ 459.00	\$ 459.00
16F	Insignia SC (no substitution)	30.5 oz	\$ 449.88	\$ 449.88	\$ 449.88

Primary Awardee	Secondary Awardee
No Award Items	Agency Items

Adjusted to 2 decimal points per bid documents.

396.00 Agency new size 72oz

117.90
48.00

0.87
1.20
1.32
530.45

46.00
224.50
999.20
151.00
35.00
126.30

208.50
13.00
164.75 per 2.5gal agency

451.15
545.90
468.00
458.72

Item #	Item Description	Unit of Measure	VENDORS		
			Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Non-Local	Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Non-Local	SiteOne Landscape Supply, LLC Non-Local
Item #	Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
17F	Instrata (no substitution)	2.5 gal	\$ 405.00	\$ 405.00	\$ 405.00
18F	Medallion SC (no substitution)	gal	\$ 570.00	\$ 570.00	\$ 570.00
19F	Mirage Stressgard (no substitution)	gal	\$ 182.50	\$ 187.00	\$ 187.00
20F	Pagent (no substitution)	lb	\$ 89.55	\$ 94.30	\$ 89.55
21F	Prostar 70WG (no substitution)	lb	\$ 46.67	\$ 64.95	\$ 65.81
22F	Secure (no substitution)	2.5 gal	\$ 1,542.50	\$ 1,542.50	\$ 1,625.00
23F	Spectro 90 WDG (no substitution)	lb	\$ 11.60	\$ 14.77	\$ 16.44
24F	Subdue Maxx (no substitution)	gal	\$ 538.00	\$ 538.00	\$ 538.00
25F	Tartan (no substitution)	2.5 gal	\$ 850.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 850.00
26F	ZeroTol (no substitution)	gal	\$ 39.46	\$ 84.31	\$ 56.30
Wetting Agents					
1W	Cascade Plus (no substitution)	gal	\$ 99.68	No Bid	\$ 28.83
2W	Delux (w/ammonium sulphate) (no substitution)	gal	\$ 20.64	No Bid	No Bid
3W	Duplex (no substitution)	gal	\$ 38.35	No Bid	No Bid
4W	Eco Sand (no substitution)	lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5W	Envy Turf Pigment (no substitution)	gal	\$ 120.44	No Bid	No Bid
6W	Foam (or equal)	gal	\$ 44.00	No Bid	No Bid
7W	Gypsum (no substitution)	lb	\$ 0.23	No Bid	\$ 0.34
8W	Knockdown (defoamer) (no substitution)	oz	\$ 1.53	No Bid	No Bid
9W	Magnaplex (no substitution)	gal	\$ 46.74	No Bid	No Bid
10W	Magnus (no substitution)	gal	\$ 69.80	No Bid	No Bid
11W	Microyl (no substitution)	gal	\$ 40.28	No Bid	No Bid
12W	pHAcid (or equal)	gal	\$ 80.00	No Bid	\$ 38.61
13W	Surfactant 80/20 CN (no substitution)	gal	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid
14W	Triplo (no substitution)	gal	\$ 51.32	No Bid	No Bid
15W	Vivax (no substitution)	gal	\$ 70.57	No Bid	\$ 68.14
Specialties					
15	Marking Dust (White Chalk)	lb	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.15

Primary Awardee	Secondary Awardee
No Award Items	Agency Items

Adjusted to 2 decimal points per bid documents.

417.25
587.10
166.80
86.10
55.00
1588.75
13.00
554.15

100.32
39.41
124.72
55.00
0.32
48.47
80.75
44.26
16.00
57.66
78.25

			VENDORS		
			Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Non-Local	Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC Non-Local	SiteOne Landscape Supply, LLC Non-Local
Item #	Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
25	Turfacer MVP Red	lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
35	Turfacer Quickdry	lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Primary Awardee	Secondary Awardee
No Award Items	Agency Items
Adjusted to 2 decimal points per bid documents	