Supply and Delivery of Ready Mix Concrete and Concrete Products

"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers

"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers

BID OPENING DATE: September 8,2025

received timely as of the above receiving date and time.

received timely as of the above receiving date and time.

BID OPENING TIME: 11:00 AM (local time)

All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation,

All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation,

ITB #202520 if any, are hereby rejected as late" if any, are hereby rejected as late"
VENDOR Huurr Homes, LLC Maschmeyer Concrete Company of Florida

1. Bid submittal-If submitting a paper bid - (1) original and one (1) PDF (CD) Copy Electronic Paper Bid
2. Bid Cover Page YES YES
3.Bid Submittal Form YES YES
4.Schedule of Value YES YES

5. Questionnaire YES VES

6. Drug Free Workplace YES YES

7. Sworn Statement under Section 287.133(3) (a) YES YES

8. Certification Pursuant To Florida Statute § 215.4725 and 287.135 YES YES

9. Conflict of Interest Statement YES YES
10. Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES
11. Insurance Certificates YES YES
12. Copy of Appropriate Licenses YES N/A
13. E-Verify Memo of Understanding (MOU) YES YES
14 .No Coercion for Labor or Services Affidavit YES YES




Supply and Delivery of Ready Mix Concrete and Concrete Products
BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 8, 2025
BID OPENING TIME: 11:00 AM(local time)

ITB#202520
Huurr Homes, LLC Maschmeyer Concrete Co. of Florida
PRICE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE PER CUBIC YARD
Flowable Fill: Excavatable S 180.00 | $ 160.00
Flowable Fill: Non Excavatable S 202.00 | $ 163.00
Regular Mix 3000 psi S 208.00 | $ 163.00
Blend Mix 3000 psi S 260.00 | $ 165.00
3000 Ib. Blended Mix S 280.00 | $ 168.00
Pearock Mix 3000 psi (without Pump) $ 210.00 | $ 173.00
Pearock Mix 3000 psi (with Pump) $ 510.00 No-Bid
PRICE-RERPALLET-RICKUR PRICE-RERPALLET-RICKUR
Rip-Rap-Bags-Palet:Pickup- $ 970.00 No-Bid
Ready-MixBagsPallet:Piekup S 920.00 No-Bid
Top-MixPallets: Pickup $ 1,820.00 No-Bid
PRICE-PERPALLET DELIVERED PRICE-RPERPALLET DELIVERED
Rip-Rap-Bags-Pallet: Delivered $ 1,820.00 No-Bid
Ready-MixBagsPallet: Delivered $ 1,780.60 Neo-Bid
Top-Mix-PaHet:Delivered S 1,940-00 No-Bid
OTHER FEES/SURCHARGES:
Short Loads: $ per delivery Multiple Options: Multiple Options:
. - 1.0 - $600.00/load - 2.5cyd 1.0 - $300.00/load - 2.5cyd
will be charged for deliveries of
cubic yards or less 3.0 - $400.00/load - 4.5cyd 3.0 - $250.00/load - 4.5cyd
) 5.0 - $350.00/load - 6.5cyd 5.0 - $200.00/load - 6.5cyd
Split Loads: $ per delivery
will be charged when a delivery is split S 100.00 | $ 150.00
between two or more locations.
Waiting Time: An unloading time of
minutes per cubic yard will be 9 minutes 10 minutes
allowed per delivery without charge.
Thereafter, additional unloading time will
be charged at the rate of $ S 5.00($ 1.50
per minute.
Enviror?mental Fees: $ S 10,00 | $ 30.00
per delivery.
Fue'l Surcharge: $ per s 1000 | s 40,00
delivery.
Legend:

Primary Awarded Vendor (Blue): Maschmeyer Concrete Co. of Floridahe= The vendor offering the lowest responsive and responsible bid for the line item. This vendor is designated as the first choice for award and will be used unless performance issues arise.
Secondary Awarded Vendor (Orange): Huurr Homes, LLC =The vendor offering the next-lowest responsive bid. This vendor serves as a backup and may be used if the primary vendor is unable to perform, fails to deliver, or becomes non-compliant.
No Award (Gold): The Village will not award these items as part of this ITB;pallet-priced products (pickup and delivery)
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