
 

 

 

12300 Forest Hill Boulevard • Wellington, Florida 33414 • (561) 791-4000 • Fax (561) 791-4045 

wellingtonfl.gov 

September 26, 2025 

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD (REVISED) 

Pursuant to Wellington’s Purchasing Policies and Procedures, notice is provided as follows: 

INVITATION TO BID: ITB #202520 – Supply and Delivery of Ready Mix Concrete and Concrete Products opening 

Date and Time: September 8, 2025, at 11:00 AM (local time) 

1. Wellington has completed its evaluation of ITB #202520 and intends to recommend to Council the award of 

Supply and Delivery of Ready Mix Concrete and Concrete Products based on the attached bid tabulation.  

 

2. This Notice is conditioned upon and subject to Wellington’s reservation of rights as contained in the ITB 

documents and approval by the Wellington Council. 

 



Supply and Delivery of Ready Mix Concrete and Concrete Products
BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 8, 2025
BID OPENING TIME: 11:00 AM(local time)
ITB#202520

Huurr Homes, LLC Maschmeyer Concrete Co. of Florida

PRICE PER CUBIC YARD PRICE PER CUBIC YARD
Flowable Fill: Excavatable 180.00$                                                160.00$                                                           
Flowable Fill: Non Excavatable 202.00$                                                163.00$                                                           
Regular Mix 3000 psi 208.00$                                                163.00$                                                           
Blend Mix 3000 psi 260.00$                                                165.00$                                                           
3000 lb. Blended  Mix 280.00$                                                168.00$                                                           
Pearock Mix 3000 psi (without Pump) 210.00$                                                173.00$                                                           
Pearock Mix 3000 psi (with Pump) 510.00$                                                No Bid

PRICE PER PALLET PICKUP PRICE PER PALLET PICKUP
Rip Rap Bags Pallet: Pickup 970.00$                                                No Bid
Ready Mix Bags Pallet: Pickup 920.00$                                                No Bid
Top Mix Pallets: Pickup 1,820.00$                                            No Bid

PRICE PER PALLET DELIVERED PRICE PER PALLET DELIVERED
Rip Rap Bags Pallet: Delivered 1,820.00$                                            No Bid
Ready Mix Bags Pallet: Delivered 1,780.00$                                            No Bid
Top Mix Pallet: Delivered 1,940.00$                                            No Bid

OTHER FEES/SURCHARGES:
Multiple Options: Multiple Options:

1.0 - $600.00/load - 2.5cyd 1.0 - $300.00/load - 2.5cyd
3.0 - $400.00/load - 4.5cyd 3.0 - $250.00/load - 4.5cyd
5.0 - $350.00/load - 6.5cyd 5.0 - $200.00/load - 6.5cyd

Split Loads: $______________ per delivery 
will be charged when a delivery is split 
between two or more locations.

100.00$                                                150.00$                                                           

9 minutes 10 minutes

5.00$                                                    1.50$                                                                

Environmental Fees:  $_______________ 
per delivery. 

10.00$                                                  30.00$                                                              

Fuel Surcharge:     $ ______________ per 
delivery.

10.00$                                                  40.00$                                                              

Legend: 
Primary Awarded Vendor (Blue): Maschmeyer Concrete Co. of Floridahe= The vendor offering the lowest responsive and responsible bid for the line item. This vendor is designated as the first choice for award and will be used unless performance issues arise.
Secondary Awarded Vendor (Orange): Huurr Homes, LLC =The vendor offering the next-lowest responsive bid. This vendor serves as a backup and may be used if the primary vendor is unable to perform, fails to deliver, or becomes non-compliant.
No Award (Gold): The Village will not award these items as part of this ITB;pallet-priced products (pickup and delivery)

Short Loads: $______________ per delivery 
will be charged for deliveries of _______ 
cubic yards or less. 

Waiting Time: An unloading time of
_______ minutes per cubic yard will be
allowed per delivery without charge.
Thereafter, additional unloading time will
be charged at the rate of $____________
per minute. 


