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5/13/2025 through 5/13/2026

HOWARD FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL, LLC

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY, LLC

Low Bid

. Brand (Include Unit Price Price . Brand (Include . . Price .
ltem # Item Description Pack Size I\;Jenal;l?rfe Labaels f(or Equal AEE;?CZé:fe) Based on Total Price Change NTDV\r/iéJemt Labels f(or Equal AEiﬁcZé:fe) Bal;gét ;:IEZM Total Price Change NePV\rli(l:Jemt No Bid Alf::qcsy
Products) UoM Request Products) Request
Chemicals (No agricultural grade fertilizers will
be accepted) Key
12248 |0-0-22 Kmag (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.30 $15.00 $15.00|Thrive 0-0-22E $0.58 $29.00 $29.00
12249  |12-2-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5 GL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12250 |12-2-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12251 |15-0-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5GL LPI $27.26 $27.26 $27.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12252 |15-0-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $2,356.12| $2,356.12 $2,356.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID
GrowStar
Oxadiazon 1.0% |53883-180-
12253 [15-0-15 w/.67% Ronstar (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.60 $30.00 $30.00(15-0-15 82757 $0.74 $37.00 $37.00
12254 |15-0-15 w/merit (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.60 $30.00 $30.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12255 |16-0-8 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.30 $15.00 $15.00|LESCO 16-0-8 $0.33 $16.50 $16.50
12256 |16-2-16 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.38 $19.00 $19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12257 ]16-2-16 with Methalated Urea (specific blend) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.45 $22.50 $22.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LESCO Dimension
0.21% 18-0-18
12258 [18-0-18 with Dimension (specific blend) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.70 $35.00 $35.00(Mini 10404-87 $0.79 $39.50 $39.50
LESCO Green Flo
12259 |18-3-6 Liquid Fert (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5GL LPI $25.53 $25.53 $25.53(18-3-6 $33.20 $33.20 $33.20
Lesco Green Flo
18-3-6
12260 |18-3-6 Liquid Fert (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $2,176.72| $2,176.72 $2,176.72((275gal/TO) $3,331.25| $3,331.25 $3,331.25
12261 |20-0-10 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.39 $19.50 $19.50|LESCO 20-0-10 $0.38 $19.00 $19.00
LESCO 21-0-0
12262 |21-0-0 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.28 $14.00 $14.00|100%AS $0.36 $18.00 $18.00
12263 |24-2-11 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.36 $18.00 $18.00|LESCO 24-2-11 $0.43 $21.50 $21.50
12264  |30-0-0 Liquid Fert (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL LPI $27.83 $27.83 $27.83|LESCO 30-0-0 $28.54 $28.54 $28.54
12265 |30-0-0 Liquid Fert (no substitution) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $2,380.04| $2,380.04 $2,380.04|LESCO 30-0-0 $2,533.39| $2,533.39 $2,533.39
12266 [400 High Mn (no substitution) 2.5 GL 2.5GL LPI $23.23 $23.23 $23.23|LESCO $21.84 $21.84 $21.84
12267  |400 High Mn (no substitution) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $1,937.52| $1,937.52 $1,937.52|(275 GAL/TO) $2,038.36] $2,038.36 $2,038.36
LESCO Palm &
12268 [8-2-12 (specific blend) *see Specifications 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.57 $28.50 $28.50|Tropical 8/2/12 $0.71 $35.50 $35.50
12269 |9-0-24 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.46 $23.00 $23.00|LESCO 9-0-24 $0.42 $21.00 $21.00
12270 |Chelated Palm Micro Package (or equal) 25GL 25GL LPI $23.23 $23.23 $23.23 $21.25 $21.25 $21.25
12271 |Kelp Grow (or equal) 25GL 25GL LPI $96.83 $96.83 $96.83 $79.74 $79.74 $79.74
12272 |Kelp Grow (or equal) 30 GLDRUM | 30DM LPI $2,054.36] $2,054.36 $2,054.36((265 GAL/DM) $7,170.45| $7,170.45 $7,170.45
12273  |Milorganite (no substitution) 50 LB LB MILORGANITE $0.32 $16.00 $16.00 $0.31 $15.50 $15.50
LESCO T&O
12274  |Minors Liquid Fert (no substitution) 25GL 2.5GL NO BID NO BID NO BID Chelated Micro $24.25 $24.25 $24.25
12275 |Mirimichi Green Carboniz PN (or equal) 40 LB 40 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.03 $18.03 $18.03
GRIFFIN
12276 |Nature Safe 10-2-8 (or equal) 50 LB LB INDUSTRIES $0.70 $35.00 $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SQM Ultrasol K
12277 |Soluble Potassim Nitrate (or equal) 25 LB 25 LB YARA $31.25 $31.25 $31.25|Plus (50 Ib) $51.85 $51.85 $51.85
Ferromec Ac 15-0-
12278  |Turf Nectar 15-0-0 w/6%Fe (or equal) 25GL 25GL LPI $22.08 $22.08 $22.08|0 6Fe Sulfate $49.65 $49.65 $49.65
12279 |Turf Nectar 15-0-0 w/6%Fe (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $1,817.92( $1,817.92 $1,817.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12391 [20-0-12 (specific blend)**See Specifications** 50LB LB HOWARD $0.45 $22.50 $22.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Palm and Ornamental 8-0-12 *(Specific Blend)*see
12280 |Specifications 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.59 $29.50 $29.50 $0.66 $33.00 $33.00
Herbicide
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5/13/2025 through 5/13/2026

HOWARD FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL, LLC

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY, LLC

Low Bid

. Brand (Include Unit Price Price . Brand (Include . . Price .
ltem # Item Description Pack Size I\;Jenal;l?rfe Labaelg f(orCEquaI AEE;?CZé:fe) Based on Total Price Change NTDV\r/iéJemt Labels f(or Equal AEiﬁcZé:fe) Bal;gét cl)jr:IfJ(z)M Total Price Change NePV\rli(l:Jemt No Bid Alf::qcsy
Products) UOoM Request Products) Request
12281 |Atra 4 (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL DREXEL $53.00 $53.00 $53.00|Atrazine 4L 19713-11 $47.79 $47.79 $47.79
12282 |Atra-5 (no substitution) 25GL 2.5GL DREXEL $60.90 $60.90 $60.90 119713-80 $60.30 $60.30 $60.30
12283 |Barricade 4FL (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $166.50 $166.50 $166.50 100-1139 $166.50 $166.50 $166.50
12284 |Basagran (no substitution) 128 OZ (1 GL) GL BASF $63.75 $63.75 $63.75 7969-326 $58.08 $58.08 $58.08
12285 |Celsius (no substitution) 100z 10 0z ENVU $128.40 $128.40 2.18% $131.20 432-1507 $128.40 $128.40 2.18% $131.20
12286 |Certainty (no substitution) 1.250Z 1.250Z NUFARM $97.85 $97.85 $97.85 59639-226 $82.03 $82.03 $82.03
12287 |Cheeta Pro (no substitution) 30 GL 30 GL NUFARM $3,187.20| $3,187.20 $3,187.20 228-743 $2,105.00f $2,105.00 $2,105.00
12288 |Dimension (no substitution) 64 OZ 64 OZ CORTEVA $613.00 $613.00 $613.00 62719-542 $613.00 $613.00 $613.00
12289 [Dismiss (no substitution) 6 0Z 6 0Z FMC $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 279-3295 $240.00 $240.00 $240.00
12290 |Dismiss NXT (no substitution) 60 OZ 60 OZ FMC $590.00 $590.00 -14.44% $504.80 279-3383 $590.00 $590.00 -14.44% $504.80
12291 |Dismiss South (no substitution) 16 OZ 16 OZ FMC $193.02 $193.02 $193.02 279-3351 $200.20 $200.20 $200.20
12292  |Drive XLR8 (no substitution) 64 OZ 64 OZ BASF $53.05 $53.05 $53.05 7969-272 $56.30 $56.30 $56.30
12293 |Echelon 4SC (no substitution) 128 OZ (1 GL) GL FMC $405.00 $405.00 12.10%|  $454.00 279-3323 $435.00 $435.00 4.37% $454.00
12294 |Fusilade Il (no substitution) 1QT QT SYGENTA $85.47 $85.47 $85.47 100-1084 $90.44 $90.44 $90.44
LESCO Triclopyr 4
12295 |Garlon (no substitution) 2.5GL GL NO BID NO BID NO BID Ester 10404-119 $67.84 $169.60 $169.60
12296 |Garlon 3A (no substitution) 2.5GL GL CORTEVA $78.40 $196.00 $196.00 62719-37 $95.60 $239.00 $239.00
12297 |Garlon 4 (no substitution) 25GL GL CORTEVA $102.26 $255.65 $255.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12298 |Manor (no substitution) 207 20z NUFARM $38.36 $38.36 $38.36/(4 x 2 0z.) 228-373 $129.80 $129.80 $129.80
11424  [Manuscript (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $970.00 $970.00 $970.00 100-1626 $970.00 $970.00 $970.00
12390 [Monument 75WG (no substitution) 25 GRAM 25 GM SYGENTA $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 100-1134 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00
12456  |Monument 75WG (no substitution) 30 GRAM 30 GM SYGENTA $360.00 $360.00 $360.00 $360.00 $360.00 $360.00
12300 |Monument 75WG (no substitution) 250 GRAM | 250 GM SYGENTA $2,750.00|  $2,750.00 $2,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12301 [Primo (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $317.00 $317.00 $317.00 100-937 $317.00 $317.00 $317.00
10 GL MINI
12302 |Primo (no substitution) TOTE 10 GL SYGENTA $2,990.00|  $2,990.00 $2,990.00 $2,990.00[ $2,990.00 $2,990.00
12303 |Prosedge (no substitution) 1.330z 1.330z NUFARM $54.18 $54.18 $54.18 228-711 $61.75 $61.75 $61.75
12304 |Pylex (no substitution) 407 40Z BASF $368.00 $368.00 5.43% $388.00 7969-327 $368.00 $368.00 5.43% $388.00
12305 |Ranger Pro (or equal) 30 GL GL BAYER $16.27 $488.11 $488.11 524-517 $19.20 $48.00 $48.00
12306 |Revolver (no substitution) 320z 320z ENVU $758.00 $758.00 1.00% $765.60 432-1266 $758.00 $758.00 1.00% $765.60
12307 |Reward (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL SYGENTA $240.00 $240.00 $240.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12308 |Round Up Pro (no substitution) 30 GL 30 GL BAYER $628.63 $628.63 $628.63 524-529 $674.79 $674.79 $674.79
12310 [Sencor 75DF (no substitution) 5LB 5LB ENVU $125.37 $626.88 $626.88 432-1469 $745.77 $745.77 $745.77
12311 |Solitare (no substitution) 41LB 41B FMC $579.00 $579.00 3.01% $596.40 279-3355 $579.00 $579.00 3.01% $596.40
12312 [Specticle (no substitution) 1GL GL ENVU $2,072.00] $2,072.00 1.00%| $2,092.80 432-1608 $2,072.00] $2,072.00 1.00%| $2,092.80
12313  |Sure Guard (no substitution) 16 OZ(1 LB) LB NUFARM $584.50 $584.50 $584.50((4 x 16 0z) 71368-114 $685.80 $685.80 $685.80
12314 |Tribute (no substitution) 6 OZ 6 0Z ENVU $413.60 $413.60 3.09% $426.40 432-1519 $413.60 $413.60 3.09% $426.40
12315 |TriMec Southern (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PBI GORDON $214.29 $214.29 $214.29 2217-655 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00
12316 |Xonerate (no substitution) 120z 12 0z FMC $483.00 $483.00 $483.00 378-3621 $533.00 $533.00 $533.00
Insecticide
12317 |Arena .25G (no substitution) 30LB 30LB NUFARM $69.00 $69.90 $69.90 59639-157 $69.00 $69.00 $69.00
12318 |Arena 50WDG (no substitution) 25LB 25LB NUFARM $421.75 $421.75 $421.75|Arena S .E. 59639-152 $421.75 $421.75 $421.75
12319 |Dylox SL420 (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL ENVU $236.76 $236.76 $236.76 5481-643-432 $254.80 $254.80 $254.80
12320 |Essentria (no substitution) 1GL GL ZOECON $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 $101.44 $101.44 $101.44
12321  |Imdemnify (no substitution) 17.1 0z 17.10Z ENVU $1,963.60| $1,963.60 $1,963.60 432-1543 $1,963.60[ $1,963.60 $1,963.60
Iltemis a Itemisa Itemisa
Meridian 0.33G Substitue Substitute Substitute
12323 |Meridian 25WG (no substitution) 102 0z 102 0z SYGENTA $581.40 $581.40 $581.40|(40 Ib) 100-961 $107.14 107.14 107.14
86203-11-
12327 |Safari (no substitution) 3LB 3LB NUFARM $397.20 $397.20 $397.20 59639 $397.20 $397.20 $397.20
LESCO Crosscheck [279-3206-
12329 |Talstar (or equal) 1GL GL NUFARM $42.25 $42.25 $42.25|Plus 10404 $37.11 $37.11 $37.11
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HOWARD FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL, LLC

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY, LLC

Low Bid
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Brand (Include
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. . Unit Of EPA # (If . New Unit EPA # (If Unit Price . New Unit . Agency
ltem # Item Description Pack Size Measure Labperlzsﬁrcz?ual Applicaéle) Bajg'jvlon Total Price FE:(?SS:I Price Labsrlzszrcti?ual Applicatgle) Based on UOM Total Price Ff:i:f; Price No Bid lterns
12330 |Talstar XTRA (no substitution) 25LB 25LB FMC $32.24 $32.24 $32.24 279-9552 $36.75 $36.75 $36.75
12331 [Top Choice (no substitution) 50 LB 50 LB ENVU $98.58 $98.58 $98.58 432-1217 $75.30 $75.30 $75.30

8033-106-
12332 |TriStar (no substitution) 1GL GL NUFARM $568.15 $568.15 $568.15 1001 $568.15 $568.15 $568.15
Fungicides
12333 |Armada (no substitution) 21LB 2LB ENVU $129.48 $129.48 $129.48 432-1513 $127.01 $127.01 $127.01
12334 |BannerMaxx (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $255.00 $255.00 $255.00 100-1326 $255.00 $255.00 $255.00
12335 |Banol (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL ENVU $1,254.00| $1,254.00 $1,254.00 432-942 $1,254.00[ $1,254.00 $1,254.00
12340 |Concert (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL SYGENTA $267.50 $267.50 $267.50 100-1347 $267.50 $267.50 $267.50
12342 |Daconil Weather Sticker (no substitution) 25GL 2.5GL SYGENTA $265.00 $265.00 $265.00 100-1695 $210.00 $210.00 $210.00
12343 |Fore 80WP Rainshield (no substitution) 6LB 6LB NO BID NO BID NO BID 62719-388 $92.62 $92.62 $92.62
12344 |Headway (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $536.00 $536.00 $536.00 100-1216 $536.00 $536.00 $536.00
12345 |Heritage TL (no substitution) 1LB LB SYGENTA $602.00 $602.00 $602.00 100-1191 $602.00 $602.00 $602.00
12346 |Honor (no substitution) 3LB 3LB BASF $192.00 $576.00 2.08% $588.00 7969-255 $576.00 $576.00 2.08% $588.00
12347  |Insignia SC (no substitution) 30.507 30.50Z BASF $564.25 $564.25 2.05% $575.84 7969-290 $564.25 $564.25 2.05% $575.84
12348 |Medallion SC (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $685.00 $685.00 $685.00 100-1448 $685.00 $685.00 $685.00
12350 |Pagent (no substitution) 3LB 3LB BASF $113.00 $113.00 1.77% $115.00 7969-251 $113.00 $113.00 1.77% $115.00
12351 |Prostar 70WG (no substitution) 3LB 3LB NO BID NO BID NO BID 432-1477 $176.56 $176.56 $176.56
12354 [Subdue Maxx (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $611.00 $611.00 $611.00 100-796 $611.00 $611.00 $611.00
12355 |[Tartan (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL ENVU $1,033.00] $1,033.00 $1,033.00 432-1446 $1,033.00] $1,033.00 $1,033.00
Wetting Agents
12356 [Cascade Plus (no substitution) 2.5 GL 2.5GL PRECISION $261.25 $261.25 $261.25 $452.88 $452.88 $452.88
Delux (w/ammonium sulphate) (no
12357 |substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PRECISION $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12358 |Duplex (no substitution) 25GL 25GL PRECISION $830.00 $830.00 $830.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12359 |Envy Turf Pigment (no substitution) 1GL GL PRECISION $134.50 $134.50 $134.50 $72.59 $72.59 $72.59
12361 |Gypsum (no substitution) 50 LB LB OLDCASTLE $0.25 $12.35 $12.35 $12.45 $12.45 $12.45
LESCO Recede (2 x
12362 |Knockdown (defoamer) (no substitution) 16 Oz 16 OZ PRECISION $24.00 $24.00 $24.00|16 oz.) $16.30 $16.30 $16.30
12363 |Magnaplex (no substitution) 25GL 25GL PRECISION $142.50 $142.50 $142.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12364 |Magnaplex (no substitution) 20 GLDRUM | 20DM PRECISION $1,060.00| $1,060.00 $1,060.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12365 |Magnus (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PRECISION $231.25 $231.25 $231.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12366 |Microyl (no substitution) 1GL GL PRECISION $108.75 $108.75 $108.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12367 |pHAcid (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5GL NUMERATOR $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12368 |Surfactant 80/20 CN (no substitution) 25GL 2.5GL DREXEL $47.62 $47.62 $47.62 $26.25 $26.25 $26.25
12370 |Vivax (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PRECISION $206.25 $206.25 $206.25 $140.30 $140.30 $140.30
Specialties
12371  |Marking Dust (White Chalk) 1LB LB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12372  |Turface Quickdry 1LB LB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




