
Annual Public Works Contract "Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above receiving date and time.

BID OPENING DATE: December 11, 2025 All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late"

BID OPENING TIME: 11:00 AM (local time)

ITB #003-26/MM
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D.S. Eakins 

Construction 
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Construction 
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Foster Maraine 
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Marcinkoski 

Gradall, Inc.

YES

YES

YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES

YES

YES YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES YES

YES

2. Bid Cover Page

1. Bid submittal-one (1) original and one (1) PDF (CD) Copy YES

YES

YES3. Acknowledgement of Addendums (1 & 2)

10. Conflict of Interest Statement

5. Schedule of Value

8. Sworn Statement under Section 287.133(3) (a)

4. Bid Submittal Form

7. Drug Free Workplace

9. Certification Pursuant To Florida Statute § 215.4725 and § 287.135

6.  Questionnaire

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

15. No Coercion for Labor or Services Affidavit

16. Foreign Countries of Concern Affidavit

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

13. Copy of Appropriate Licenses

14. E-Verify Memorandum of Understanding (MOU)

YES

YES

YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES

12. Insurance Certificates

11. Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES



MUNIS  

# Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total

10695 Long Boom Trac Backhoe (min 50' reach) 1 HR  $      250.00  $         250.00 $352.85 $352.85 199.50$       $199.50 $216.00 $216.00 225.00$       $225.00 NO BID NO BID $375.00 $375.00 NO BID NO BID

10696 Long Boom Rubber tired hoe (min 50' R) 1 HR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 171.50$       $171.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $360.00 $360.00 NO BID NO BID

10697 Track Backhoe (1 1/2 cy min) 1 HR  $      150.00  $         150.00 $286.45 $286.45 130.50$       $130.50 $216.00 $216.00 155.00$       $155.00 $215.00 $215.00 $250.00 $250.00 NO BID NO BID

10698 Track Backhoe (3/4 yd max - small) 1 HR  $      125.00  $         125.00 $244.35 $244.35 156.50$       $156.50 $139.00 $139.00 110.00$       $110.00 $185.00 $185.00 $196.00 $196.00 NO BID NO BID

10699 Rubber tired Backhoe/loader 1 HR NO BID NO BID $286.45 $286.45 92.00$          $92.00 $107.00 $107.00 85.00$          $85.00 $135.00 $135.00 $175.00 $175.00 NO BID NO BID

10700 Gradall ( rubber tired) 1 HR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 112.00$       $112.00 $300.00 $300.00 165.00$       $165.00 NO BID NO BID $225.00 $225.00 $125.00 $125.00

10701 Small Track hoe - 6 way bucket 1 HR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 108.00$       $108.00 $139.00 $139.00 175.00$       $175.00 NO BID NO BID $214.00 $214.00 NO BID NO BID

10702 Dump Truck - Tri-Axle (18 cy) 1 HR  $      100.00  $         100.00  $     199.55 $199.55 164.25$       $164.25 $130.00 $130.00 135.00$       $135.00 $125.00 $125.00 $128.00 $128.00 $119.00 $119.00

10703 Dump Truck - Tandem ( 16 cy) 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     185.15 $185.15 159.50$       $159.50 $130.00 $130.00 125.00$       $125.00 $125.00 $125.00 $124.00 $124.00 $110.00 $110.00

10704 Dump Truck - Single Axle (8-10 cy) 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     173.35 $173.35 88.75$          $88.75 $130.00 $130.00 95.00$          $95.00 NO BID NO BID $116.00 $116.00 $110.00 $110.00

10705 Off Road Dump Truck (30 cy min) 1 HR  $      165.00  $         165.00  $     278.95 $278.95 138.75$       $138.75 $281.00 $281.00 225.00$       $225.00 $280.00 $280.00 $275.00 $275.00 NO BID NO BID

10706 Off Road Dump Truck (20 cy min) 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     220.50 $220.50 123.00$       $123.00 $197.00 $197.00 200.00$       $200.00 $280.00 $280.00 $250.00 $250.00 NO BID NO BID

10707 Skid steer Loader (Bobcat type) 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     156.50 $156.50 111.00$       $111.00 $90.00 $90.00 65.00$          $65.00 $175.00 $175.00 $122.00 $122.00 $125.00 $125.00

10708 Front end Loader (min 2.5 cy) 1 HR  $      125.00  $         125.00  $     176.70 $176.70 154.00$       $154.00 $198.00 $198.00 125.00$       $125.00 $215.00 $215.00 $180.00 $180.00 $140.00 $140.00

10709 Skid Steer Loader Track propelled 1 HR  $      100.00  $         100.00  $     167.95 $167.95 95.25$          $95.25 $90.00 $90.00 85.00$          $85.00 $185.00 $185.00 $124.00 $124.00 $140.00 $140.00

10710 Crane (25) Ton 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     255.50 $255.50 92.50$          $92.50 NO BID NO BID 175.00$       $175.00 NO BID NO BID $300.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID

10711 Crane (50) Ton 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     381.95 $381.95 148.25$       $148.25 NO BID NO BID 450.00$       $450.00 NO BID NO BID $400.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID

10712 Bulldozer (D-4 equivalent) 1 HR  $      175.00  $         175.00  $     200.55 $200.55 185.00$       $185.00 $223.00 $223.00 150.00$       $150.00 $180.00 $180.00 $232.00 $232.00 NO BID NO BID

10713 Grader  (9H equivalent) 1 HR  $      200.00  $         200.00  $     270.15 $270.15 245.50$       $245.50 $138.00 $138.00 180.00$       $180.00 NO BID NO BID $260.00 $260.00 NO BID NO BID

10714 Box Tractor 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     149.30 $149.30 110.00$       $110.00 $83.00 $83.00 NO BID NO BID $140.00 $140.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00 $120.00

10715 Trencher (walk behind) 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     154.30 $154.30 146.25$       $146.25 $66.00 $66.00 85.00$          $85.00 NO BID NO BID $136.00 $136.00 NO BID NO BID

10716 Trencher (mid-range - drivable) 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     227.55 $227.55 153.50$       $153.50 $83.00 $83.00 120.00$       $120.00 NO BID NO BID $166.00 $166.00 NO BID NO BID

10717 Vibratory Roller (10 ton min.) 1 HR  $        85.00  $           85.00  $     201.35 $201.35 210.00$       $210.00 $99.00 $99.00 80.00$          $80.00 $140.00 $140.00 $140.00 $140.00 $110.00 $110.00

10718 3" Pump w/hoses (Mud hog or trash) 1 HR  $        40.00  $           40.00  $        65.10 $65.10 328.50$       $328.50 $29.00 $29.00 35.00$          $35.00 $50.00 $50.00 $26.00 $26.00 $19.00 $19.00

10719 Laser grading (finish grading) 500 SY  $          5.00  $      2,500.00  $          2.25 $1,125.00 77.50$          $38,750.00 $3.00 $1,500.00 5.00$            $2,500.00 NO BID NO BID $14.00 $7,000.00 NO BID NO BID

10720 Furnish & install nautral stone Rip-Rap DOT Approved 10 TN
 $      250.00  $      2,500.00 $185.25 $1,852.50 128.50$       $1,285.00 $244.00 $2,440.00 165.00$       $1,650.00 NO BID NO BID $350.00 $3,500.00 NO BID NO BID

10721 Skilled Laborer  1 HR  $        75.00  $           75.00  $        96.40 $96.40 65.00$          $65.00 $37.00 $37.00 65.00$          $65.00 $130.00 $130.00 $54.00 $54.00 $41.00 $41.00

10722 Supervisor 1 HR  $      120.00  $         120.00  $     161.20 $161.20 110.00$       $110.00 $94.00 $94.00 95.00$          $95.00 $160.00 $160.00 $150.00 $150.00 $65.00 $65.00

10723 Dewatering System (well points)  1 HR  $        60.00  $           60.00  $     166.25 $166.25 100.00$       $100.00 $61.00 $61.00 120.00$       $120.00 $130.00 $130.00 $125.00 $125.00 NO BID NO BID

10724 6" Submersible Hydraulic Pump  1 HR  $        50.00  $           50.00  $     107.40 $107.40 78.00$          $78.00 $38.00 $38.00 65.00$          $65.00 $100.00 $100.00 $90.00 $90.00 NO BID NO BID

10725 8" Submersible Hydraulic Pump  1 HR  $        60.00  $           60.00  $     174.15 $174.15 88.00$          $88.00 $39.00 $39.00 85.00$          $85.00 $120.00 $120.00 $100.00 $100.00 NO BID NO BID

10726 3 Person Crew w/pickup truck & foreman  1 HR  $      250.00  $         250.00  $     336.05 $336.05 110.00$       $110.00 $204.00 $204.00 185.00$       $185.00 $480.00 $480.00 $300.00 $300.00 $200.00 $200.00

10727 5 Person Crew w/pickup truck & foreman  1 HR  $      350.00  $         350.00  $     471.55 $471.55 140.00$       $140.00 $278.00 $278.00 295.00$       $295.00 $740.00 $740.00 $400.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID

10728 Sand Blasting - Prime and/or painting to be included  1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 195.00$       $195.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $125.00 NO BID NO BID

10729 Furnish, place & compact clean fill (12" liFTs) 500 SY  $        15.00  $      7,500.00  $        32.55 $16,275.00 14.50$          $7,250.00 $12.00 $6,000.00 15.00$          $7,500.00 NO BID NO BID $24.00 $12,000.00 NO BID NO BID

10730 Pipe installation crew (2" to 6" diameter PVC)  1 HR  $      400.00  $         400.00  $     562.60 $562.60 455.00$       $455.00 $518.00 $518.00 550.00$       $550.00 $1,170.00 $1,170.00 $500.00 $500.00 NO BID NO BID

10731 Pipe installation crew (8" to 12" diameter PVC)  1 HR  $      400.00  $         400.00  $     562.50 $562.50 480.00$       $480.00 $595.00 $595.00 650.00$       $650.00 $1,170.00 $1,170.00 $540.00 $540.00 NO BID NO BID

10732 Pipe installation crew (15" to 30" diameter RCP)  1 HR  $      400.00  $         400.00  $     711.30 $711.30 525.00$       $525.00 $595.00 $595.00 650.00$       $650.00 $1,170.00 $1,170.00 $575.00 $575.00 NO BID NO BID

10733 Pipe installation crew (36" to 60" diameter RCP)  1 HR  $      450.00  $         450.00  $     767.20 $767.20 610.00$       $610.00 $595.00 $595.00 850.00$       $850.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $600.00 $600.00 NO BID NO BID

10734
Pipe installation crew (15" to 30" diameter drainage pipe) 

Hdpe, aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated
 1 HR  $      400.00  $         400.00  $     619.40 $619.40 515.00$       $515.00 $595.00 $595.00 550.00$       $550.00 $1,170.00 $1,170.00 $575.00 $575.00 NO BID NO BID

10735
Pipe installation crew (36" - 60" diameter drainage pipe) 

Hdpe, aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated
 1 HR  $      450.00  $         450.00  $     719.25 $719.25 605.00$       $605.00 $595.00 $595.00 650.00$       $650.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $600.00 $600.00 NO BID NO BID

10736
Pipe installation crew (72” to 96” diameter drainage pipe) 

Hdpe, aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated,
1 HR  $      500.00  $         500.00  $     835.95 $835.95 695.00$       $695.00 $650.00 $650.00 850.00$       $850.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $650.00 $650.00 NO BID NO BID
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10737
Directional Bore 2' diameter pipe-including all material, 

equipment, labor , etc. to complete
1 FT  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 130.00$       $130.00 $48.00 $48.00 48.00$          $48.00 NO BID NO BID $56.00 $56.00 NO BID NO BID

10738
Directional Bore 4" diameter pipe-including all material, 

equipment, labor , etc. to complete
1 FT  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 140.00$       $140.00 $69.00 $69.00 65.00$          $65.00 NO BID NO BID $84.00 $84.00 NO BID NO BID

10739
Directional Bore 6" diameter pipe-including all material, 

equipment, labor , etc. to complete
1 FT  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 150.00$       $150.00 $90.00 $90.00 85.00$          $85.00 NO BID NO BID $100.00 $100.00 NO BID NO BID

10740
Directional Bore 8" diameter pipe-including all material, 

equipment, labor , etc. to complete
1 FT

 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 160.00$       $160.00 $108.00 $108.00 95.00$          $95.00 NO BID NO BID $160.00 $160.00 NO BID NO BID

10741
Directional Bore 10" diameter pipe-including all material, 

equipment, labor , etc. to complete
1 FT  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 170.00$       $170.00 $132.00 $132.00 110.00$       $110.00 NO BID NO BID $180.00 $180.00 NO BID NO BID

11602
Directional Bore 12" diameter pipe-including all material, 

equipment, labor , etc. to complete
1 FT  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 180.00$       $180.00 $174.00 $174.00 135.00$       $135.00 NO BID NO BID $225.00 $225.00 NO BID NO BID

11603 Diver with external air source 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID 225.00$       $225.00 NO BID NO BID 350.00$       $350.00 NO BID NO BID $175.00 $175.00 NO BID NO BID

11604 Welding (portable) with complete supplies 1 HR  $      180.00  $         180.00  NO BID NO BID 75.00$          $75.00 $168.00 $168.00 125.00$       $125.00 NO BID NO BID $160.00 $160.00 NO BID NO BID

11605 Welding Shop 1 HR  $      130.00  $         130.00  NO BID NO BID 65.00$          $65.00 $240.00 $240.00 95.00$          $95.00 NO BID NO BID $136.00 $136.00 NO BID NO BID

11606 Boom Truck with 25 FT. reach 1 HR  NO BID  NO BID  $     229.45 $229.45 76.50$          $76.50 NO BID NO BID 125.00$       $125.00 NO BID NO BID $186.00 $186.00 NO BID NO BID

11607 Lowboy capable of hauling heavy equipment 1 HR  $      200.00  $         200.00  $     245.90 $245.90 175.00$       $175.00 $248.00 $248.00 185.00$       $185.00 NO BID NO BID $214.00 $214.00 NO BID NO BID


