Note: Please submit your bid in this order for electronic and paper bids.
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NO___
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NO___

1. Bid submittal - If submitting a paper bid - one (1) original and one (1) PDF (CD) copy or flash drive

2. Bid Cover Page

3. Acknowledgment of addendums (if any)

4. Bid Submittal Form

5. Schedule of Value

6. Questionnaire

7. Drug Free Workplace

8. Sworn Statement under Section 287.133(3) (a)

9. Certification Pursuant To Florida Statute § 215.4725 and § 287.135

10. Conflict of Interest

11. Non-Collusion Affidavit

12. Insurance Certificates

13. Copy of Appropriate Licenses

14. E-Verify Memorandum of Understanding (MOU)

15. No Coercion for Labor or Services Affidavit

16. Foreign Countries of Concern Affidavit
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W THE VILLAGE OF
L L I N T N A GREAT HOMETOWN

Manager
Jim Barnes

Councii

Michael J. Napolcone, Mayor
Tanya Siskind, Vice Mayor

John T. McGovern, Councilman
Maria Antufa, Councilwoman
Amanda Silvestri, Councilwoman

ITB No. 003-26/MM

Title: Annual Public Works Contract

Revised New Bid Opening: December 11, 2025 at 11:00 am Local Time
Addendum Date: November 19, 2025

ADDENDUM NO. ONE

PURPOSE: The purpose of this Addendum/NOTICE is to make changes, additions, deletions, revisions, and clarifications
to the Invitation to bid {ITB) documents for the Annual Public Works Contract. Bidders shall review the Addendum

requirements in detail.

1. The Bid Opening Date has changed from December 2, 2025 to December 11, 2025 at 11:00 am Local Time.
All Bids must be received, no later than December 11, 2025 at 11:00 am Local Time, at which time all Bids will
be publicly opened and read via Zoom (Meeting ID: 831 4116 5363Passcode: v=4Dhd)

2. Question: What are the liquidated damages?
Response: The SPECIAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS section has been revised to reflect this information and is
attached to this addendum. The changes to this section are noted in red. Please refer to this section and attach
the signed addendum/revised section to the front of your submitted bid.

3. Question: Is a bid bond required? If so, what is the percentage?
Response: A bid bond is not required with the bid submittal. A Public Construction Bond shall be required for
each project over $200,000, guaranteeing to the Owner the completion and performance of the project
covered in this Contract, as well as full payment of all suppliers, material, laborers, or Subcontractors employed
pursuant to this Project. The bond shall be furnished prior to issuance of the Purchase Order for the project

and shall remain in effect until the project is complete

4. Question: What are the engineers estimate or anticipated estimated annual funding
Response: The Public Works Department anticipates using this project Village-wide for approximately the
amount of $895,000 annually.

5. Question: Is there a pre bid meeting? If so, is it optional or mandatory?

Response: There was not a pre-bid scheduled for this solicitation.

ST -~ ~'-owledge receipt of any and all Addenda. Failure to do so may result in
wroposal documents remain unchanged except as cited herein.

t of
it of ITB

12300 Forest Hill Boulevard = Wellington, Florida 33414 « (561) 791-4000 « Fax (561} 791-4045
wellingtonfl.gov



> THE VILLAGE OF

E L L I NG TO N A GREAT HOMETOWN

Manager
Jim Barnes

Council

Michael J. Napolcone, Mayor
Tanya Siskind, Vice Mayor

John T. McGovern, Councilman
Maria Antufia, Councilwoman
Amanda Silvestri, Councilwoman

ITB No. 003-26/MM

Title: Annual Public Works Contract

New Bid Opening: December 11, 2025 at 11:00 am Local Time
Addendum Date: December 1, 2025

ADDENDUM NO. TWO

PURPOSE: The purpose of this Addendum/NOTICE is to make changes, additions, deletions, revisions, and clarifications
to the Invitation to bid (ITB) documents for the Annual Public Works Contract. Bidders shall review the Addendum

requirements in detail.

1. Question: Can you clarify whether failure not to bid on all individual line items will result in a
disqualification?
Response: No, bidders, may bid on any or all individual line items as outlined in the Schedule of Values in which
they are licensed and qualified. Bidder should follow the Schedule of Values instructions which states that if
any bid submittal does not contain prices set opposite each of the items for which there is blank space will
then be cause for rejection. Any items not bid upon shall be indicated “NO BID” in place of the price.

rledge receipt of any and all Addenda. Failure to do so may result in
posal documents remain unchanged except as cited herein.

»f ITB

12300 Forest Hill Boulevard » Wellington, Florida 33414 « (561) 791-4000 « Fax {561) 791-4045
wellingtonfl.gov



To:
Village of Wellington
12300 Forest Hill Blvd.

Wellington, Florida 33414

(Vendor)

agrees to provide material and services for the Annual Public Works Contract in accordance with the requirements and specifications
of the Bid Documents for the Village of Wellington as specified.

Gentlemen:

The undersigned Bidder has carefully examined the Specification requirements, Bid/Contract Documents and is familiar with the
nature and extent of the Work and any local conditions that may in any manner affect the Work to be done.

The undersigned agrees to provide the service called for by the Specifications and Bid Documents, in the manner prescribed therein
and to the standards of quality and performance established by the Wellington for the Bid price stated in the spaces herein provided.

The undersigned agrees to the right of the Wellington to hold all Bids and Bid guarantees for a period not to exceed one hundred and
twenty (120) days after the date of Bid opening stated in the Invitation to Bid.

The undersiened accents the invoicing and payment policies specified in the Bid.

(Month) (Year)
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ITEM # DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT UNIT PRICE
1 Long Boom Trac Backhoe (min 50’ reach) 1 HR S 352.85
2 Long Boom Rubber tired hoe (min 50' R) 1 HR NO BID
3 Track Backhoe (1 1/2 cy min) 1 HR S 286.45
4 Track Backhoe (3/4 yd max - smali) 1 HR S 244.35
5 Rubber tired Backhoe/loader 1 HR S 286.45
6 Gradall ( rubber tired) 1 HR NO BID
7 Small Track hoe - 6 way bucket 1 HR NO BID
8 Dump Truck - Tri-Axle (18 cy) 1 HR S 199.55
9 Dump Truck - Tandem ( 16 cy) 1 HR S 185.15
10 Dump Truck - Single Axle (8-10 cy) 1 HR S 173.35
11 Off Road Dump Truck (30 cy min) 1 HR S 278.95
12 Off Road Dump Truck (20 cy min) 1 HR S 220.50
13 Skid steer Loader (Bobcat type) 1 HR S 156.50
14 Front end Loader (min 2.5 cy) 1 HR S 176.70
15 Skid Steer Loader Track propelled 1 HR S 167.95
16 Crane (25) Ton 1 HR S 255.50
17 Crane (50) Ton 1 HR S 381.95
18 Bulldozer (D-4 equivalent) 1 HR S 200.55
19 Grader (9H equivalent) 1 HR S 270.15
20 Box Tractor 1 HR S 149.30
21 Trencher (walk behind) 1 HR S 154.30
22 Trencher (mid-range - drivable) 1 HR S 227.55
23 Vibratory Roller (10 ton min.) 1 HR S 201.35
24 3" Pump w/hoses (Mud hog or trash) 1 HR S 65.10
25 Laser grading (finish grading) 500 SY S 2.25
26 Furnish & install nautral stone Rip-Rap DOT Aopproved 10 TN S 185.25
27 Skilled Laborer 1 HR S 96.40
28 Supervisor 1 HR S 161.20

*29 Dewatering System (well points) 1 HR S 166.25

*30 6" Submersible Hydraulic Pump 1 HR S 107.40

*31 8" Submersible Hydraulic Pump 1 HR S 174.15

*32 3 Person Crew w/pickup truck & foreman 1 HR S 336.05

*33 5 Person Crew w/pickup truck & foreman 1 HR S 471.55

*34 Sand Blasting - Prime and/or painting to be included 1 HR NO BID

35 Furnish, place & compact clean fill (12" liFTs) 500 Sy S 32.55

*36 Pipe installation crew (2" to 6" diameter PVC) 1 HR S 562.60

*37 Pipe installation crew (8" to 12" diameter PVC) 1 HR S  562.60

*38 Pipe installation crew (15" to 30" diameter RCP) 1 HR S 711.30

*39 Pipe installation crew (36" to 60" diameter RCP) 1 HR S 767.20
Pipe installation crew (15" to 30" diameter drainage pipe) Hdpe,

*40 aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated ! HR > 61940
Pipe installation crew (36" - 60" diameter drainage pipe) Hdpe,

"4l aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated ! HR > 71925
Pipe installation crew (72" to 96” diameter drainage pipe) Hdpe,

42 aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated, 1 HR > 835.95

43 Directional Bore 2' diameter pipe-including all material, 1 T NO BID

equipment, labor, etc. to complete




ITEM # DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE
— Bore 4" di — - -
44 D|re.ct|onal ore 4" diameter pipe-including all material, 1 T NO BID
equipment, labor, etc. to complete
*45 Dire'ctional Bore 6" diameter pipe-including all material, 1 T NO BID
equipment, labor, etc. to complete
*46 Dire'ctional Bore 8" diameter pipe-including all material, 1 T NO BID
equipment, labor, etc. to complete
*47 Dire.ctional Bore 10" diameter pipe-including all material, 1 T NO BID
equipment, labor, etc. to complete
rectional 12" i ondlud ateri
*a8 Dlre.ctlona Bore 12" diameter pipe-including all material, 1 T NO BID
equipment, labor, etc. to complete
49 Diver with external air source 1 HR NO BID
50 Welding (portable) with complete supplies 1 HR NO BID
51 Welding Shop 1 HR NO BID
52 Boom Truck with 25 FT. reach 1 HR S 229.45
53 Lowboy capable of hauling heavy equipment 1 HR $ 245.90
* Note: See "

J

cific tions?ﬁ/%cifi Line Item Details
4 J%‘

John Ciabattari, Vice President







10. What equipment will you rent for the proposed work?

11. Srate the namea of vour nronnsed oroiect manager and give details of his or her qualifications and experience in managing similar jobs.

12.

13. The names of the Corporate Nffirarc ar Partnarc nr Individuals doing business under a trade name. are as follows: _

14. List all organizations which were predecessors to Bidder or in which the principals or officers of the Bidder were pr _

15. List and describe all bankruptcy petitions (Voluntary or Involuntary) which have been filed by or against the Bidder, its barent or subsidiaries or
predecessor organizations during the past five (5} years. Include in the description the disposition of each such petition

16. List and describe all successful Performance or Payment Bond claims made to your suretyties) during the last five (5) years. The list and descriptions
should include claims against the bond of the Bidder and its predecessor organization(s).

17. List all claims, arbitrations, administrative hearings and lawsuits brought by or against the Bidder or its predecessor organization(s) during the last
five (5) years. The list shall include all case names; case, arbitratior ~r hasring identification numbers; the name of the project over which the
dispute arose; and a description of the subject matter of the dispute.

18. List and describe all criminal proceedings or haarings concerning business related offenses in which the Bidder, its principals or officers or
predecessor organization (s) were defendants.

19. Has the Bidder, its principals, officers ~r nredecessor organization(s) been debarred or suspended from bidding by any government during the last
five (5) years? If yes, provide details.

20. List and disclose any and all business relations with any members of Wellington Council,
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EQUIPMENT LIST

YEAR MAKE/MODEL

2002 30FT JIB ARM w/WINCH & CABLE - Mounts on 791 AND 952

32'x 16'x 4" - PUSH BOAT / BARGE w/(2) MERCURY 75HP GAS

2018 36" PRESSURE ROCK AUGER w/4" BOX

2005 40' TANDEM GOOSENECK DUAL TRAILER

48' x 24' x 4' SPUD BARGE w/ 4 SPUD WELLS & (2) 42' x 12' DIA. ROUND SPUDS

2023 ALCOM 16' ENCLOSED ALUMINUM TAG ALONG TRAILER

1972 ALUM. WORKBOAT w/ OUTBOARD. MOTOR

2018 ALUMACRAFT 11' OUTBOARD BOAT

2019 AMCO MFG. J42-2826C - 12' WHEEL OFFSET HARROWS (Disc)

2017 ATLAS COPCO 185CFM COMPRESSOR TIER 4 FINAL

2018 ATLAS COPCO XAS 185 AIR COMPRESSOR

2017 ATLAS COPCO XAS 185 AIR COMPRESSOR

2022 ATLAS COPCO XAS188 AIR COMPRESSOR

2023 ATLAS COPCO XAS950 AIR COMPRESSOR UvC301328

2022 BIG TEX 14LP-14 TAG ALONG DUMP TRAILER - 7'x14'

2021 BIG TEX 14PH-20BK+5MR - TAG-ALONG - 25' x 8'6" - EQUIPMENT TRAILER

2009 BOBCAT 430H MINI EXCAVATOR

2022 BOMAG BW211 D-5 VIBRATORY DIRT ROLLER

2022 BOMAG BW211D5 VIBRATORY ROLLER

2005 BOMAG MPH122 SOIL STABILIZER/RECYCLER

2004 BOMAG VIBRATORY SINGLE DRUM ROLLER

2023 CAN AM HD7 DEFENDER SIDE BY SIDE ATV

2023 CAN AM HD7 DEFENDER SIDE BY SIDE ATV

2021 CATERPILLAR 259D3 SKID STEER LOADER (ENCLOSED)

2022 CATERPILLAR 259D3 SKID STEER TRACK LOADER (OPEN)

2022 CATERPILLAR 259D3 SKID STEER TRACK LOADER {OPEN)

2018 CATERPILLAR 272D2 WHEELED SKID STEER LOADER w/ CAT PICK-UP BROOM

2018 CATERPILLAR 272D2XHP WHEELED SKID STEER LOADER w/ CAT PICK-UP BROOM

2021 CATERPILLAR 302_7DCR MINI EXCAVATOR

2022 CATERPILLAR 303.5-07CR MINI EXCAVATOR

2022 CATERPILLAR 303.5-07CR MINI EXCAVATOR

2023 CATERPILLAR 304-07 MINI EXCAVATOR




2021 CATERPILLAR 304E2CR MIN| EXCAVATOR

2022 CATERPILLAR 305-07CR MINI EXCAVATOR

2021 CATERPILLAR 308-07CR HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR
2022 CATERPILLAR 315-07 HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR

2018 CATERPILLAR 315FLCR HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR
2014 CATERPILLAR 324EL LR LONG REACH 60' EXCAVATOR
2016 CATERPILLAR 326FL LONG REACH EXCAVATOR

2011 CATERPILLAR 328DLCR TC EXCAVATOR

2019 CATERPILLAR 330-07 HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR

2022 CATERPILLAR 336-07 HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR

2023 CATERPILLAR 336-08 HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR

2018 CATERPILLAR 336FL HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR

2023 CATERPILLAR 340-08 HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR

2018 CATERPILLAR 420F2 IT COMBINATION BACKHOE
2021 CATERPILLAR 938M WHEEL LOADER

2018 CATERPILLAR 938M WHEEL LOADER

2022 CATERPILLAR CB2.5-03 D/DRUM ASPHALT ROLLER
2019 CATERPILLAR €554B ASPHALT ROLLER

2012 CATERPILLAR D6T LGPVP DOZER

2022 CATERPILLAR DP35N5 - 7,000 LB. PNEUMATIC TIRE FORKLIFT
2022 CATERPILLAR DP50N-1D - 11,000 LB. PNEUMATIC TIRE FORKLIFT
2015 CATERPILLAR TL1255D MATERIAL HANDLER

2000 COACH CRAFT FIBERSPLICE ENCLOSED TRAILER - T/A
2015 COTC LANDSCAPING TRAILER

2007 DAWSON- EXCAV. MOUNTED VIB. HAMMER

2016 DIAMOND CARGO 8.5 x 20TA TAG-ALONG-TRAILER
2016 DOOSAN C185WDZ-T4F AIR COMPRESSOR

2017 DOWN TO EARTH 7' x 16' TAG-ALONG TRAILER

2017 DOWN TO EARTH DTE612DT5.2B- 5.2 TON DUMP TRAILER
2009 EMERSON TR-50 SERIES 7 REEL TRAILER

2004 ENCLOSED SMALL Blue TRAILER

2002 FLAT BLACK TRAILER w/18" RAILS

FLEXIFLOAT - 10,000 LB. LINE PULL - HYDRAULIC SPUD WINCH - ITEM # U35 - S-50
SYSTEM - MOUNTED TO SPUDWELLS

FLEXIFLOAT - 10,000 LB. LINE PULL - HYDRAULIC SPUD WINCH - ITEM # U35 - 5-50
SYSTEM - MOUNTED TO SPUDWELLS

FLEXIFLOAT - 20" |.D. SPUDWELL - ITEM # 509A - S-50 SYSTEM

FLEXIFLOAT - 20" I.D. SPUDWELL - ITEM # 509A - S-50 SYSTEM

FLEXIFLOAT - 20'x10'x5' LOADING DOCK - ITEM # 504 - S-50 SYSTEM




FLEXIFLOAT - 20'x10'x5' LOADING DOCK - ITEM # 504 - S-50 SYSTEM

) FLEXIFLOAT - 40' SPUD - 20" O.D. w/SHEAVES - ITEM # SP2040R S-50 SYSTEM
3 FLEXIFLOAT - 40' SPUD - 20" O.D. w/SHEAVES - ITEM # SP2040R S-50 SYSTEM
3 FLEXIFLOAT - 80HP HYDRAULIC PUMPING UNIT - ITEM # U41-80 S-50 SYSTEM

FLEXIFLOAT - DUOFLOAT - ITEM # 5200 - S-50 - 20'x 10' x5' SECTIONAL BARGE

FLEXIFLOAT - DUOFLOAT - ITEM # 5200 same as 1896

FLEXIFLOAT - QUADRAFLOAT - ITEM # 5400 - S-50 - 40'x 10'x 5' SECTIONAL BARGE

FLEXIFLOAT - QUADRAFLOAT ITEM # 5400

2010 FONTAINE 48' DROP DECK TRAILER - FLAT

2025 GEOQUIP SD-30 VIBRATORY DAMPENER

2001 GREAT DANE 37' FLATBED TRAILER

2012 GREAT DANE 45 FT. TANDEM AXLE FLATBED

1991 GREAT DANE 48" BOX TRAILER

2020 HOLLAND J4- 3RB 4" JET PUMP w/PERKINS 1104D-44T ENG.
2020 HOLLAND W8R-PERKINS 404F.E22T 35.6HP - 8" WELLPOINT ROTARY PUMP
2023 HOMEMADE REEL TRAILER

2013 HORTON HY718TA - 20' ENCLOSED TRAILER

2010 HUDSON BROS. HTD18D 10 TON TILT DECK TAG-ALONG TRAILER
2012 HUDSON BROS. HTD20A 20 TON TILT DECK TAG-ALONG

2012 HUDSON BROS. HTD20A 20 TON TILT DECK TAG-ALONG TRAILER
2024 HUSQVARNA FS3500 MKIl WALK BEHIND ROAD SAW

2024 HYDREMA 912GHM - COMPACT 10T ARTICULATED END DUMP
2024 HYDREMA 912GHM - COMPACT 10T ARTICULATED END DUMP
2022 I.C.E. 140C MODEL VIBRATORY CLAMP - For use w/ I.C.E. 28 Hammer
) I.C.E. HYDRAULIC POWER UNIT Model 50

2000 INGERSOLL-RAND P375WCU COMPRESSOR

2000 INGERSOLL-RAND SD100DB VIBRATORY ROLLER

2013 ISCO 6-18 INCH BUTT FUSION MACHINE w/PIPE

2008 J-BOAT UTILITY WORK BOAT W/ CRANE

2021 JOHN DEERE 17G MINI EXCAVATOR

2019 JOHN DEERE 17G MINI EXCAVATOR

2016 JOHN DEERE 329E SKID STEER LOADER - TRACKS

2015 JOHN DEERE 450) LGP DOZER

2012 JOHN DEERE 672GP MOTOR GRADER

2014 JOHN DEERE 744K WHEEL LOADER

2018 JOHN DEERE 85G HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR

2004 JOHN DEERE COMBO BACKHOE

2019 KAUFMAN 26' T/A ENCLOSED TRAILER

2014 KAUFMAN TL-3400 DECKOVER TRAILER

KAUFMAN TL-3400 TRAILER (TR65)




2006 | KENWORTH T-300 T/A WATER TRUCK

2024 | KOMATSU D39PXI-24 CRAWLER DOZER w/ GPS GRADE CONTROL SYSTEM

] KOMATSU D39PXI-24 CRAWLER DOZER w/ GPS GRADE CONTROL SYSTEM

2024 | KOMATSU D51PXI-24 CRAWLER DOZER w/ GPS GRADE CONTROL SYSTEM

2023 | KOMATSU D71PXI-24 CRAWLER DOZER w/ GPS GRADE CONTROL SYSTEM

2020 | KOMATSU HM300-5 ARTICULATED END DUMP - 30 TON -

2020 | KOMATSU HM300-5 ARTICULATED END DUMP - 30 TON -

2024 | KOMATSU HM300-5 ARTICULATED END DUMP - 30 TON w/ TAILGATE

2024 | KOMATSU HM300-5 ARTICULATED END DUMP - 30 TON w/ TAILGATE

2005 | KOMATSU HM400-1 ARTICULATED END DUMP

2025 | KOMATSU PC138USLC-11 HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR 30K W/ Hyd thumb 36" bucket

2011 | KOMATSU PC450LC-8 EXCAVATOR 100K#

2023 | KOMATSU PC490LCl-11 HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR w/ GPS GRADE CONTROL SYSTEM

2013 | KOMATSU WA270-7 WHEEL LOADER

2016 | KOMATSU WA270-8 WHEEL LOADER

2018 | KOMATSU WA270-8 WHEEL LOADER

2017 | KOMATSU WA270-8 WHEEL LOADER

2020 | LEGEND TRAILERS 40 FT. GOOSENECK - 36 TON

2022 | LEICA 2" iCR80S ROBOTIC TOTAL STATION

1998 | LODRIL MODEL LLMHT-40 (MOUNTED ON 100)

2000 | LOWE - GLC MODEL 17'11" ALUMINUM BOAT w/OUTBD. ENG.

2012 | MACK 4 AXLE DUMP TRUCK

2018 | MACK GU713 GRANITE TRI-AXLE DUMP TRUCK

2015 | MACK GU713 GRANITE TRI-AXLE DUMP TRUCK w/ BRISTOL DONALD BIBEAU BODY

2011 | MACK GU713 w/AMERICAN ROLL-OFF BODY

2013 | MAGIC TILT - TALS 2044 BOAT TRAILER -

2006 | MAGIC TILT BOAT TRAILER - For V 613

2017 | MAGNUM MLT3060K LIGHT TOWER

2012 | MAGNUM PRO MLT3060 LIGHT TOWER

2023 | MANITOWOC 12000 CRAWLER CRANE

2019 | MAXXD - DOX10222 - 22" UTILITY TRAILER

2016 | MWI PUMPS - MODEL # HT004 - 4" SUB. TRASH PUMP w/ 800D HYDRAULIC DRIVE
UNIT & ACCESSORIES

] MWI RWPO6TO1 - 6" WATER PUMP

2004 | NEW HOLLAND TRACTOR

2022 | PEMBERTON L300 / 500-8-106 LOADER RAKE ATTACHMENT

2022 | PEMBERTON MDGA400-PC450 CONCRETE DENSIFIER / PULVERIZER

2015 | PETERBILT 365 w/ ALTEC AC38-127S CRANE

2018 | PETERBILT 367 w/ NATIONAL 900A CRANE # 300869




PETERBILT 389 TRI-AXLE TRACTOR

PETERBILT 567 TRI AXLE DUMP TRUCK

PETERBILT TRACTOR

PIKE 8 TON TAG-ALONG TRAILER

PJ 14' DUMP TRAILER - DG-142 - 7'x14' - 7 TON

PJ TRAILER MODEL CC-202-55SWR EQUIP. TRAILER

PJ TRAILER MODEL CC-202-55WR EQUIP. TRAILER

PJ TRAILER MODEL CC-202-55WR TAG-ALONG EQUIP. TRAILER

POSEIDON MODEL # 2RK7 - 10'x10'x7' RAKE ROLL FORM DECK

2022 POSEIDON MODEL # 2RK7 - 10'x10'x7' RAKE ROLL FORM DECK

2022 POSEIDON MODEL # 2RK7 - 10'x10'x7' RAKE ROLL FORM DECK

2022 POSEIDON MODEL # 2RK7 - 10'x10'x7' RAKE ROLL FORM DECK

2025 POSEIDON MODEL P2-5-RAKE - 10'x10'x5' RAKE SECTIONAL BARGE

2025 POSEIDON MODEL P2-5-RAKE - 10'x10'x5"' RAKE SECTIONAL BARGE

2025 POSEIDON MODEL P2-5-RAKE - 10'x10'x5"' RAKE SECTIONAL BARGE

2025 POSEIDON MODEL P2-5-RAKE - 10'x10'x5' RAKE SECTIONAL BARGE

2025 POSEIDON P2 - 40'x10'6"x5' RF DECK w/HATCH SECTIONAL BARGE

2025 POSEIDON P2 - 40'x10'6"x5' RF DECK w/HATCH SECTIONAL BARGE

2017 PROGRESSIVE INDUSTRIA 610 SUPER TRIUMPH MODEL -25.5 PUSH BOAT w/ TWIN
CUMMIN ENG. 610 HP TOTAL."KELLIE McCOY"...

2017 PROGRESSIVE INDUSTRIAL - 610 SUPER TRIUMPH MODEL - PUSH BOAT w/ TWIN
CUMMINS ENG. 610 HP TOTAL - "REBECCA TURBIN"

) RAKE- LOADER RAKE 96"

2021 ROLL OFF 24’ FLATBED HS

2015 ROLL OFF CONTAINER 30 C.Y. (OPEN)

2021 ROLL OFF CONTAINER 30 C.Y. (OPEN) HS

2021 ROLL OFF CONTAINER 30 C.Y. (OPEN) HS

2019 ROLL-OFF CONTAINER - 20 C.Y. OPEN

2019 ROLL-OFF CONTAINER - 20 C.Y. OPEN

2016 ROLL-OFF CONTAINER - 20 C.Y. OPEN

1993 SAUBER 1521 - SINGLE REEL / MATERIAL TRAILER

2013 SCHWING SP750-15D TAG-ALONG CONCRETE PUMP

1996 SEA ARK BOATS, INC. - 21' CREW BOAT w/ (2) YAMAHA 150 HP OUTBOARD MOTORS

2000 SEA ARK BOATS, INC. - 20' VS ALUMINUM HULL BOAT

2017

TALBERT 60 TON - FLD LOBOY




THOMPSON 10" DD Submersible head - HYDRAULIC PUMP

2012

TRAMAC SC28 HYDRAULIC BREAKER (PC55) Attaches to 1089
2018 VACTRON CV873SGT TRAILER MOUNTED VAC SYSTEM
2006 VARIOUS FLEX! FLOAT BARGES -6 UNITS @ 10x40x7 AND
4 UNITS @ 10x20x7
2021 VERMEER CV873GT TRAILER MOUNTED VAC SYSTEM
2006 WACKER G25 - 25KVA PORTABLE GENERATOR
2006 WACKER G25 - 25KVA PORTABLE GENERATOR
2024 | WASTEQUIP 20 YD. OPEN CONTAINER
2024 WASTEQUIP 20 YD. OPEN CONTAINER
2024 WASTEQUIP 30 YD. OPEN CONTAINER
2024 WASTEQUIP 30 YD. OPEN CONTAINER
1998 WELLS CARGO ENCLOSED UTILITY TRAILER
2025 WESTERN STAR 47X TRI-AXLE DUMP TRUCK

2020

WYLIE MANUFACTURING EXP-500 WATER TRAILER

12/25




Michael has over 15 years of experience in the Heavy Civil and Marine Construction Industry
including the past 8 years as a Ferreira Construction Co., Inc.(Ferreira) project manager.
Michael has experience as a project manager on various heavy civil, utility, and marine
construction projects. Michael’s hand on management allows him to react expeditiously to
unforeseen challenges that can impact his projects, from atypical weather, challenging
environmental health and safety conditions, labor challenges, and complex project sequencing
and scheduling while assuring the project remains within budget and on time. More
importantly, Michael makes certain that all project sites reflect Ferreira’s commitment to the
highest standards of quality and safety.

e Project bid cost estimating, scope of work comprehension and specification-plan review
and understanding.

¢ Labor-equipment-material determination, ordering, and management.

o Subcontractor and vendor assignment, coordination, and management.

e Logic-sequence scheduling.

o Safety guidance, oversight, and management.

e Project preparation including mobilization logistics and planning.

¢ Labor-material-equipment selection.

e Scope of work execution management including budget management, schedule
management, labor-equipment-material management, and contractual-regulatory-
safety compliance.

e Project demobilization and closeout.

Ferreira Construction Company Inc. {2015-Present).

As Project Manager Mr. Ciabattari manages all phases of Civil, Marine, Utility and
Underground Construction. Michael has exceptional leadership, communication, and
interpersonal skills. He is reliable and organized with an ability to work independently and as
part of the team to ensure the project is completed on time and on budget.

Harbor Ridge Golf and Country Club (2010-2015)

As operations manager Mr. Ciabattari over saw all of the day-to-day Golf Club experience
ensuring exceptional customer service at the Golf arena and related facilities including
overseeing the supervision of the maintenance of golf carts and golf operations personnel.



Northgate Construction (2006-2010)
As a Foreman Mr. Ciabattari over saw all aspects of site work construction and coordination of

earth and concrete work. Michael was permitting liaison ensuring environmental and structural
compliance with local, state, and federal agencies.

Bachelor of Science in Business Administration

OSHA 10-hour Construction Safety

FDEP Certified Storm Water Inspector
Certified Confined Space Competent Person
MOT Training



Preference shall be given to businesses with drug-free workplace programs. In order to have a
drug-free workplace program, a business must attest to the following:

1. We publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution,
dispensing, possession, or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying
the actions that will be taken against employees for violations of such prohibition.

2. We inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy
of maintaining a drug-free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee
assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse

violations.

3. We give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are
under Bid a copy of the statement specified in subsection (1).

4. We, in the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of
working on the commodities or contractual services that are under Bid, the employee will abide by
the terms of the statement and will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo
contendere to, any violation of Chapter 893 or of any controlled substance law of the United States
or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days after such

conviction.

5. We impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or
rehabilitation program if such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so

convicted.

6. We make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through
implementation of this section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, | certify that this firm complies fully with the
above requirements.
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THIS FORM MUST BE SIGNED IN THE PRESENCE OF A NOTARY PUBLIC OR OTHER OFFICER AUTHORIZED TO ADMINISTER OATHS.

1.

Village of Wellington

[print name of the public entity]

This sworn statement is submitted to

b for
[PHIILHAIHE Ui Sy s SWOTND statement]

[print individual's name and title)

whose busines: and (if applicabie) its Federal Employer Identification

Number (FEIN) clude the Social Security Number of the individua! signing this sworn

statement: )

| understand that a "public entity crime™ as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(g), Florida Statutes, means a violation of any state or federal law by a person with
respect to and directly related to the transaction of business with any public entity or with an agency or political subdivision of any other state or of the United
States, including, but not limited to, any bid or contract for goods or services to be provided to any public entity or an agency or political subdivision of any other
state or of the United States and involving antitrust, fraud, theft, bribery, collusion, racketeering, conspiracy, or material misrepresentation.

I understand that "convicted"” or "conviction" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(b), Florida Statutes, means a finding of guilt or a conviction of a public entity
crime, with or without an adjudication of guilt, in any federai or state trial court of record relating to charges brought by indictment or information after
July 1, 1989, as a result of jury verdict, nonjury trial, or entry of a plea of guilty or nolo contendere.

I understand that an "affiliate” as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(a), Florida Statutes, means:

a. A predecessor or successor of a person convicted of a public entity crime; or

b. Anentity under the control of any natural person who is active in the management of the entity and who has been convicted of a public entity crime. The
term "affiliate" includes those officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, and agents who are active in the management
of an affiliate. The ownership by one person of shares constituting a controlling interest in another person, or a pooling of equipment or income among
persons when not for fair market value under an arm's length agreement, shall be a prima facie case that one person controls another person. A person
who knowingly enters into a joint venture with a person who has been convicted of a public entity crime in Florida during the preceding 36 months shall
be considered an affiliate.

I understand that a "person" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(c), Florida Statutes, means any natural person or entity organized under the laws of any state or
of the United States with the legal power to enter into a binding contract and which bids or applies to bid on contracts for the provision of goods or services let
by a public entity, or which otherwise transacts or applies to transact business with a public entity. The term “person” includes those officers, directors, executives,

employees, members, and agents who are active in management of an entity.

partners, shareholders,

Based on information and belief, the statement which | have marked below is true in relation to the entity submitting this sworn statement. [Please indicate which
statament applies.]

. _ Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents who
are active in management of the entity, nor any affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

The entity submitting this sworn statement, or one or more of the officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents
who are active in management of the entity, or an affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

The entity submitting this sworn statement, or one or more of its officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents
who are active in the management of the entity, or an affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1,
1989. However, there has been a subsequent proceeding before a Hearing Officer of the State of Florida, Division of Administrative Hearings and the Final Order
entered by the Hearing Officer determined that it was not in the public interest to place the entity submitting this sworn statement on the convicted vendor list.

[attach a copy of the final order]

I UNDERSTAND THAT THE SUBMISSION OF THIS FORM TO THE CONTRACTING OFFICER F
PUBLIC ENTITY ONLY AND, THAT THIS FORM IS VALID THROUGH DECEMBER 31 OF THE CA
TO INFORM THE PUBLIC ENTITY PRIOR TO ENTERING INTO A CONTRACT IN EXCESS OF 1
FOR CATEGORY TWO OF ANY CHANGE [N THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS FORM

STATE OF

COUNTY Ol

Subscribed and Sworn to (or affirmed) before me on by

luale]

He/she is personally known to me or has presented

WE IS FOR THAT
1AM REQUIRED
RIDA STATUTES

[T

haincy

as identification.

[type of identification]

FrINLNULary Name anu contmission No.

AL CECILIAR.HEN
; Commizsion # HH 378794

qbé ' Expires June 28, 292? é 23

Dy
& 0p 0

£
* {
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l
certifies

CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO FLORIDA STATUTE § 215.4725 and § 287.135

, on behalf of

Print Name Company Name

that

Company Name

Title

Date

{s not engaged in a boycott of israel; and

Is not on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List ; and

Is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List; and

Is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in iran Terrorism Sectors List; and

Has not engaged in business operations in Cuba or Syria.
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This Proposal/Agreement (whichever is applicable) is subject to the conflict of interest provisions of the policies and Code of Ordinances of
WELLINGTON, the Palm Beach County Code of Ethics, and the Florida Statutes. During the term of this Agreement and any renewals or extensions
thereof, the VENDOR shall disclose to WELLINGTON any possible conflicts of interests. The VENDOR’s duty to disclose is of a continuing nature and
any conflict of interest shall be immediately brought to the attention of WELLINGTON. The terms below shall be defined in accordance with the policies
and Code of Ordinances of WELLINGTON, the Palm Beach County Code of Ethics, and Ch. 112, Part lll, Florida Statutes.

CHECK ALL THAT APPLY.

NO CONFLICT:

To the best of our knowledge, the work contemplated by this agreement would not create a conflict of interest due to the undersigned’s
representation of other clients on projects pending before the Village of Wellington.

To the best of our knowledge, the undersigned business has no employment or other contractual relationship with any WELLINGTON employee,

elected official or appointed official.

To the best of our knowledge, the undersigned business has no officer, director, partner or proprietor that is a WELLINGTON purchasing agent,
other employee, elected official or appointed official. The term “purchasing agent”, “elected official” or “appointed official”, as used in this paragraph,
shall include the respective individual’s spouse or child, as defined in Ch. 112, Part Ifi, Florida Statutes.

o the best of our knowledge, no WELLINGTON employee, elected official or appointed official has a material or ownership interest (5% ownership)
in our business. The term “employee”, “elected official” and “appointed official”, as used in this paragraph, shall include such respective individual’s

’

relatives and household members as described and defined in the Palm Beach County Code of Ethics.

POTENTIAL CONFLICT:

[ 1 The undersigned business, by attachment to this form, submits a list of current clients and projects for which it is currently seeking Village
approval and which may cause a potential conflict of interest due to any of the above listed reasons or otherwise.

THE UNDERSIGNED UNDERSTANDS AND AGREES THAT IT IS INELIGIBLE TO PERFORM WORK ON BEHALF OF THE VILLAGE OF WELLINGTON FOR ANY
OF THE CLIENTS OR PROJECTS LISTED IN THE ATTACHEMENT TO THIS FORM. FAILURE TO DISCLOSE A POSSIBLE CONFLICT OF INTEREST MAY RE SULT
IN DISQUALIFICATION OF YOUR BID/PROPOSAL OR IN THE IMMEDIATE CANCELLATION OF YOUR AGREEMENT, WHICHEVER IS APPLICABLE.

NAME (PRINT OR TYPE)

TITLE

Rev. 5.28.2025
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State of
County ol
Being duly sworn deposes and says:

That he/she is an officer of the parties making the forgoing bid submittal, that the bid is made without prior understanding, agreement,
or connection with any individual, firm, partnership, corporation or other entity submitting a bid for the same materials, services,
supplies or equipment, either directly or indirectly, and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebates, or
gratuities are permitted with, prior to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any violation of this provision may
result in disqualification, contract cancellation, return of materials or-discontinuation of services, and the possible removal of Bidder

from the vendor Bid lists

Name of Bidder
Title
On this __ _ dayof _ .20 1 appeared __personally known to me to be the person
described in and who executed this and acknowledged that (she/he) signed the name freely and voluntarily
for the uses and purposes therein described.
In witness thereof, | have hereunto set my hand and affixed seal the day and year last written above.
signature

Notary Public in and for the State of -

Affi e x
( l@‘%&é "I CeciAR HEN

Conmmlssion # HH 378794?
Expires June 29, 2027 ;

(Name Printed)

Residing at

My commission expires
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Client#: 353923 FERRECONST
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

ACORD.. CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 6125/2025

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
if SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on

this certificate does not confer any rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).
GQUIACT Breffni McEntee
[ o 646-843-3936 |
bmcentee@connerstrong.com

PRODUCER
Conner Strong & Buckelew

32 Old Slip, Suite 3204

PHONE, Ex) 646-891-4981
E-MAIL

ADDRESS:
New York, NY 10005 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE B naicE |
imsuggg A : Liberty Mutual Fire Insurance Co. 23035
INSURED ] ] \ INSURER B : AXIS Surplus Insurance Company 26620
Ferreira Construction Co., Inc. L.NsuRER ¢ : Sutton Specialty Insurance Company 16848
13000 SE Flora Avenue hnsungn o
Hobe Sound, FL 33455 l INSURER E -
INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,

EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

POLICY EXP

i TYPE OF INSURANCE D POLICY NUMBER (pﬁﬂha"éfv%% (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
A | X| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY TB2631510814025 07/01/2025|07/01/2026] EACH OCCURRENCE 1$2,000,000 |
CLAIMS-MADE @ OCCUR PR L RN nee) | 51,000,000
- o MED EXP (Any one person) $1 0!000 ]
- PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | $2,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $4,000,000
POLICY @ 5?(% lz] Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $4,000,000
OTHER: $

A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY AS2631510814015 07/01/2025|07/01/2026 G5 ooy o= MT 12,000,000

l ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
NED LY SCHEDQULED BODILY INJURY (Peraccident) | § |

| x| HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
= AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY Per accident I
 — N = [ e — $ R

B | |UMBRELLALIAB | X | occur P00100376214602 07/01/2025 07/01/2026{ EACHOCCURRENCE | $3,000,000 |
| X| EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE 153,000,000 |

DED RETENTION §

A | WORKERS COMPENSATION o WA263D510814035 07/01/2025]07/01/2026 X [B5R, e | [
SIEE,CPE%?A%I5‘&%&/2&%{8%%/5%(ECUTIVEIE NIA E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $1,000,000
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| 51,000,000
If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - Poutcy umiT | $1,000,000

C |Excess Liability AESIR276AEFF3FCC 07/01/2025|07/01/20261 $10M Occ. / $20M Agg.

022025

L

fo b g

may be if more space is required)

Coverage: Contractors Professional & Pollution Liability
Carrier: Berkley Assurance Company (NAIC #39462)
Effective: 07/01/2025 to 07/01/2026

Policy #: PCAB50253110725

(See Attached Descriptions)

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additionat Remarks Schedul

Limits: Contractors Professional = $10,000,000 Each Claim & Aggregate

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

City of Wellington
12300 West Forest Hill Blvd.

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

Wellington,, FL 33414

L

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

ACORD 25 (2016/03) 1 of2
#55503462/M5489022

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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State of Florida
Department of State

I certify from the records of this office that FERREIRA CONSTRUCTION CO.
INC. is a New Jersey corporation authorized to transact business in the State of
Florida, qualified on April 9, 2004.

The document number of this corporation is F04000001981.

I further certify that said corporation has paid all fees due this office through
December 31, 2025, that its most recent annual report/uniform business report
was filed on February 7, 2025, and that its status is active.

I further certify that said corporation has not filed a Certificate of Withdrawal.

Given under my hand and the
Great Seal of the State of Florida
at Tallahassee, the Capital, this
the Seventh day of February, 2025

===k

Secretary of Séate

Tracking Number: 4458905547CC

To authenticate this certificate,visit the following site,enter this number, and then
follow the instructions displayed.

https://services.sunbiz.org/Filings/CertificateOfStatus/CertificateAuthentication










T FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF
Environmental Protection

Marjory Stoneman Douglas Building
NoNIAL L 3900 Commonwealth Boulevard
Taliahassee, FL 32399

1

September 5, 2024

Therese Cucco
Ferreira Construction Company, Inc.
13000 SE Flora Avenue
Hobe Sound, FL 33455

Dear Therese,

Effective September 5, 2024, Ferreira Construction Company,
Inc., is prequalified to bid on the Florida Department of
Environmental Protection, Bureau of Design and Construction’s
projects that require state licenses. This prequalification expires on

August 31, 2026.

If you have any questions regarding this prequalification please feel
free to contart taurinda Micheels bv phone at (850) 245-2781 or

via email at

Sincerely,

Ralph M~ [yl sionedby Raph
Perkins v

Ralph Perkins, FCCM
Program Administrator
Bureau of Design and Construction

Ron DeSantis
Governor

Jeanetts Nuiiaz
Lt Govermnor

Shawn Hamiiton
Secretary









Name & Address
Title President
FERREIRA, NELSON

12630 Seminole Beach Rd
North Palm Beach, FL 33412

Title SR VP

GARCIA, DICTINIO

2836 Biarritz Drive

Palm Beach Gardens, FL 33410

Title SEC, TREASURER

PACHECO, LOU
197 CAROL JEAN WAY
BRANCHBURG, NJ 08876

Title SR VP

DELPOME, BRIAN

42 Philhower Road
lebanon, NJ 08833

Title VP

Seelman, Michael C

16 Ramar Street
Flanders, NJ 07836
Title SR VP

VLIET, NANCY

19 Thomas Rd

Glen Gardner, NJ 08826
Title Sr. Vice President/ CFO
Killian, Jerome

158 Tyler Way

Yardley, PA 19067

Title VP

CIABATTARI, JOHN
1654 SW Foxpoint Trail

PALM CITY, FL 34990

Title VP










AFFIDAVIT REGARDING EMPLOYMENT OF UNAUTHORIZED ALIENS

STATE OF FLORIDA

COUNTY OF MARTIN

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally appeared John Ciabattari, who, being duly sworn, deposes and

states as follows:

° | am of legal age, competent to testify, and have authority to make this affidavit on behalf of Ferreira

Construction Co., Inc..

o Ferreira Construction Co., Inc. affirms that it is registered with and uses the E-Verify system to verify the
work authorization status of all newly hired employees.

° Ferreira Construction Co., Inc. does NOT employ, contract with, or subcontract with any unauthorized alien,
as that S T T T Trmms ottt d Section 448.095, Florida Statutes.
Signatu

Date: December 11, 2025
STATE OF FLORIDA

COUNTY OF MARTIN

Sworn to and subscribed before me by means of {/] physical presence or { ] Online notarization, this 11* day of
December 2025, by John Ciabattari, who is personally known to me or has produced as identification.

Notary Publit

My Commission Expires: June 29, 2027

[ B S Rt el 3
(Seal) F e, CECILIAR. HEIN 9

* : Commission # HH 378794

b &S . Expites June 29,2027

An Equal Opportunity Employer



Company ID Number: 798869

Approved by:

Employer
Ferreira Construction Co.,Inc.

Electronically Signed

Name (Please Type or Print) Title

Warren J Clark

Signature Date

Electronically Signed 07/17/2014

Department of Homeland Security — Verification Division

Name (Please Type or Print) itle

USCIS Verification Division

Signature Date
07/22/2014

Page 13 of 17 E-Verify MOU for Employers | Revision Date 06/01/13




NO COERCION FOR LABOR OR SERVICES AFFIDAVIT
(Pursuant to Section 787.06, Florida Statutes)

I ____ (name of affiant) of
(name of business entity), attest that the following is true:

1. I have personal knowledge of the facts in this Affidavit and am of legal age and of
no disability and have the authority to make the statements contained herein.

2. I am the officer or representative of the nongovernmental business entity named
below and make this Affidavit to comply with section 787.06, Florida Statutes.

3. The business entity does not use coercion for labor or services as defined in section
787.06, Florida Statutes.

4. [ understand that I have a continuing obligation to notify the Village of Wellington

if the status of the business entity changes.

Under penalty of perjury, I declare that I have read the foregoing Affidavit and that

the facts stated in it are true.

Affia
Signe
Title:
Busir
Date: , 2

Rev. 8.4.25
29



FOREIGN COUNTRIES OF CONCERN AFFIDAVIT
(Pursuant to Section 287.138, Florida Statutes)

I __ (name of affiant) of
(name of business entity), attest that the following is true:
1. I have personal knowledge of the facts in this Affidavit and am of legal age and of
no disability and have the authority to make the statements contained herein.
2. I am the officer or agent of the business entity named below and make this Affidavit
to comply with section 287.138, Florida Statutes.
3. I certify that the business entity named below does not provide access to an
individual’s personal identifying information to any entity that:
a) is owned by the government of a foreign country of concern;
b) has provided a foreign country of concern a controlling interest; or
¢} is organized under the laws of or has its principal place of business in a
foreign country of concern.
4. I understand that [ have a continuing obligation to notify the Village of Wellington

if the status of the business entity changes.

Under penalty of perjury, I declare that I have read the foregoing Affidavit and that

the facts stated in it are true.

Affia
Signe
Title:
Busir
Date: ,20

Rev. 8.4.25



Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

Go to www.irs.gov/FormW?9 for instructions and the latest information.

Give form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

-
Form w 9

(Rev. March 2024)

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

Before you begin. For guidance related to the purpose of Form W-9, see Purpose of Form, below.
1 Name of entity/individual. An entry is required. (For a sole proprietor or disregarded entity, enter the owner’s name on line 1, and enter the business/disregarded
entity’s name on line 2.}

Ferreira Construction Co., Inc.
2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above.

4 Exemptions (codes apply only to
certain entities, not individuals;
see instructions on page 3):

3a Check the appropriate box for federal tax classification of the entity/individual whose name is entered on line 1. Check
only one of the following seven boxes.

|:| Individual/sole proprietor I_—_| G corporation S corporation |:| Partnership [ Trustestate

E, LLC. Enter the tax classification (C = C corporation, S = S corporation, P = Partnership}

Note: Check the “LLC” box above and, in the entry space, enter the appropriate code (C, S, or P) for the tax
classification of the LLC, unless it is a disregarded entity. A disregarded entity should instead check the appropriate
box for the tax classification of its owner.

D Other (see instructions)

Exempt payee code (if any)

Exemption from Foreign Account Tax
Compliance Act (FATCA) reporting
code (if any)

Print or type.
See Specific Instructions on page 3.

3b If on line 3a you checked “Partnership” or “Trust/estate,” or checked “LLC” and entered “P" as its tax classification,
and you are providing this form to a partnership, trust, or estate in which you have an ownership interest, check
this box if you have any foreign partners, owners, or beneficiaries, See instructions . FS

(Applies to accounts maintained
outside the United States.)

5 Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.). See instructions. Requester's name and address {optional)

31 Tannery Road
6 City, state, and ZIP code

Branchburg, NJ 08876

7 List account number(s) here {optional)

m Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part |, later. For other

Social security number

entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to get a or
TIN, later. . —
Employer identification number ]
Note: If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1. See also What Name and
Number To Give the Requester for guidelines on whose number to enter. 2/2|-)13|3[3)4/9)5/|7

Part Il Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number (or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me); and

2. | am not subject to backup withholding because (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) | have not been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has notified me that | am
no longer subject to backup withholding; and

3. 1 am a U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and

4. The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA reporting is correct.

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding

because you have fail~ #~ rannart ail intaract and dividends on vaur tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage interest paid,

acquisition or aband Jtions to an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and, generally, payments

other than interest a , but you must provide your correct TIN. See the instructions for Part I, later.

Sign Signature

Here |u.s.pers pate  J2 - 1§-2028
( New line 3b has been added to this form. A flow-through entity is
General ln' required to complete this line to indicate that it has direct or indirect

foreign partners, owners, or beneficiaries when it provides the Form W-9
to another flow-through entity in which it has an ownership interest. This
change is intended to provide a flow-through entity with information
regarding the status of its indirect foreign partners, owners, or
beneficiaries, so that it can satisfy any applicable reporting
requirements. For example, a partnership that has any indirect foreign
partners may be required to complete Schedules K-2 and K-3. See the
Partnership Instructions for Schedules K-2 and K-3 (Form 1065).

Section references .
noted.

Future developments. For the latest information about developments
related to Form W-9 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted
after they were published, go to www.irs.gov/FormWa.

What’s New

Line 3a has been modified to clarify how a disregarded entity completes

this line. An LLC that is a disregarded entity should check the
appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner. Otherwise, it
should check the “LLC” box and enter its appropriate tax classification.

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an
information return with the IRS is giving you this form because they

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W=-9 Rev. 3-2024)



