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Vendors

Section A Community Asphait W Ranger Construction
iTEM ary UNITS Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 IMELL EXIT. ASPH.. PAVEMENT (1%) 50,000 sy 51.00] ssoo00.00fis s 150|¢ 7500000
5 IMILLEXIT. ASPH.. PAVEMENT (1 1/2") 80,0000 sY 41.50 $120,000.00 3 16015 128000.00 e
3 IMILLEXISTING PAVEMENT (27) 40,000 SY 5155 $62,000.00 s 1e0ls  sao0000 ] s
4 |MILLEXISTING PAVEMENT (37} 40,000 Y §1.60] $64,000.00 S 1.80| & 72,000.00
g:..wmx_m__._zo PAVING { “< than or up to 7 ft. Mi s| pays 3
5 IMinimum of 8 hrs. per day 57,000.00 $3.5,000.00§:% 1 3 2,200.00 | $ 41,000.00
?.E._.. EXISTING PAVING (7 ft. Mill") sl pays
& {Minimum of 8 hrs, per day $8,000.00| $45,000.00]: 3 9,500,00 | % 47,500,00
7 |SP 12.5(< 200 TON ORDERS) Includes tack coat 300 ™ $115.00 $34,500.00] 4 147.00 | $ 44,100.00
g 5P 12.5 (>200 TON ORDERS) Includes tack coat 10,000 M $95.00 £950,000.00 s a7.00|$ 87000000
g |FC12.5{<200 TON ORDERS) 300 ™ 5$145.00 $43,500.00 -] 194.00 | § 58,200.00
10 [FC 12.5 (=200 TON ORDERS) 10,000 TN $120.00 £1,200,000,00)% s 120.00 | 5 1,200,000.00
11 |5P8.5 (<200 TGN ORDERS) Includes tack coat 300 ™ 611500 s 153.00 | § 45,900.00
12 5P 9.5 {>200TON ORDERS) Includes tack coat 10,000 H $105.00 $ 88.00 | & 880,000.00
13 JACSCTYPES-1 (< 200 TON ORDERS) Includes tack coat 300 TN $115.00 s 148.00 | § 44,400.00 |:
14 JACSCTYPES-1 (»200 TON ORDERS) Includes tack coat 10,000, T 494.00 5 870018 870,0600.00 [
15 {ACSCTYPES-H (<200 TON ORDERS) Includes tack coat 300; T™ $115.00 5 150.00 | & 45,500.00
16 [ACSCTYPES-II (>200 TON ORDERS) Indudes tack coat 10,000 TN 4102.00 S §9.00 ) & 850,0600.00
17 |PORTABLE MILLING MACHINE 100] HR $105.00 4 270.00 [ 3 27,000.00 |
1% |ASPHALT QVERBUID/FULL DEPTH (2" Ifts) 3,000 TN $115.00 4 w7.00|s amoonoofie—i—
1o |F& | PAVEMENT WATERPROOFING FABRIC 10,000 sY $3.00 S 4.00| % 40,000.00
20 |PAVEMENT WATERPROOFING FABRIC (Install Owner Supplief 10,000 sY £1.70] 5 3.10| % 31,000.00
21 (BROOM TRACTOR 100| HR $45,00 5 B5.00| & 6,500.00 :
27 |EXCAVATION {Subgrade 8" - 12" deep] 2,000] CY 48.00 5 500|% 12,000.80
73 {8" BASE ROCK (F & I} and finish grade with prime 4,000 sY $12.50 4 1500 % 60,000.00
24 |12" BASEROCK {F &1) and finish grade with prime 4,000 SY $16.00] 5 2000 (% 80,000.00
25 |MANHOLE ADIUSTMENT (F&I ADAPTER RINGS) (See Exhibit 4 100 EA $105.00 5 200.00 | $ 20,000.00
26 [ADIUST VALVE BOXES & MISC STRUCTURES 150 EA $80.00] s 80.001% 12,000.00
27 |BE OUT SHOUDLER {Exhibit B) 100 sY $20.00! S 10.00 | $ 1,000.00 |:
28 |F & PRIME/MIXTURE FOR EXISTING BASE ROCK 5,000 SY $0,75 $3,750.00 5 0.45| % N,mmcbc& ——
39 |FTRAFFIC CONTROL OFFICERS 4 HR 450,00 $200.00] 5 ,“ o ¢ 68.00 | § 272.00 u
Total Price $6,282,950.00 Iq_uz_ Price | % 7,202,90000 | Total Price |5 5,988,122.00 |

Mathematical Errar an 50V, Extended Price
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Vendors
Seciion B Community Asphalt Ranger Construction
ITEM ary UNITS Lnit Price Total Unit Price Unit Price Total
ASPHALT MULTI PURPOSE PATHWAYS {6'x 1 1/4" OVERLAY 2000 sy :
1 [INcLuDmvG TACK) ' No Bid No Bitl
ASPHALT MULTI PURPOSE PATHWAYS (8" x 1 1/4" OVERLAY 2.000 Sy
2 JINCLUDING TACK) ’ Mo Bid No Bid
3 JASPHALT PATCHING < 50 TONS 200 ™ No Bid No Bid
5 [ASPHALT PATCHING > 50 TONS 2008 TN No Bid No Bid
5 |F & | INSTALL TACTILE SURFACE [FDOT APPROVED) 200 s No Bidf No Bid
6 |F &I STANDARD ROGT BARRIER (35" deep) 1,000 LF No Bid Mo Bid
7 |MOWING STRIP {F & |) for guardrail prior to installation 1,000 LF Ne Bid No Bid
g IMILL EXSIT. PATHWAY (B'x 1" deep) 1,000 LF Mo Bid No Bid
g EMILE EXSIT. FATHWAY {8'% 1" deep) 1,000 LF No Bid No Bid
Iotal Price Mo Bid Total Price No Bid
Vendars
Section G Community Asphalt Ranger Construction
ITEM Qry UNITS Unit Price — Tatal Unit Price Total Unit Price _ Total
1 |ASPHALT SEAL COATING {< 3,000 5Y} 3,000 sY No Bid No Bid
2 |ASPHALT SEAL COATING (> 3,000 SY) 2,000 Y Ne Bid MNa Bid
Total Price _ Mo Bid Total Price _ No Bid




