

Painting Village Hall Exterior and Village Park Gym Interior

14

BID OPENING DATE: July 10, 2019
 BID OPENING TIME: 2:00 PM(local time)
 ITB 201912

*Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above receiving date and time.
 All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late*

VENDOR	JAMIE COAT PAINTING CORP	E & F FLROIDA ENTERPRISES, INC. DBA CREATIVE CONTRACTING	MARIO'S PAINTING AND SERVICES, INC.	CUNANO BUILDERS CORP	ADVANCED PAINTING CONTRACTORS	J & J, INC., DBA EAGLE PAINTING	A THOMAS CONSTRUCTION, INC.
Original and one PDF (CD) of submittal	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Bid Form signed by authorized representative	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Acknowledgement of Addendum One	NO	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Schedule of Value	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Sworn Statement under Section 287.133(3) (a)	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Drug Free Workplace	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Questionnaire	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
References	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Insurance Certificates	NO	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Copy of Appropriate Licenses	NO	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Proof of Workers Compensation Insurance/Workers Compensation Exemption Affidavit	NO	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Local Preference Affidavit	WESTERN COMMUNITIES	WESTERN COMMUNITIES	NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	PALM BEACH COUNTY	NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
Conflict of Interest Statement	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit	NO	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE ITEM 1	\$ 68,550.00	\$ 49,500.00	\$ 25,950.00	\$ 115,700.00	\$ 47,500.00	\$ 41,000.00	\$ 72,900.00
ALTERNATE BID ITEM TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE	NO BID	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,000.00	NO BID	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00
TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE ITEM 2	\$ 51,930.00	\$ 66,500.00	\$ 48,237.00	\$ 52,000.00	\$ 70,500.00	\$ 82,400.00	\$ 127,000.00

BID TABULATION																	
BID NO: 201912																	
PAINTING EXTERIOR OF VILLAGE HALL AND INTERIOR OF VILLAGE PARK GYM																	
			JAMIE COAT PAINTING CORPORATION		CREATIVE CONTRACTING GROUP		MARIO'S PAINTING AND SERVICES, INC.		CUNANO BUILDERS CORP.		ADVANCED PAINTING CONTRACTORS, INC.		EAGLE PAINTING		A THOMAS CONSTRUCTION, INC.		
PAINTING EXTERIOR OF VILLAGE HALL			Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	
Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	Unit Price	Sub Total	
PAINTING EXTERIOR OF VILLAGE HALL (BUILDING 1)	1.00	LS	\$ 68,550.00	\$ 68,550.00	\$ 49,500.00	\$ 49,500.00	\$ 25,950.00	\$ 25,950.00	\$ 115,700.00	\$ 115,700.00	\$ 47,500.00	\$ 47,500.00	\$ 41,000.00	\$ 41,000.00	\$ 72,900.00	\$ 72,900.00	
TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE ITEM 1				\$ 68,550.00		\$ 49,500.00		\$ 25,950.00		\$ 115,700.00		\$ 47,500.00		\$ 41,000.00		\$ 72,900.00	
ALTERNATE BID ITEM TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE	1.00	LS	NO BID	\$ -	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	NO BID	\$ -	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 3,500.00	
ALTERNATE BID ITEM TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE				NO BID		\$ 5,300.00		\$ 5,000.00		NO BID		\$ 3,200.00		\$ 3,500.00		\$ 3,500.00	
PAINTING INTERIOR OF VILLAGE PARK GYM (BUILDING 2)	1.00	LS	\$ 51,930.00	\$ 51,930.00	\$ 66,500.00	\$ 66,500.00	\$ 48,237.00	\$ 48,237.00	\$ 52,000.00	\$ 52,000.00	\$ 70,500.00	\$ 70,500.00	\$ 82,400.00	\$ 82,400.00	\$ 127,000.00	\$ 127,000.00	
TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE ITEM 2				\$ 51,930.00		\$ 66,500.00		\$ 48,237.00		\$ 52,000.00		\$ 70,500.00		\$ 82,400.00		\$ 127,000.00	