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NOTICE OF AWARD

Pursuant to Wellington’s Purchasing Policies and Procedures, notice is provided as follows:

Reference —
INVITATION TO BID - ITB # 202328 — Annual Asphalt Milling, Resurfacing and Sealcoating Village-Wide

On October 10, 2023, Wellington awarded the referenced contract to the following:

e Ranger Construction Industries, Inc. for Section A.

Wellington did not award Sections B or C for ITB 202328
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BID TABULATION

BID NO: 202328

ANNUAL ASPHALT MILLING, RESURFACING AND SEALCOATING VILLAGE-WIDE|

M & M ASPHALT MILLING,
INC. DBA ALL COUNTY

JANICE M RILEY DBA THE

FLORIDA BLACKTOP, INC.

RANGER CONSTRUCTION

FISCHMAN, INC. DBA

R & D PAVING, LLC

PAVING PAVING LADY INDUSTRIES, INC FISCHMAN ASPHALT
Item Description Quantity | Unit| Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total
SECTION A - Asphalt Milling and Resurfacing
10001 1 MILL EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT (1") 50,000.00[ SY | $ 2.50| $ 125,000.00] $ 235 $  117,500.00] $ 3.04 $ 152,000.00| $ 220 $  110,000.00f NO BID NOBID| § 3.30| $ 165,000.00]
10002 2 MILL EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT (1.5") 80,000.00[ SY | § 3.00 $ 240,000.00[ $ 245 $  196,000.00] $ 3.74 $  299,200.00| $ 220 $ 176,000.00f NO BID NOBID| § 3.60| $ 288,000.00]
10003 3 MILL EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT (2") 40,000.00[ SY | $ 3.40| $ 136,000.00[ $ 265 $  106,000.00] $ 4.46| $ 178,400.00] $ 220| $ 88,000.00 NO BID NOBID| § 4.80] $§  192,000.00f
10004 4 mllgljogé(lss;r;NG ASPHALT PAVEMENT 5.00] HR [ $ 2,500.00[ $ 12,500.00f $ 1,750.00| $ 8,750.00| $ 4,508.21| $ 22,541.05] $ 9,000.00[ $ 45,000.00} NO BID NOBID| $ 5,000.00] $ 25,000.00
10005 5 PORTABLE MILLING MACHINE 100.00f HR | § 425.00 $ 42,500.00( $ 325.00| $ 32,500.00] $ 276.35( § 27,635.00 $ 260.00[ $ 26,000.00] NO BID NOBID| $§ 620.00] $ 62,000.00]
10006 6 MANHOLE ADJUSTMENT (F& ADAPTER RINGS) 100.00[ EA | $§ 350.00 $ 35,000.00] $ 225.00[ $ 22,500.00] $ 510.12[ § 51,012.00 $ 215.00[ $§ 21,500.00 NO BID NOBID| $§ 713.00 $ 71,300.00]
10007 7 TRAFFIC CONTROL OFFICERS 4.00 HR [ $ 150.00] $ 600.00[ $ 85.00 $ 340.00 $ 108.40| $ 433.60| $ 70.00| $ 280.00 NO BID NOBID| $§ 110.00] $ 440.00]
10008 8 F&I PRIME FOR EXISITING FINISHED BASE 5,000.00] SY | $ 1.00[ $ 5,000.00[ $ 0.65 $ 3,250.00[ $ 0.55 $ 2,750.00[ $ 045 § 2,250.00] NO BID NOBID| § 375 $ 18,750.00
10009 9 ADJUST VALVE BOXES & MISC STRUCTURES 150.00[ EA | $§ 225.00 $ 33,750.00] $ 125.00[ $ 18,750.00| $ 255.06| $ 38,259.00[ $ 97.00 $ 14,550.00] NO BID NOBID| $§ 550.00 $ 82,500.00
Asphalt Items #10 through #16 shall include tack coat
10011 10 SP 12.5 LEVEL C (< 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 300.00] TN | § 175.00[ $ 52,500.00] $ 176.00[ $ 52,800.00] $ 32911 § 98,733.00 $ 173.00[ $ 51,900.00] NO BID NOBID| $§ 220.85 $ 66,255.00)
10012 11 SP 12.5 LEVEL D (< 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 300.00] TN | § 175.00[ $ 52,500.00] $ 194.00[ $ 58,200.00] $ 329.11 § 98,733.00 $ 185.00[ $ 55,500.00 NO BID NOBID| § 219.15 $ 65,745.00]
10013 12 SP 12.5 LEVEL C (> 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 10,000.00) TN | $ 150.00f $ 1,500,000.00f $§ 146.00] $ 1,460,000.00 $ 187.54| $ 1,875,400.00| $ 131.00] $ 1,310,000.00 NO BID NOBID| $§ 187.65 $ 1,876,500.00
10014 13 SP 12.5 LEVEL D (> 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 10,000.00) TN | $ 150.00f $ 1,500,000.00f $§ 164.00] $ 1,640,000.00 $ 187.54| $ 1,875,400.00] $ 133.00| $ 1,330,000.00 NO BID NOBID| $§ 180.25 $ 1,802,500.00
10015 14 SP 9.5LEVEL C (<300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 300.00] TN | § 164.00[ $ 49,200.00( $ 184.00| $ 55,200.00] $ 329.11 § 98,733.00 $ 193.00[ $ 57,900.00] NO BID NOBID| $§ 219.00 $ 65,700.00]
10016 15 SP 9.5LEVEL C (> 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 10,000.00) TN | $ 159.00f $ 1,590,000.00f $§ 155.00] $ 1,550,000.00| $ 187.54| $ 1,875,400.00] $ 139.00| $ 1,390,000.00 NO BID NOBID| $§ 18250 $ 1,825,000.00
ASPHALT OVERBUILD/FULL DEPTH (2" LIFTS)
10023 16 INCLUDING TACK 3,000000 TN | § 165.00[ $ 495000.000 $ 155.00] $ 465000000 $ 191.04] $§ 573,120.00] $§ 14500( $ 435000.000  NOBID NOBID| $ 192.00] $§ 576,000.00
Grand Total Section Al $ 5,869,550.00 $ 5,786,790.00 $ 7,267,749.65 $ 5,113,880.00 NO BID $ 7,182,690.00




