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1. ECO-MULCH – SHREDDED OR APPROVED EQUAL 
PICKED UP 1 BG $2.25 $2.25 3% $2.32 $1.75 $1.75

2. GOLD MULCH - SHREDDED OR APPROVED EQUAL
1 BG $2.30 $2.30 3% $2.37 $1.98 $1.98

3. MELALEUCA 100% (CURED) OR APPROVED EQUAL 
PICKED UP 1 BG $2.80 $2.80 3% $2.88 $1.90 $1.90

4. PINE BARK MULCH MINI NUGGETS OR APPROVED 
EQUAL PICKED UP 1 BG $3.10 $3.10 3% $3.19 NO BID

5. CERTIFIED PLAYGROUND WOODCHIP MULCH 
(MUST MEET ASTMF 1292-04 + F1951 AND ASTM 
F2075) OR APPROVED EQUAL PICKED UP 1 CY $35.00 $35.00 3% $36.05 NO BID

6. ECO-MULCH – SHREDDED OR APPROVED EQUAL 
DELIVERED 1 BG $2.50 $2.50 3% $2.58 $1.89 $1.89

7. GOLD MULCH - SHREDDED OR APPROVED EQUAL 
DELIVERED 1 BG $2.50 $2.50 3% $2.58 $2.15 $2.15

8. MELALEUCA 100% (CURED) OR APPROVED EQUAL 
DELIVERED 1 BG $2.80 $2.80 3% $2.88 $2.04 $2.04

9. PINE BARK MULCH MINI NUGGETS OR APPROVED 
EQUAL DELIVERED 1 BG $3.25 $3.25 3% $3.35 NO BID

10. CERTIFIED PLAYGROUND WOODCHIP MULCH 
(MUST MEET ASTMF 1292-04 + F1951 AND ASTM 
F2075) OR APPROVED EQUAL DELIVERED 1 CY $40.00 $40.00 3% $41.20 NO BID

11. ECO-MULCH – SHREDDED OR APPROVED EQUAL 
DELIVERED & INSTALLED 1 CY $30.00 $30.00 3% $30.90 NO BID

12. MULCH GOLD - SHREDDED OR APPROVED EQUAL 
(BLOWN-IN) DELIVERED & INSTALLED 1 CY $30.00 $30.00 3% $30.90 NO BID

13. MELALEUCA 100% (CURED) (BLOWN-IN) OR 
APPROVED EQUAL DELIVERED & INSTALLED 1 CY $30.00 $30.00 3% $30.90 NO BID

14. PINE BARK MULCH MINI NUGGETS (BLOWN-IN)  
OR APPROVED EQUAL DELIVERED & INSTALLED 1 CY $50.00 $50.00 3% $51.50 NO BID

15. CERTIFIED PLAYGROUND WOODCHIP MULCH 
(MUST MEET ASTMF 1292-04 + F1951 AND ASTM 
F2075) OR APPROVED EQUAL DELIVERED & 
INSTALLED 1 CY $45.00 $45.00 3% $46.35 NO BID

16. PINE STRAW MULCH TRUCKLOAD - DELIVERED & 
INSTALLED 1 TRUCKLOAD NO BID NO BID NO BID

17. PINE STRAW MULCH TRUCKLOAD - DELIVERED 1 TRUCKLOAD $9.95 $9.95 3% $10.25 NO BID

18. PINE STRAW MULCH PER BALE - DELIVERED 1 BL $10.50 $10.50 3% $10.82 NO BID

19. PINE STRAW MULCH PER BALE - PICKED UP 1 BL $8.50 $8.50 3% $8.76 NO BID

20. Ryegrass seed-Royal Flush Blend -1/3 Sonata PRG, 
1/3 Jet PRG, 1/3 Shining Star PRG (POA FREE) or 
Approved Equal P/U 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

21. Ryegrass seed-Royal Flush Blend -1/3 Sonata PRG, 
1/3 Jet PRG, 1/3 Shining Star PRG (POA FREE) or 
Approved Equal Delivered 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

22. Ryegrass seed-Royal Flush Blend -1/3 Sonata PRG, 
1/3 Jet PRG, 1/3 Shining Star PRG (POA FREE) or 
Approved Equal D&I 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

23. Bermuda Triangle Bucket-3 types blended or 
Approved equal P/U 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

24. Bermuda Triangle Bucket-3 types blended or 
Approved equal Delivered 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

25. Bermuda Triangle Bucket-3 types blended or 
Approved equal DELIVERED & INSTALLED 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

26. Princess 77 Bermudagrass seed or Approved equal 
P/U 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

27. Princess 77 Bermudagrass seed or Approved equal 
Delivered 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

28. Princess 77 Bermudagrass seed or Approved equal 
DELIVERED & INSTALLED 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

29. Clarified Argentine Bahia Grass See (See Specs) or 
Approved equal P/U 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

30. Clarified Argentine Bahia Grass See (See Specs) or 
Approved equal Delivered 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID

31. Clarified Argentine Bahia Grass See (See Specs) or 
Approved equal DELIVERED & INSTALLED 1 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID
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