7 IO THE VILLAGE OF RBE

LLINGTON e

ADVERTISEMENT/INVITATION TO BID

The Village of Wellington Council is accepting sealed bids for ITB #003-26/MM Annual Public Works Contract.

All Bids must be received, no later than December 2, 2025, at which time all Bids will be publicly opened and read via
Zoom (Meeting ID 831 4116 5363 Password v=4Dhd).

Bids may be submitted electronically through the Village of Wellington’s bid portal at www.demandstar.com, now
operating as Euna OpenBids, or delivered/mailed to the Clerk’s Office at the address below.

® Electronic Bids will only be accepted when submitted through www.demandstar.com, now operating as Euna
OpenBids. Emailed submissions will not be accepted.

s Paper Bids (one original and one PDF Copy on a CD or flash drive) are to be delivered to the Clerk’s Office at the
address below. Receipt of a bid by any Wellington Office, Receptionist, or personnel other than the Clerk’s Office
does not constitute “receipt” as required by this solicitation. The Clerk’s Office time stamp shall be conclusive as
to the timeliness of receipt.

The Owner for the Project is Wellington, Florida, (“Owner”).

Bid Documents may be downloaded online at www.demandstar.com, now operating as Euna OpenBids, starting on
November 4, 2025. No bid may be withdrawn for a period of 120 days after the posting of the recommended award as
otherwise provided in Instructions to Bidders.

All paper bids shall be sealed when submitted and be delivered or mailed to:

Wellington
ATTN: Clerk’s Office
12300 Forest Hill Blvd
Wellington, FL 33414

ENVELOPE MUST BE IDENTIFIED AS SEALED BID # 003-26/MM

The Owner reserves the right to accept or reject any or all Bids (in whole or in part) with or without cause, to waive
technicalities, irregularities or informalities, or to accept bids which in its judgment best serve the Owner.

Any and all questions regarding the bidding documents shall be directed to Wellington’s Purchasing Division: Maria
Miserendino, Phone 561-791-4154 or email mmiserendino@wellingtonfl.gov .

Publish: Palm Beach County Legal Notices — https://www.pbcfllegalnotices.com/163/Wellington Date: 11/04/2025




SUBMIT BIDS TO:
Wellington

Attn: Clerk’s Office
12300 Forest Hill Blvd
Wellington, FL 33414

REFER ALL INQUIRIES TO PRIMARY CONTACT:
Purchasing Division

12300 Forest Hill Blvd

Wellington, FL 33414

Phone: 561-791-4154

Wellington

INVITATION TO BID

PHONE NUMBER:

561-791-1953

65-0809915

EMAIL ADDRESS:
estimating@hjcontracting.com

FAX NUMBER:

(561) 795-9282

CGC1506554

COMMODITY/SERVICE
Annual Public Works Contract 003-26/MM
H & J Contracting, Inc
k-] srare
Howell Long 3160 Fairlane Farms Road Wellington 33414 | Florida
Lo VENDOR HEADQUARTERS ADDRESS (7 DiFrEReNT)JlCITY: e sTare
Vice President of Pre-Construction Same as mailing address

STATE OF FLORIDA BUSINESS LICENSE NUMBER (IF APPLICABLE)

lORGANIZATIONAL STRUCTURE (Please Check One):

Corporation @

If Corporation, please provide the following:

(A) Date of Incorporation:

Partnership D

January 30, 1998

Proprietorship D Joint Ve

Month  / Day /

Year

nture D Other D

(B) State or Country of Incorporation:




VA THE VILLAGE OF | -v
ELLINGTON Gl

Council

Michael J. Napoleone, Mayor
Tanya Siskind, Vice Mayor

John T. McGovern, Councilman
Maria Antufia, Councilwoman
Amanda Silvestri, Councilwoman

A GREAT HOMETOWN

Manager
Jim Barnes

ITB No. 003-26/MM

Title: Annual Public Works Contract

Revised New Bid Opening: December 11, 2025 at 11:00 am Local Time
Addendum Date: November 19, 2025

ADDENDUM NO. ONE

PURPOSE: The purpose of this Addendum/NOTICE is to make changes, additions, deletions, revisions, and clarifications
to the Invitation to bid (ITB) documents for the Annual Public Works Contract. Bidders shall review the Addendum

requirements in detail.

1. The Bid Opening Date has changed from December 2, 2025 to December 11, 2025 at 11:00 am Local Time.
All Bids must be received, no later than December 11, 2025 at 11:00 am Local Time, at which time all Bids will
be publicly opened and read via Zoom (Meeting ID: 831 4116 5363Passcode: v=4Dhd)

2. AQuestion: What are the liquidated damages?
Response: The SPECIAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS section has been revised to reflect this information and is
attached to this addendum. The changes to this section are noted in red. Please refer to this section and attach
the signed addendum/revised section to the front of your submitted bid.

3. Question: Is a bid bond required? If so, what is the percentage?
Response: A bid bond is not required with the bid submittal. A Public Construction Bond shall be required for
each project over $200,000, guaranteeing to the Owner the completion and performance of the project
covered in this Contract, as well as full payment of all suppliers, material, laborers, or Subcontractors employed
pursuant to this Project. The bond shall be furnished prior to issuance of the Purchase Order for the project
and shall remain in effect until the project is complete

4. Question: What are the engineers estimate or anticipated estimated annual funding
Response: The Public Works Department anticipates using this project Village-wide for approximately the
amount of $895,000 annually.

5. Question: Is there a pre bid meeting? If so, is it optional or mandatory?

Response: There was not a pre-bid scheduled for this solicitation.

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Proposers must acknowledge receipt of any and all Addenda. Failure to do so may result in
rejection of the ITB. All requirements.of the proposal documents remain unchanged except as cited herein.

7‘/ QM/
Signature of Proposer Acknowledging Receipt of
Addendum No. (1) One to be attached in front of ITB

12300 Forest Hill Boulevard » Wellington, Florida 33414 « (561) 791-4000 « Fax (561) 791-4045
wellingtonfl.gov
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Michacl J. Napoleone, Mayor
Tanya Siskind, Vice Mayor

John T. McGovern, Councilman
Maria Antuiia, Councilwoman
Amanda Silvestri, Councilwoman

A GREAT HOMETOWN

Manager
Jim Barnes

ITB No. 003-26/MM

Title: Annual Public Works Contract

New Bid Opening: December 11, 2025 at 11:00 am Local Time
Addendum Date: December 1, 2025

ADDENDUM NO. TWO

PURPOSE: The purpose of this Addendum/NOTICE is to make changes, additions, deletions, revisions, and clarifications
to the Invitation to bid (ITB) documents for the Annual Public Works Contract. Bidders shall review the Addendum

requirements in detail.

1. Question: Can you clarify whether failure not to bid on all individual line items will result in a
disqualification?
Response: No, bidders, may bid on any or all individual line items as outlined in the Schedule of Values in which
they are licensed and qualified. Bidder should follow the Schedule of Values instructions which states that if
any bid submittal does not contain prices set opposite each of the items for which there is blank space will
then be cause for rejection. Any items not bid upon shall be indicated “NO BID” in place of the price.

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT: Proposers must acknowledge receipt of any and all Addenda. Failure to do so may result in
rejection of the ITB. All requirements of the proposal documents remain unchanged except as cited herein.

/)‘J -/—h/‘z———/"';:-:;::’
Signature of Proposer Acknowledging Receipt of
Addendum No. (2) Two to be attached in front of ITB

12300 Forest Hill Boulevard « Wellington, Florida 33414 « (561) 791-4000 « Fax (561) 791-4045
wellingtonfl.gov



Note: P

YES \/No

YES\/ NO___

YES NO_

ves\/ No__
YES_\_/NO_

YES\/ NO___
YES\/ NO___

YES\_/NO__

lease submit your bid in this order for electronic and paper bids.

YES__\/NO___

1. Bid submittal =

2. Bid Cover Page

3. Acknowledgment of addendums (if any)

4, Bid Submittal Form

5. Schedule of Value

6. Questionnaire

7. Drug Free Workplace

8. Sworn Statement under Section 287.133(3) (a)

9. Certification Pursuant To Florida Statute § 215.4725 and § 287.135

10. Conflict of Interest

11. Non-Collusion Affidavit

12. Insurance Certificates

13. Copy of Appropriate Licenses

14. E-Verify Memorandum of Understanding (MOU)

15. No Coercion for Labor or Services Affidavit

16. Foreign Countries of Concern Affidavit

If submitting a paper bid = one (1) original and one (1) PDF (CD) copy or flash drive
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To:

Village of Wellington
12300 Forest Hill Blvd.

Wellington, Florida 33414

H & J Contracting, Inc

(Vendor)

agrees to provide material and services for the Annual Public Works Contract in accordance with the requirements and specifications
of the Bid Documents for the Village of Wellington as specified.

Gentlemen:

The undersigned Bidder has carefully examined the Specification requirements, Bid/Contract Documents and is familiar with the
nature and extent of the Work and any local conditions that may in any manner affect the Work to be done.

The undersigned agrees to provide the service called for by the Specifications and Bid Documents, in the manner prescribed therein
and to the standards of quality and performance established by the Wellington for the Bid price stated in the spaces herein provided.

The undersigned agrees to the right of the Wellington to hold all Bids and Bid guarantees for a period not to exceed one hundred and
twenty (120) days after the date of Bid opening stated in the Invitation to Bid.

The undersigned accepts the invoicing and payment policies specified in the Bid.

L

Contractor’s Signature

Dated this__11 day of DECEMBER ; 2025

(Month) (Year)
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"~ (FAILURE TO COMPLETE THIS FORM AY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSIVE)
Bidder shall use Attachment #1 (Excel file) when submitting
their bid.

BIDDER/CONTRACTOR understands and agrees that this is Unit Price Contract and that contractor will be paid based upon items and
guantities actually performed and accepted by Owner. Quantities listed on the Schedule of Values are estimates only and are not to
be construed as guaranteed work quantities.

Bidder(s) shall submit a fixed unit price schedule for commodities and/or labor costs crews, workmen, equipment time including
mobilization, etc., and qualifying information.

In order to meet the needs of various departments and the best interest of the Village of Wellingtons, awards shall be made to
responsive, responsible bidders to create a pool of qualified vendors. Bidders may bid on any or all individual line items as outlined in
the Schedule of Values in which they are licensed and gualified. Any Bid submittal which does not contain prices set opposite each of
the items for which there is a blank space will be cause for rejection. Any items not bid upon shall be indicated “NO BID” in place of

the price.
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

*Item #29: Dewatering System — This system shall include up to 400LF of header pipe, well points, swing hoses, vacuum pump (12”),
fuel, oil (all fluids), and all accessories to operate dewatering system along with jet pump and accessories to install all well points.
Hourly rate will be based on actual vacuum pump run time.

*|tems #30 & 31: 6” and 8” submersible hydraulic pumps will come complete with pumphead, hoses up to 400LF of discharge hose,
fuel, and all fluids etc.
*Items #32 & 33: Contractor to provide foreman, personnel and transportation (pickup truck). These crews will work on miscellaneous

projects throughout Wellington such as fence installation/repair, dewatering set ups, trash and debris clean up, light earthwork,
assisting Wellington crews. Pricing/rates shall include —Pickup truck, qualified foreman/crew leader, three (3) to five (5) qualified labors

and all misc. hand tools.
*Items #34 - Prime and/or painting to be done the same day sandblasting is done.

* Items #36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41 & 42: Pipe Installation Crew — These crews shall consist of five (5) persons (1 Backhoe operator, 1 Loader
operator, 2 Pipe layers and 1 Labor). All tools to install pipe/structures shall be furnished by contractor i.e. small plate compactors,
laser beams, transit/level, hand tools cables, chain, fuel, oil and all fluids etc... All personnel on these crews including the two operators
will be skilled at their assigned position. Backhoe and loader will be the proper size to handle excavation, pipe, inlets and accessories
involved in the particular project. Hourly rate shall include costs for all personnel, backhoe, loader tools, and pickup truck etc.

* Items #43, 44, 45, 46, 47 & 48: Directional Bore for each measurement will include all material, equipment, labor, etc. for complete.
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ITEM # DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT UNIT PRICE
1 Long Boom Trac Backhoe (min 50" reach) 1 HR S 216.00
2 Long Boom Rubber tired hoe (min 50' R) 1 HR NO BID
3 Track Backhoe (1 1/2 ¢y min) 1 HR S 216.00
4 Track Backhoe (3/4 yd max - small) 1 HR S 139.00
5 Rubber tired Backhoe/loader 1 HR S 107.00
6 Gradall ( rubber tired) 1 HR S 300.00
7 Small Track hoe - 6 way bucket 1 HR S 139.00
8 Dump Truck - Tri-Axle (18 cy) 1 HR S 130.00
9 Dump Truck - Tandem ( 16 cy) 1 HR S 130.00
10 Dump Truck - Single Axle (8-10 cy) 1 HR S 130.00
11 Off Road Dump Truck (30 cy min) 1 HR S 281.00
12 Off Road Dump Truck (20 cy min) 1 HR S 197.00
13 Skid steer Loader (Bobcat type) 1 HR S 90.00
14 Front end Loader (min 2.5 cy) 1 HR S 198.00
15 Skid Steer Loader Track propelled 1 HR S 90.00
16 Crane (25) Ton 1 HR NO BID
17 Crane (50) Ton 1 HR NO BID
18 Bulldozer (D-4 equivalent) 1 HR S 223.00
19 Grader (9H equivalent) 1 HR S 138.00
20 Box Tractor 1 HR S 83.00
21 Trencher (walk behind) 1 HR S 66.00
22 Trencher (mid-range - drivable) 1 HR S 83.00
23 Vibratory Roller (10 ton min.) 1 HR S 99.00
24 3" Pump w/hoses (Mud hog or trash) 1 HR S 29.00
25 Laser grading (finish grading) 500 SY S 3.00
26 Furnish & install nautral stone Rip-Rap DOT Aopproved 10 TN S 244.00
27 Skilled Laborer 1 HR S 37.00
28 Supervisor 1 HR S 94.00

*29 Dewatering System (well points) 1 HR S 61.00

*30 6" Submersible Hydraulic Pump 1 HR S 38.00

*31 8" Submersible Hydraulic Pump 1 HR S 39.00

*32 3 Person Crew w/pickup truck & foreman 1 HR s 204.00

*33 5 Person Crew w/pickup truck & foreman 1 HR S 278.00

*34 Sand Blasting - Prime and/or painting to be included 1 HR NO BID

35 Furnish, place & compact clean fill (12" liFTs) 500 SY S 12.00

*36 Pipe installation crew (2" to 6" diameter PVC) 1 HR S 518.00

*37 Pipe installation crew (8" to 12" diameter PVC) 1 HR S 595.00

*38 Pipe installation crew (15" to 30" diameter RCP) 1 HR S 595.00

*39 Pipe installation crew (36" to 60" diameter RCP) 1 HR S 595.00
Pipe installation crew (15" to 30" diameter drainage pipe) Hdpe,

i aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated ! iR > =35y
Pipe installation crew (36" - 60" diameter drainage pipe) Hdpe,

81 aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated 4 HR 5 24300
Pipe installation crew (72" to 96” diameter drainage pipe) Hdpe,

"2 aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated, X ik > 63009

%43 D|re_ct|onal Bore 2' diameter pipe-including all material, 1 T $ 48.00
equipment, labor, etc. to complete

%44 Directional Bore 4" diameter pipe-including all material, 1 ET $ 69.00

equipment, labor, etc. to complete




ITEM # DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT UNIT PRICE
x5 Dirgctional Bore 6" diameter pipe-including all material, 1 ET $ 90.00
equipment, labor, etc. to complete
*46 Dire.ctionar Bore 8" diameter pipe-including all material, 1 - $ 108,00
equipment, labor, etc. to complete
%47 Direlctional Bore 10" diameter pipe-including all material, 1 ET $ 132.00
equipment, labor, etc. to complete
%48 Dire-ctional Bore 12" diameter pipe-including all material, " ET 5 573 1)
equipment, labor, etc. to complete
49 Diver with external air source 1 HR NO BID
50 Welding (portable) with complete supplies 1 HR S 168.00
51 Welding Shop 1 HR S 240.00
52 Boom Truck with 25 FT. reach 1 HR NO BID
53 Lowboy capable of hauling heavy equipment 1 HR S 248.00

* Note: See "Specifications" for Specific Line Item Details




The following Questionnaire shall be completed and submitted in with the Bid. By submission of this Bid, Bidder guarantees the truth and accuracy of
all statements and answers herein contained.

How many years has your organization been in business? 27 YEARS

What is the last project of this nature that you have completed? N/A

Have you ever failed to complete work awarded to you? If so, where and why? _ N/A

Name three individuals or corporations for which you have performed work and to which you refer:

DR Horton 6123 Lyons Road Coconut Creek, FL 33073 954-949-3087 kfleonard@drhorton.com
Name Address Phone Email

Verdex 1501 Belvedere Road Suite 200 West Palm Beach. FL 33406 561-440-1600 kyle.castro@verdex.com
Name Address Phone Email

Wellington Lifestyle Partners, LLC 13410 South Shore Blvd Wellington. FL 33414 paigeb@buildz.com
Name Address Phone Email

List the following information concerning all contracts in progress as of the date of submission of this bid. (In case of co-venture, list the information
for all co-venturers.)

Please see|attached

Has the bidder or his or her representative inspected the proposed project and does the Bidder have a complete plan for its performance?
Yes

Will you subcontract any part of this work? If so, give details including a list of each subcontractor(s) that will perform work in excess of the percent
(10%) of the contract amount and the work that will be performed by each subcontractor(s).

All Florida HDD, LLC Directional bore

What equipment do you own that is available for the work? Qver 300 units of heavy equipment in existing fleet

Please see |attached

What equipment will you purchase for the proposed work? _None
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10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

What equipment will you rent for the proposed work? _None

State the name of your proposed project manager and give details of his or her qualifications and experience in managing similar jobs.

Josiah Whitten has over 20 years of experience in managing projects. CBC1254983

The address of principal place of business is _3160 Fairlane Farms Road Wellington. Florida 33414

The names of the Corporate Officers, or Partners, or Individuals doing business under a trade name, are as follows:
Mary Lynn Rusbridge: Director, President. Treasurer, Secretary

Harold D. Rusbridge; Director Meghan Whitten: Vice President Jeremy Rury: Vice President
List all organizations which were predecessors to Bidder or in which the principals or officers of the Bidder were principals or officers.
N/A

List and describe all bankruptcy petitions (Voluntary or Involuntary} which have been filed by or against the Bidder, its parent or subsidiaries or
predecessor organizations during the past five (5) years. Include in the description the disposition of each such petition.
N/A

List and describe all successful Performance or Payment Bond claims made to your surety(ies) during the last five (5) years. The list and descriptions
should include claims against the bond of the Bidder and its predecessor organization(s).
N/A

List all claims, arbitrations, administrative hearings and lawsuits brought by or against the Bidder or its predecessor organization(s) during the last

five (5) years. The list shall include all case names; case, arbitration, or hearing identification numbers; the name of the project over which the

dispute arose; and a description of the subject matter of the dispute.
N/A

List and describe all criminal proceedings or hearings concerning business related offenses in which the Bidder, its principals or officers or
predecessor organization (s) were defendants. N/A

Has the Bidder, its principals, officers, or predecessor organization(s) been debarred or suspended from bidding by any government during the last
five (5) years? If yes, provide details. N/A

List and disclose any and all business relations with any members of Wellington Council. _None
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Total Completed

4/3

Project Contract & Stored to Date %
Name Amount 3 no Retainage-6 Done

Four Seasons @ Parkland 20,316,606.12 19,868,326.62 97 8%
Avenir Phase One 28,647,992.85 27,881,653.14 97.3%
Woodmont Pods B,C.E & G 4,930,530.15 4,895,198.55 99.3%
Parkland Bay Ph 2 Pod F 4,531,691.21 4,399,136.23 97.1%
Avenir Spine Road 1.2 2,806,023.28| 2,522,459.28 89.9%
Avenir Phase Two 36,714,089.29 36,714,089.29 100.0%
Millstone Ranches 1,495,822.46 1,495,822 .46 100.0%
Avenir Spine Road 3 1,501,075.95 1,227,428.95 81.8%
Del Webb Phase 5 1,080,065.00 994,545.00 92.1%
Tradition COD Duda Canal 2,477,160.00 2,477,160.00 100.0%
Enclave at Mangonia 2,514,358.50 2,512,243.50 100.0%
Tradition Parkway 3,449,636.86 3,442,584.27 100.0%
Avenir AS Phase 2 250,392.75 259,382.75 100.0%
Sabal Pointe 3,823,851.94 3,821,461.49 100.0%
Western Groves Ph 5A 6,140,204.19 6,059,536.19 98.7%
LTC Ranch West Residential CDD 22,885,279.42 16,205,117.56 71.3%
Aqua Tec at Iconica Farm 249,750.00 238,091.00 95.3%
60 Blossum Way &1265 S. 523,224 .88 428,6874.88 82.0%
Tradition CD WGB Ph 1&2 4,420,760.00 4,204,471.81 95.1%
Veranda Gardens East Ph.4 1,358,846.25 1,358,846.25 100.0%
Groves Town Center 4,632,743.69 4,551,732.30 98.8%
Southern Grove Wetland 808,065.00 684,989.70 84.8%
Del Webb SB & 6 5,130,077.00 5,090,607.00 99.2%
Merrick Square 6,259,199.14 6,038,785.54 96.5%
Tradition-CD SG4C 3,674,204.95 3,571,294.35 98.1%
Avenir Spine Road 4 4,334,951.00 3,895,594.10 89.9%
Wylder Parkway 6,486,641.93 4523,777.28 74.9%
CDD SG Paar Road 1,531,282.50 1,443,449.05 99.7%
Delray Trails 5,439,446.98 5,239,360.67 96.4%
Pilot Polo 487,384.00 372,814.00 76.5%
Panther National Boulevard 3,128,765.75 3,109,565.75 99.4%
Panther National Pod 12 1,504,238.56 1,305,888.56 86.8%
Panther National Pod 14 1,620,936.38 1,481,285.72 91.4%
60 Blossom Way 6,084,812.59 3,232,173.44 59.0%
Avenir Spine Read Ph 5 3,298,486.11 2,784,130.01 84.4%
Avenir Spine Road Ph 6 1,468,568.35 1,296,627.10 88.3%
Palm Beach State College Dental Medical Bldg 2,972,379.43 2,675,132.44|  100.0%
Tradition SG4C Kenley Amenity Parking Lot 69,000.00 68,650.00 100.0%
The Pines @ Westlake Pod V Earthwork 3,787,625.85 3,292,132.67 96.6%
Del Webb Ph 6 Parking Lot Expansion 353,619.00 318,257.10 100.0%
TIM Tradition Trail Community 277,482.00 248,082.00 89.4%
Rolling Sands 9,474,368.24 9,351,853.24 98.7%
Avenir Town Center Bypass Road 6,172,772.53 5,806,582.19 99.0%
Prima Vista Commons 3,341,158.00| 3,090,572.30 84.7%
Showcase Phase 2 1,939,179.45 1,939,179.45 100.0%
Apex at Avenir Ph One POD 15 4,497,006.30 4,312,458.30 95.9%
Lakeside Landing 2,857,834.15 2,644,972 66 97.4%
Tidewater Ph 2 241,761.00 191,283.45 83.3%
Camelia-Kanner Demo & EW 1,443 561.50 1,369,160.43 99.8%
Avenir Pod 7 919,443.10 642,751.29 77.7%
Green Cay Phase 2 11,348,223.07 5,668,894.97 52.6%
River Oak Mass Grading 1,201,579.40 1,065,850.78 8B8.7%
Panther National Pod 12 Add'l Services 389,003.00 100,000.00 25.7%
Greyhawk Landing 239,080.00 233,980.00 97.9%
Tradition CDD SG Stars & Stripes 2,853,371.00 2,710,702 46 100.0%
Dragonfly 4,119,890.50 3,730,360.20 96.6%
SFWMD Ckeechobee Field Station 5,975,271.45 5,600,070.12 98.7%
Farrell Estates Wellington 3,270,005.18 2,998,219.17 96.5%

63,075.00 63,075.00 100.0%

1422 SE Atlantic Drive




Total Completed

Project Contract & Stored to Date %
Name Amount 3 no Retainage-6 Done

Vintage Oaks 8,326,250.02 3,716,737.20 65.3%
Forest Qaks PH 1B 327,305.00 294,574.50 100.0%
Forest Oaks PH 2 7089,445.00 637,060.50 99.8%
Forest Oaks PH 1A 934,905.00 841,414.50 100.0%
Forest Oaks PH 3 631,985.00 491,305.50 86.4%
PSL Costco Depot Phase 1 9,625,720.24 8,663,148.22 100.0%
Richmond Cove 859,084.40 833,784.40 97.1%
Telare Construction Entry Install 85,040.00 76,536.00 100.0%
Southern Grove Self Storage & Commercial 2,723,751.86 2,238,986.53 91.3%
Paar Road Turn Lanes 464,037.00 0.00 0.0%
Sailfish Cay 2,401,506.00 2,160,005.40 99.9%
SID Park Parcel C-4 1,280,183.00 1,280,183.00 100.0%
Nelson Residence 131,182.00 116,232.00 88.6%
North Road Polo Clearing 1,576,571.00 1,656,914.30 98.8%
Players Pelo Club 5,266,058.00 4,840,641.00 93.8%
Avenir POD 6 Phase 3 698,605.00 590,836.50 94.0%
Forest Oaks Off-Sites Paving 518,002.00 467,101.80 100.0%
Forest Oaks Phase 1B Pod A Paving 306,138.00 246,013.20 89.3%
Forest Oaks Phase 1A Pod C Paving 1,040,258.00 84220272 90.0%
Forest Oaks Phase 2 Pod B Paving 1,076,643.00 793,650.96 81.9%
Forest Qaks Phase 3 Pod C Paving 363,723.00 254,297.70 77.7%
Section 24 Impoundment Expansion 3,911,315.00 3,346,177.14 85.6%
VOW Aquatics Facility 3,589,109.42 3,113,009.35 91.0%
Antica 3,423,877.25 2,849,789.28 95.7%
Panther Maintenance Facility 447 464.25 274,840.20 68.2%
Somerset Avenir 2,101,960.00 1,839,088.71 97.2%
Marigold 4,340,078.06 3,520,175.45 90.1%
NPC Outfall Pipe Repair 108,885.00 108,885.00 100.0%
Heritage Grove 3,855,526.00 2,725,861.49 78.6%
Wellingten Sports Academy 2,174,089.77 2,004,402.42 97.0%
TIM Pathway 696,043.00 614,198.70 98.0%
Tradition Nature Trail 770,330.00 770,330.00 100.0%
Mountain Production Phase 1 1,278,272.00 805,479.30 70.0%
Lotis Wellington Phase 2A 3,939,564.00 3,127,822.20 88.2%
Apex at Avenir Paving Phase Il 2,090,200.50 2,033,773.20 97.3%
Eden at Tradition Lift Station 735,444.00 692,927.80 94.2%
Parkside at Tuttle Royale 3,322,240.60 2,941,374.42 93.2%
NPC Roadwork 344,254.60 344,254.60 100.0%
SFWMD Flight Operations Facility 2,074,567.54 1,253,968.11 63.6%
Cottage District 779,900.56 663,480.59 94.5%
Sandpiper Square {Hunter Lake) 196,500.00 196,500.00 100.0%
Panther National Design Center 149,664.30 118,142.37 87.7%
Bill Moss Hillcrest Paseo Park Soccer Field 443,000.00 381,400.00 86.1%
Tradition-CD SG3 (Telaro) PH2 Final Lift 372,706.00 335,435.40 100.0%
Pierson Rd & South Shore Bivd Readway Improvements 6,397,433.03 2,277,645.77 39.6%
Heron Preserve Phase 2 Final Lift 255,660.00 230,094.00 100.0%
Avenir Parcel D Lake 211,450.00 0.00

Avenir POD 11 Lake 232,450.00 0.00

Dragenfly Industrial Park Phase 2 355,800.00 355,800.00 100.0%
Victory Park Phase 1A Clearing 288,460.00 288,460.00 100.0%
Panther Clubhouse 1,622,385.00 49,189.50 3.4%
Avenir POD 11 Sales Center 65,721.50 59,149.35 100.0%
Frenchmans Creek Irrigation Wells 269,950.00 269,950.00 100.0%
MDI Project Marlin 3,476,206.00 1,720,573.56 55.0%
Avenir POD 21 Mass Grading 296,400.00 266,760.00 100.0%
Amara 3,914,443.00 2,018,835.71 57.3%
Vista Center Expansion 2,559,209.00 1,039,039.98 42.7%
Bowe Gardens Resurface & Restore 695,950.00 23,155.30 3.5%
Saddle Ridge @ Davie 1,650,000.00 62,937.00 4.2%




Total Completed  [[4/3
Project Contract & Stored to Date %
Name Amount 3 no Retainage-6 Done
Ceconut Beulevard Extension 18,441,009.67 4,367,626.64 26.3%
Rural Parkway 551,712.74 551,712.74 100.0%
The Lock Up Wellington 950,870.00 599,708.70 70.1%
The Dunes @ Juno Beach 1,117,553.00 53,029.80 5.3%
Forest Qaks Stacked Blocked Wall 52,920.00 47,628.00 100.0%
Telaro TIM @ Village Parkway 119,050.00 119,050.00 100.0%
Telaro Toulon St. Gelf Cart Access 64,228.50 64,228.50 100.0%
Telaro Heart In The Park 38,760.00 34,884.00 100.0%
Lakeside West 3,659,835.00 1,877,251.50 57.0%
Avenir N-1 Conservation Area 55,840.00 0.0%
Avenir Spine Road Ph Four Paement Top Lift Ph One 62,979.75 52,631.77 92.9%
Avenir Spine Road Five Miscellaneous Improvements 86,796.34 78,116.71 100.0%
Avenir Retangular Rapid Flashing Beacon Assembly 67,700.00 41,175.00 67.6%
Avenir POD 21 - Centerline 309,305.00 278,374.50 100.0%
Avenir POD 21 Earthwork Operations 162,000.00 145,800.00 100.0%
Reserve at Jupiter PH 2 760,650.00 48,720.50 7.3%
River Oak Shoreline Project 258,600.00 232,740.00 100.0%
Saltgrass at Heron Bay 4,362,903.00 183,822.83 4.7%
Heart in the Park Qutside Perimeter Sidewalk 155,875.00 140,377.50 100.0%
Cypress Creek Retail 1,768,630.64 113,368.98 7.1%
Rolling Sands Kanner Offsite 1,700,000.00 213,315.56 13.8%
Avenir Master Infrastructure Misc Improvements 68,428.45 61,585.60 100.0%
Seawalk HOA Rapair Work 32,600.00 29,340.00 100.0%
Avenir POD 21 Lift Station Project Roadway 253,072.25 80,076.32 39.5%
Residences at Lake Worth 1,338,025.00 1,087,272.00 90.3%
Forest Oaks CD Retaining Wall 939,125.00 441,391.95 52.2%
Hilington Farm 141,085.68 141,085.68 100.0%
412,637,221.10 332,710,692.62

Total




A | C | E | F
1 |H & J Equipment Master Listing 2025
Status Make Yr Description
contract

2

3 OTA
4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

13

14

15| Active
16

17 | Active
18| Active
19 Active
20 Active
21 Active
22 Active
23
24 Active
25| Active
26 Active
27 Active
28 Active
29 Active
30 Active
31

32 Active
33 Active
34 Active
35 Active
36 Active
37 Active
38 Active
39 Active
40 Active
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12/11/2025

A C E F
Status Make Yr Description
contract
2
4 | Active
43 | Active
44| Active
45 Actwe
46
47
48 Catermpillar 2018
49 Caterpillar 2021
50 Caterpillar 2021
51 Catermpillar 2021 |[CAT D6LGP
52 Caterpillar 2021
53| Active |[Caterpillar 2021
54 | Active |Catempillar 2021
55| Active |Caterpillar 2021
56| Active [Caterpillar 2021
Active [Caterpillar 2022
57
58| Active |Caterpillar 2022
59 Active |Komatsu 2022
60 | Active |Caterpillar 2022
61| Active |Caterpillar 2022
62 | Active |[Caterpillar 2022
63| Active |Caterpillar 2022 [CAT D5LGPVP
Active |[Caterpillar 2022
64
65 Caterpillar 2022 |CAT D5 LPG W/GPS
66 Catemillar 2022
67 Caterpillar 2022 |CAT D5 LGP W/GPS
68 Komatsu 2023 |[Komatsu D61PX-24 CRAWLER DOZER
69 Active [Caterpillar 2023 |CAT D6VPLGP (GPS)
70 Active |Caterpillar 2024 |CAT D5LGP
71 Active |[Caterpillar 2024
72 Active [Caterpillar CAT D5LGP
73 Active |Caterpillar CAT D5LGP
74 Active [Caterpillar 2024
75 Active |Caterpillar 2024

Page 2



A C E F
Status Make Yr Description
contract
2
76 Active [Caterpillar 2024 |CAT D5LGPVP
77 Active |Caterpillar 2024 |CAT D5LGPVP
78 28
79 OIA VIA
80 Caterpillar 1984 |CAT 936E
81 Caterpillar 2020 |CAT 938M
82 Caterpillar 2020 |CAT 950M
83 | Active [Caterpillar 2021 [CAT 966M
84 Caterpillar 2021 |CAT 938M
85 |Caterpillar 2021 |CAT 950M
86 | Active |Caterpillar 2021 |CAT 938M
87 | Active [Caterpillar 2021 |CAT 950M"
88| Active |Caterpillar 2022 | CAT 938M
89 Caterpillar 2022 |CAT 966M
90 Active [Caterpillar 2022 |CAT 950GC
91| Active [Catempillar 2022 |CAT 938M
92 | Active |Caterpillar 2022 |CAT 938M
93 Caterpillar 2022 |CAT 938M
94 Caterpillar 2022 |CAT938M
95| Active |Catemillar 2023 |CAT938M
96 | Active [Caterpillar 2023 |CAT938M
97 | Active |[Caterpillar 2023 |CAT966GC
98| Active [Catemillar 2024 |CATS50GC
99 | Active |Caterpillar 2024 |CAT 938
100| Active |Caterpillar 2024 [CAT 938
101| Active |Catemillar 2024 |CAT 950
102| Active |Caterpillar 2024 |CAT 938
103]| Active |Caterpillar 2024 [CAT 938
104| Active |Caterpillar 2024 |GAT 950
105| Active |Catempillar 2024 |CAT 950GC
106| Active |Catemillar 2024 |CAT 938
107] Active |Caterpillar 2024 |CAT 938
108| Active |Caterpillar 2025 |CAT 938
109 29
110 OTA i
111 Caterpillar 2006 |CAT 268B
112 Catermpillar 2021 |CAT 289D3
113 Caterpillar 2021 |CAT 289D3
114 Caterpillar 2022 |CAT 299D3XE
115 Caterpillar 2022 |CAT 272D3
116 Caterpillar 2022 |CAT 279D3
117 Catermpillar 2022 |CAT 279D3 (replacing SD-106)
118| Active |Caterpillar 2022 |CAT 289D3
119| Active [Caterpillar 2022 |CAT 289D3
120| Active |Caterpillar 2023 |CAT 289D3
121 Caterpillar 2023 |CAT 289D3
122 Caterpillar 2023 |CAT 289D3
123 Caterpillar 2023 |CAT 289D3
124 Caterpillar 2023 |CAT 289D3
125| Active [Caterpillar 2024 |CAT 289D3
126| Active |Catempillar 2024 |CAT 279D3
127| Active |Caterpillar 2024 |CAT 265-05
128 John Deere 2024 {JD 325G COMPACT TR LOADER
129] Active [Catemillar 2024 [CAT 265-05
130| Active |Catemillar 2025 |CAT 265-05
131 19
132 TOTAL MACHINES
133 Kenworth 2017 |T880
H&J CONTRACTING MASTER EQUIP 2025.xIsx 12/11/2025
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A C E F
Status Make Yr Description
contract
2
134 Kenworth 2018 | T880
135 Kenworth 2018 | T880
136 Kenworth 2018 |T880
137 Kenworth 2018 | T880
138 Kenworth 2018 | T880
139 Kenworth 2018 |T880
140 Kenworth 2018 |T880
141 Kenworth 2018 [T880
142 Kenworth 2018 |T880
143 Kenworth 2018 | T880
144 Kenworth 2025 [T880
145 Kenwaorth 2025 |T880
146 Kenworth 2025 | T880
147 Kenworth 2025 | T880
148 Kenworth 2025 | T880
149 Kenworth 2025 [T880
150
151 OTA A
152
153|
154
155
156
157
158
159
160
161
162
163
164
167 () & )
168 MACK 2004 |2004 CV713 FUEL TRUCK
169 PeterBilt 2010|367 PETERBILT ON RD FUEL TRK Eng: SN LEE14221
170 Volvo 1996 [VOLVO TRACTOR TRAILER OFF RD FUEL TRUCK
171 International 1994 |INTERNATIONAL 4900 ON RD
172 ARMY 1994 [S&S M1081 LMTV OFF RD FUEL TRK
173 ARMY BMY M934A2 5 ton 6x6 OFF RD FUEL TRUCK WAS T-19
174 Kenworth 2021 |[KENWORTH T880 ON RD
175 Kenworth 2021 |KENWROTH T880 ON RD
176 ARMY 1995 |ARMY M1078
177 Kenworth 2024 |Kenworth T880 fuel truck
178 Kenworth 2025 |Kenworth T880 fuel truck
179
180 ; S s OTA A
181 Kenworth
182
183

H&J CONTRACTING MASTER EQUIP 2025.xIsx

12/11/2025
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A C E F
Status Make Yr Description
contract
2
184 Kenworth 2021 | T-880 Kenworth Lowboy
185 Kenworth 2016 | T-800 Kenworth Lowboy
186 Kenworth 2024 |T-880 Kenworth Lowboy
187
188 OT2 A
189| Active [Caterpillar 2023 [CAT 725 2
190| Active |Caterpillar 2024 |CAT 740GC £
191| Active |Catermillar 2024 |CAT 725 g b
192| Active |Caterpillar 2023 |CAT 725 el
193| Active [Caterpillar 2023 |CAT 740GC
104| Active |Caterpillar | 2024 |CAT 725 § e
195| Active [Caterpillar 2024 |CAT 725
196] Active |Caterpillar 2024)|CATIZA0 ¥ ]
197| Active |Caterpillar 2024 |CAT 740 7 B
198| Active |Caterpillar 2024 |CAT 740 B
199| Active |Catemillar | 2024 [CAT 740 A
200| Active [Catemillar 2024 |CAT 740
201 12
202 OTA A
203 Ingram 2000 |INGRAM ROLLER (steel roller)
204 Ingram 2000 |INGRAM 10-12 TON (steel roller)
205 Ingram 2000 [INGRAM 10-12 TON (steel roller) engine s/n 3D177068 1/26/17
206 Ingram 2000 |INGRAM 10-12 TON (steel roller)
207 Caterpillar 2006 |CAT CS 423E
208 Caterpillar 2006 |CAT CS 423E
209 Supertrak 2005 |S3-12 (steel roller)
210 Supertrak 2005 [S3-12 (steel roller)
211 Caterpillar 2007 |CAT CS 423
212 Caterpillar 2008 |CAT CS 423
213 Caterpillar 2014 |CAT CS54B (SHEEP FOOT)
214 Caterpillar 2014 |CAT CS54B (SHEEP FOOT)
215 Caterpillar 2015 |CAT CS56B
216 Caterpillar 2015 |CAT CS44 Vibratory soil compactor
217 Caterpillar 2016 [CAT CS44B
218 Caterpillar 2018 |CAT CS44B
219 Caterpillar 2020 |CAT CS54B with canopy
220 Caterpillar 1989 |INGRAM 12-TON Static Roller (steel roller) cummins engine 481075
221 Ingram 2000 |[INGRAM ROLLER (steel roller) - AKA R-13
222 Caterpillar 2021 |CATCS11GC
223 Caterpillar 2022 [CAT CS34
204 Caterpillar 2022 [CATCS11GC
225| Active |Caterpillar 2022 |CAT CS56B
226 Ingram 1972 |[INGRAM 12 TON (steel roller)
227 Ingram 1977 |INGRAM 12 TON (steel roller)
228 Ingram INGRAM 12T-3W DOUBLE DRUM
229 Ingram INGRAM 3W SINGLE DRUM STATIC
230| Active |Catempillar 2022 |CATCS11GC
231| Active [Catemillar 2023 |CATCS10GC
232| Active |[Catemillar 2023 |CATCS11GC
233| Active |Catemillar 2023 [CAT CS54B (Al-01)
234| Active |Catemillar 2023 |CAT S34
235 Active [Caterpillar 2023 [CAT CS56B
236 22
237
238 Laymor 2004 |LAYMOR SWEEPER RIDER
239 Broce 2014 |BROCE BB250C BROOM - SweeperSefPropelledTowable/Kubota
240 John Deer 2015 |JD 5065E
241 John Deer 2014 |JD 7210R
H&J CONTRACTING MASTER EQUIP 2025.xIsx 12/11/2025
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A C E F
Status Make Yr Description
contract
2
242 Broce 2016 |BROCE BB250C BROOM TOW BEHIND
243 _ |Broce 2016 |BROCE BB250C BROOM TOW BEHIND
244 John Deere 2017 |JD 5065E
245 Broce 2017 |BROCE BW260 BROOM
246 John Deer 2016 |JD 8320R (GPS-56)
247 Broce 2017 |BROCE BW260 BROOM
248 Broce 2017 |BROCE BW260 BROOM
249 John Deer 2017 |JD 5065E ;
250 Broce 2018 |BROCE BREBB250B BROOM
251 Broce 2018 | BROCE BW260 BROOM
252 Broce 2019 |BROCE BW260 BROOM
253 John Deere 2019 |JD 5065E
254 Caterpillar 2018 |BREBBB250B BROOM.
255 John Deere 2020 |JD 6155M
256 John Deere 2022 |JD 5065E
257 Laymor 2022 |LAYMOR SWEEP.
258 John Deere 2021 |JD 9420R
259 Broce 2022 |BB 250-B
260 Laymor 2022 |LAYMOR SWEEPERMASTER 300
261 Laymor 2022 | LAYMOR SWEEPERMASTER 300
262 John Deere 2022 |JD 5065E
263 Laymor 2023 |LAYMOR SWEEPERMASTER 300
264 John Deere 2022 |JD 9R 440 Tractor. i
265 Laymor 2022 LAYM'OR SWEEPERMASTER 300
266 John Deere 2024 |JD 5075 Utility Tractor
267 John Deere 2024 |JD 5075 Utility Tractor.
268 John Deere 2024 |JD 5075 Utility Tractor
269 John Deere 2024 |JD 5075 Utility Tractor
270 John Deere 2025 |JD 5067E Tractor. ]
271| Active |Laymor 2025 |LAYMOR SWEEPER 300
272 SR 5 '
273 OTA
274 Powerscreen 2007 |CHIEFTAIN 2100
275
276 OTA
277
278
279
280
282
283 OTA
- Caterpillar 2016 |CcAT 420F2 IT W/2 bkts & forks
285 Caterpillar 2020 |CAT 420F2 IT
286 John Deere 2021 |JD 310SL
287 Active |Caterpillar 2023 |CAT 420XE
288 3
289 OTA
290 Caterpillar 2015
291 Caterpillar 2017 [CAT 12M3
292 Caterpillar 2017 |CAT 140K
293 Caterpillar 2018 |CAT 140K
294 Active [Catempillar 2021 |CAT 140YQY
H&J CONTRACTING MASTER EQUIP 2025.xIsx 12/11/2025
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2
295 Caterpillar 2023 |CAT 140K-15AWD
296 6
297
298 Powerscreen 2015 |TESAB 10570 JAW

H&J CONTRACTING MASTER EQUIP 2025.xlIsx
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Preference shall be given to businesses with drug-free workplace programs. In order to have a
drug-free workplace program, a business must attest to the following:

1. We publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution,
dispensing, possession, or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying
the actions that will be taken against employees for violations of such prohibition.

2. We inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy
of maintaining a drug-free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee
assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse

violations.

3. We give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are
under Bid a copy of the statement specified in subsection (1).

4. We, in the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of
working on the commodities or contractual services that are under Bid, the employee will abide by
the terms of the statement and will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo
contendere to, any violation of Chapter 893 or of any controlled substance law of the United States
or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days after such

conviction.

5.  We impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or
rehabilitation program if such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so
convicted.

6. We make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through
implementation of this section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, | certify that this firm complies fully with the
above requirements.

Contractor’s Signature

22



THIS FORM MUST BE SIGNED IN THE PRESENCE OF A NOTARY PUBLIC OR OTHER OFFICER AUTHORIZED TO ADMINISTER OATHS.

1

This sworn statement is submitted to Village of wellington
[print name of the public entity]

by H & J Contracting, Inc for Howell Long
[print name of entity submitting sworn statement] [print individual's name and title]

whose business address is 3160 Fairlane Farms Road Wellington. Florida 33414 and (if applicable) its Federal Employer Identification

Number (FEIN) is 65-0809915 (If the entity has no FEIN, include the Social Security Number of the individual signing this sworn

statement: }

I understand that a "public entity crime" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(g), Elorida Statutes, means a violation of any state or federal law by a person with
respect to and directly related to the transaction of business with any public entity or with an agency or political subdivision of any other state or of the United
States, including, but not limited to, any bid or contract for goods or services to be provided to any public entity or an agency or political subdivision of any other
state or of the United States and involving antitrust, fraud, theft, bribery, collusion, racketeering, conspiracy, or material misrepresentation.

| understand that "convicted" or "conviction" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(b), Florida Statutes, means a finding of guilt or a conviction of a public entity
crime, with or without an adjudication of guilt, in any federal or state trial court of record relating to charges brought by indictment or information after
July 1, 1988, as a result of jury verdict, nonjury trial, or entry of a plea of guilty or nolo contendere.

| understand that an "affiliate" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1)(a), Florida Statutes, means:

a. A predecessor or successor of a person convicted of a public entity crime; or

b. An entity under the control of any natural person who is active in the management of the entity and who has been convicted of a public entity crime. The
term "affiliate” includes those officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, and agents who are active in the management
of an affiliate. The ownership by one person of shares constituting a controlling interest in another person, or a pooling of equipment or income among
persons when not for fair market value under an arm's length agreement, shall be a prima facie case that one person controls another person. A person
who knowingly enters into a joint venture with a person who has been convicted of a public entity crime in Florida during the preceding 36 months shall

be considered an affiliate.

I understand that a "person" as defined in Paragraph 287.133(1){c), Elorida Statutes, means any natural person or entity organized under the laws of any state or
of the United States with the legal power to enter into a binding contract and which bids or applies to bid on contracts for the provision of goods or services let
by a public entity, or which otherwise transacts or applies to transact business with a public entity. The term "person" includes those officers, directors, executives,
partners, shareholders, employees, members, and agents who are active in management of an entity.

Based on information and belief, the statement which | have marked below is true in relation to the entity submitting this sworn statement. [Please indicate which
statement applies.]

Neither the entity submitting this sworn statement, nor any officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, em ployees, members, or agents who
are active in management of the entity, nor any affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

The entity submitting this sworn statement, or one or more of the officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents
who are active in management of the entity, or an affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989.

The entity submitting this sworn statement, or one or more of its officers, directors, executives, partners, shareholders, employees, members, or agents
who are active in the management of the entity, or an affiliate of the entity has been charged with and convicted of a public entity crime subsequent to July 1,
1989. However, there has been a subsequent proceeding before a Hearing Officer of the State of Florida, Division of Administrative Hearings and the Final Order
entered by the Hearing Officer determined that it was not in the public interest to place the entity submitting this sworn statement on the convicted vendor list.

[attach a copy of the final order]

| UNDERSTAND THAT THE SUBMISSION OF THIS FORM TO THE CONTRACTING QFFICER FOR THE PUBLIC ENTITY IDENTIFIED IN PARAGRAPH 1 (ONE) ABOVE IS FOR THAT
PUBLIC ENTITY ONLY AND, THAT THIS FORM IS VALID THROUGH DECEMBER 31 OF THE CALENDAR YEAR IN WHICH IT IS FILED. | ALSO UNDERSTAND THAT | AM REQUIRED
TO INFORM THE PUBLIC ENTITY PRIOR TO ENTERING INTO A CONTRACT IN EXCESS OF THE THRESHOLD AMOUNT PROVIDED IN SECTION 287.017, FLORIDA STATUTES

FOR CATEGORY TWO OF ANY CHANGE IN THE INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THIS FORM. . -
P

STATE OF Florida

COUNTY OF Palm Beach

[signature]
/ A / ) / Zuz {
[date]

—
Subscribed and Sworn to (or affirmed) before me on D'CC H 291 by Wg-;) (/U‘{// L(')Né

[date] / inamy

’H_g/she is personally known to me or has presented as identification.

[type of identification]

. CHRISSY L. ARNOLD
i Commission # HH 420088 23
Expires November 9, 2027




CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO FLORIDA STATUTE § 215.4725 and § 287.135

1, Howell Long , on behalf of H & J Contracting, Inc
certifies

Print Name Company Name
that H & J Contracting, Inc

Company Name

4.

Is not engaged in a boycott of Israel; and

Is not on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List ; and

Is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List; and

Is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Iran Terrorism Sectors List; and

Has not engaged in business operations in Cuba or Syria.

P

Signature

Vice President of Pre-Construction

Title

11 December 2025

Date
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This Proposal/Agreement (whichever is applicable) is subject to the conflict of interest provisions of the policies and Code of Ordinances of
WELLINGTON, the Palm Beach County Code of Ethics, and the Florida Statutes. During the term of this Agreement and any renewals or extensions
thereof, the VENDOR shall disclose to WELLINGTON any possible conflicts of interests. The VENDOR’s duty to disclose is of a continuing nature and
any conflict of interest shall be immediately brought to the attention of WELLINGTON. The terms below shall be defined in accordance with the policies
and Code of Ordinances of WELLINGTON, the Palm Beach County Code of Ethics, and Ch. 112, Part Ill, Florida Statutes.

CHECK ALL THAT APPLY.

NO CONFLICT:

[\/To the best of our knowledge, the work contemplated by this agreement would not create a conflict of interest due to the undersigned’s
representation of other clients on projects pending before the Village of Wellington.

M’To the best of our knowledge, the undersigned business has no employment or other contractual relationship with any WELLINGTON employee,
elected official or appointed official.

M’To the best of our knowledge, the undersigned business has no officer, director, partner or proprietor that is a WELLINGTON purchasing agent,
other employee, elected official or appointed official. The term “purchasing agent”, “elected official” or “appointed official”, as used in this paragraph,
shall include the respective individual’s spouse or child, as defined in Ch. 112, Part IIl, Florida Statutes.

M’o the best of our knowledge, no WELLINGTON employee, elected official or appointed official has a material or ownership interest (5% ownership)
in our business. The term “employee”, “elected official” and “appointed official”, as used in this paragraph, shall include such respective individual’s
relatives and household members as described and defined in the Palm Beach County Code of Ethics.

POTENTIAL CONFLICT:

[ 1 The undersigned business, by attachment to this form, submits a list of current clients and projects for which it is currently seeking Village
approval and which may cause a potential conflict of interest due to any of the above listed reasons or otherwise.

THE UNDERSIGNED UNDERSTANDS AND AGREES THAT IT IS INELIGIBLE TO PERFORM WORK ON BEHALF OF THE VILLAGE OF WELLINGTON FOR ANY
OF THE CLIENTS OR PROJECTS LISTED IN THE ATTACHEMENT TO THIS FORM. FAILURE TO DISCLOSE A POSSIBLE CONFLICT OF INTEREST MAY RESULT
IN DISQUALIFICATION OF YOUR BID/PROPOSAL OR IN THE IMMEDIATE CANCELLATION OF YOUR AGREEMENT, WHICHEVER IS APPLICABLE.

H & J Contracting, Inc

COMPANY NAME

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

Howell Long

NAME (PRINT OR TYPE)

Vice President of Pre-Construction

TITLE

Rev. 5.28.2025
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State of Elorida

County of __Palm Beach
Being duly sworn deposes and says:

That he/she is an officer of the parties making the forgoing bid submittal, that the bid is made without prior understanding, agreement,
or connection with any individual, firm, partnership, corporation or other entity submitting a bid for the same materials, services,
supplies or equipment, either directly or indirectly, and is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebatés, or
gratuities are permitted with, prior to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any violation of this provision may
result in disqualification, contract cancellation, return of materials or discontinuation of services, and the possible removal of Bidder
from the vendor Bid lists

H & J Contracting. Inc
Name of Bidder

Howell Long
Print name of designated signatory

ot B

Signature

Vice President of Pre-Construction
Title

On this “ day of !_}& , 20 rgﬁf‘o;e{me appeared ‘yldﬂ/{e// Ldiuﬁ personally known to me to be the person

described in and who executed this A% and acknowledged that (s?e/_he) signed the name freely and voluntarily
for the uses and purposes therein described.
In witness thereof, | have hereunto set my hand and affixed seal the day and year last written above.

(s & et

Signature

Notary Public in and for the State of ,C’('

&, CHRISSY L. ARNOLD

ommission # HH 420088 Cé vicsy L. ﬂl’(ﬂ)du
7

(Name Printed)

Residing at {?@J& &Qé Ca

My commission expires AR/ % 2’09'7

4

(Affix Seal Here)

26



e
ACORD
v

H&JCONT-02
CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

— KKENNEDY

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
31412024

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT:

If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER
CAL Risk Management
23 Eganfuskee Street
Suite 102

GONTACT Suzanne Nelson

AN, xt): (561) 868-6291

| FA% voy:(561) 427-6730

Aoh¥Ess: Snelson@calllc.com

Jupitar, FL 33477 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURER A : Amerisure Insurance Co 19488
INSURED insURER B : Amerisure Mutual Ins Co 23396
H & J Contracting, Inc., JIMP, Inc., Sea-Lynn Marine, Inc, Al
Point Turf, LLC., Sea-Lynn Machinery, Inc insureRr ¢ : Allied World Assurance Company 19489
3160 Fairlane Farms Road INSURER D :
Wellington, FL 33414 INSURERE :
| INSURERF :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TQ WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,

EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

iher TYPE OF INSURANCE fn suer] POLICY NUMBER ASr EEL | (oLICY EXE LIMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENGE s 1,000,000
| cLAMS-MADE OCCUR X CPP21253660001 3/1/2024 | 3172025 |BAMAGETORENTED |, 1,000,000
- MED EXP (Any one person) $ 10,000
— PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | § 1,000,000
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
PoLICY S Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 2,000,000
OTHER: s
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY FOMBINCD SINGLELIMIT. 1o 1,000,000
X | any AUTO X CA21253650001 3M/2024 3/1/2025 | BODILY INJURY (Perperson) | §
| | OWNED SCHEDULED
| | AUTOS ONLY AUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
¥ PROPERTY DAMAGE
| .E'IIJRI'EO% ONLY KS?NO%%EQ (F’e?a:x:idem?A $
PIP . 10,000
B | X |umereraniae | X | occur EACH OCCURRENCE $ 2,000,000
EXCESS LIAB [ CLAIMS-MADE CU21286980002 3M1/2024 3/1/2025 AGGREGATE s 2,000,000
oeo | X [retentions 10,000 )
B |WORKERS COMPENSATION X { PER ‘ { OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY STATUTE ER
primiesinetios e A, L WC21253670002 3112024 | 3M/2025 [ oo " 1,000,000
RFFICERIMEMBER EXCLUDED? | NIA 1,000,000
andatory in NH) E.L DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE § ntniel
If yes, describe under 1.000.000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § it
C |Excess Liability 03112105 31172024 3M/2025 [$3M X $2M 3,000,000
L]

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space Is required)

Certificate holder is included as an additional insured for ongoing & completed operations on the General Liability per form CG7324 0323 as required per
written contract and a designated insured on the Auto Liability to the extent provided per form CA7165 0911. Waiver of subrogation applies to General
Liability Auto and Worker's Compensation when required by written contract. Primary and Noncontributory applies to the General Liability and Auto when
required by written contract. Umbrella Policy & Excess Liability extends over General Liability, Auto Liability and Employers Liability. Cancellation applies as

per policy terms and conditions.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Village of Wellington
12300 Forest Hill Blvd
Wellington, FL 33414

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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E-Verify

Company ID Number: gsg007

ATART,

> &
*
“Nn se.<'°

E-VERIFY IS A SERVICE OF DHS AND SSA

on_ts
va; E
b

Approved by:

Employer
H & J Contracting, Inc

Name (Please Type or Print) Title
Chrissy L Arnold

Signature Date
Electronically Signed 03/26/2013
Department of Homeland Security - Verification Division

Name (Please Type or Print) Title
USCIS Verification Division

Signature Date

03/26/2013

Electronically Signed

Page 13 of 17 E-Verify MOU for Employers | Revision Date 06/01/13



E-Verify

Company ID Number: 56007

Information Required for the E-Verify Program

Information relating to your Company:

H & J Contracting, Inc
Company Name

3160 Fairlane Farms Rd
Wellington, FL 33414

Company Facility Address

Company Alternate Address

County or Parish PALM BEACH

Employer Identification Number 650809915

North American Industry

Classification Systems Code =
Parent Company

Number of Employees 100 to 499
Number of Sites Verified for 2 site(s)

Page 14 of 17 E-Verify MOU for Employers | Revision Date 06/01/13
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E-VERIFY IS A SERVICE OF DHS AND 55A

Company ID Number: g55007

Are you verifying for more than 1site? If yes, please provide the number of sites verified for in each State:

FL
sC 1

Page 15 of 17 E-Verify MOU for Employers | Revision Date 06/01/13
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E-VERIFY IS A SERVICE OF DHS AND $5A

Company ID Number: g55007

Information relating to the Program Administrator(s) for your Company on policy questions or operational
problems:

Name Arnold L Chrissy

Phone Number 5617911953218

Fax 5617959282

Email carnold@hicontractina.com
Name Brenda J Puia

Phone Number 5617911953102

Fax 56179598282

Email Brendapn@hicontracting.com

Page 16 of 17 E-Verify MOU for Employers | Revision Date 06/01/13



NO COERCION FOR LABOR OR SERVICES AFFIDAVIT
(Pursuant to Section 787.06, Florida Statutes)

I Howell Long (name of affiant) of H & J Contracting, Inc

(name of business entity), attest that the following is true:

1. I have personal knowledge of the facts in this Affidavit and am of legal age and of

no disability and have the authority to make the statements contained herein.

2. I am the officer or representative of the nongovernmental business entity named

below and make this Affidavit to comply with section 787.06, Florida Statutes.

3 The business entity does not use coercion for labor or services as defined in section

787.06, Florida Statutes.

4. I understand that I have a continuing obligation to notify the Village of Wellington

if the status of the business entity changes.

Under penalty of perjury, I declare that I have read the foregoing Affidavit and that

the facts stated in it are true.

Affiant Name: Howell Long -

Signature: =k -/2/1;

Title: Vice President of Pre-Construction

Business Entity Name: H & J Contracting, Inc

Date: 11 December ,20 25

Rev. 8.4.25
29



FOREIGN COUNTRIES OF CONCERN AFFIDAVIT
(Pursuant to Section 287.138, Florida Statutes)

| Howell Long (name of affiant) of H & J Contracting. Inc

(name of business entity), attest that the following is true:
L, I have personal knowledge of the facts in this Affidavit and am of legal age and of
no disability and have the authority to make the statements contained herein.
2. [ am the officer or agent of the business entity named below and make this Affidavit
to comply with section 287.138, Florida Statutes.
3 I certify that the business entity named below does not provide access to an
individual’s personal identifying information to any entity that:
a) is owned by the government of a foreign country of concern;
b) has provided a foreign country of concern a controlling interest; or
¢) isorganized under the laws of or has its principal place of business in a
foreign country of concern.
4. [ understand that I have a continuing obligation to notify the Village of Wellington

if the status of the business entity changes.

Under penalty of perjury, I declare that I have read the foregoing Affidavit and that

the facts stated in it are true.

Affiant Name: Howell Long _
Signature: - Mﬂé_c«

Title: vVice President of Pre-Construction

Business Entity Name: H & J Contracting, Inc

Date: 11 December ,20 25

Rev. 8.4.25
30



