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ANNUAL PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACT - ITB #202101

Description
TRACK BACKHOE (1 1/2 CY MIN) 1.00
TRACK BACKHOE (3/4 YD MAX - SMALL) 1.00
RUBBER TIRED BACKHOE/LOADER 1.00
GRADALL ( RUBBER TIRED) 1.00
DUMP TRUCK - TRI-AXLE (18 CY) 1.00
DUMP TRUCK - TANDEM ( 16 CY) 1.00
DUMP TRUCK - SINGLE AXLE (8-10 CY) 1.00
OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK (30 CY MIN) 1.00
OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK (20 CY MIN) 1.00
SKID STEER LOADER (BOBCAT TYPE) 1.00
FRONT END LOADER (MIN 2.5 CY) 1.00
SKID STEER LOADER TRACK PROPELLED 1.00
BULLDOZER (D-4 EQUIVALENT) 1.00
GRADER (9H EQUIVALENT) 1.00
VIBRATORY ROLLER (10 TON MIN.) 1.00
SKILLED LABORER 1.00
SUPERVISOR 1.00
3 PERSON CREW W/PICKUP TRUCK & FOREMAN 1.00
5 PERSON CREW W/PICKUP TRUCK & FOREMAN 1.00
LONG BOOM TRAC BACKHOE (MIN 50' REACH) 1.00
LONG BOOM RUBBER TIRED HOE (MIN 50' R) 1.00
SMALL TRACK HOE - 6 WAY BUCKET 1.00
CRANE (25) TON 1.00
CRANE (50) TON 1.00
BOX TRACTOR 1.00
TRENCHER (WALK BEHIND) 1.00
TRENCHER (MID-RANGE - DRIVABLE) 1.00
3" PUMP W/HOSES (MUD HOG OR TRASH) 1.00
LASER GRADING (FINISH GRADING) 500.00
FURNISH & INSTALL NATURAL STONE RIP-RAP DOT 10.00
APPROVED
DEWATERING SYSTEM (WELL POINTS) 1.00
6" SUBMERSIBLE HYDRAULIC PUMP 1.00
8" SUBMERSIBLE HYDRAULIC PUMP 1.00
SAND BLASTING - PRIME AND/OR PAINTING TO BE 1.00
INCLUDED
FURNISH, PLACE & COMPACT CLEAN FILL (12" LIFTS) 500.00
PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (2" TO 6" DIA. PVC) 1.00
PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (8" TO 12" DIA. PVC) 1.00
PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (15" TO 30" DIA. RCP) 1.00
PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (36" TO 60" DIA. RCP) 1.00
PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (15" TO 30" DIA. 1.00
DRAINAGE PIPE) HDPE, ALUMINUM, CMP, PVC,
PERFORATED
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MARCINKOSKI
GRADALL, INC.

$165.00
$150.00
$120.00
$113.00

$97.00

$97.00

$72.00
$260.00
$210.00
$120.00
$125.00
$125.00
$150.00
$180.00
$110.00

$40.00

$65.00
$170.00
$240.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

Quantity Unit Unit Price Sub Total

$165.00
$150.00
$120.00
$113.00

$97.00

$97.00

$72.00
$260.00
$210.00
$120.00
$125.00
$125.00
$150.00
$180.00
$110.00

$40.00

$65.00
$170.00
$240.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

MURRAY LOGAN
CONSTRUCTION, LLC.

Unit Price  Sub Total

$180.00
$140.00
$85.00
NO BID
$85.00
$85.00
$85.00
$250.00
$250.00
$80.00
$110.00
$75.00
$200.00
NO BID
$80.00
$60.00
$80.00
$225.00
$345.00
$200.00
$250.00
NO BID
$175.00
$225.00
$90.00
NO BID
NO BID
$35.00
NO BID
$140.00

$75.00
$50.00
$60.00
NO BID

$10.00

$500.00
$500.00
$600.00
$700.00
$600.00

$180.00
$140.00
$85.00
NO BID
$85.00
$85.00
$85.00
$250.00
$250.00
$80.00
$110.00
$75.00
$200.00
NO BID
$80.00
$60.00
$80.00
$225.00
$345.00
$200.00
$250.00
NO BID
$175.00
$225.00
$90.00
NO BID
NO BID
$35.00
NO BID
$140.00

$75.00
$50.00
$60.00
NO BID

$10.00

$500.00
$500.00
$600.00
$700.00
$600.00

RENEWAL 1/11/2025-1/11/2026

HINTERLﬁchD GROUP, c ODNSSTI;ZR?J}E:I%SON
CORP.
Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total

$146.50 $146.50 $160.00 $160.00
$99.62 $99.62 $130.00 $130.00
$87.90 $87.90 NO BID NO BID
$140.64 $140.64 NO BID NO BID
$105.48 $105.48 $100.00 $100.00
$93.76 $93.76 $100.00 $100.00
$87.90 $87.90 NO BID NO BID
$175.80 $175.80 NO BID NO BID
$164.08 $164.08 NO BID NO BID
$76.18 $76.18 NO BID NO BID
$99.62 $99.62 $110.00 $110.00
$58.60 $58.60 $110.00 $110.00
$99.62 $99.62 $200.00 $200.00
$111.34 $111.34 $200.00 $200.00
$76.18 $76.18 $80.00 $80.00
$52.74 $52.74 $60.00 $60.00
$99.62 $99.62 $120.00 $120.00
$175.80 $175.80 $200.00 $200.00
$293.00 $293.00 $300.00 $300.00
$187.52 $187.52 $250.00 $250.00
$263.70 $263.70 NO BID NO BID
$87.90 $87.90 NO BID NO BID
$234.40 $234.40 NO BID NO BID
$410.20 $410.20 NO BID NO BID
$87.90 $87.90 NO BID NO BID
$58.60 $58.60 NO BID NO BID
$82.04 $82.04 NO BID NO BID
$23.44 $23.44 $40.00 $40.00
$3.52 $3.52 $5.00 $5.00
$111.34 $111.34 $200.00 $200.00
$99.62 $99.62 $60.00 $60.00
$52.74 $52.74 $50.00 $50.00
$76.18 $76.18 $60.00 $60.00
$293.00 $293.00 NO BID NO BID
$11.72 $11.72 $15.00 $15.00
$328.16 $328.16 $400.00 $400.00
$351.60 $351.60 $400.00 $400.00
$380.90 $380.90 $400.00 $400.00
$445.36 $445.36 $450.00 $450.00
$351.60 $351.60 $400.00 $400.00

FERREIRA
CONSTRUCTION
COMPANY, INC.

Unit Price  Sub Total

$239.00
$154.25
$127.85
$174.45
$174.25
$174.25
$165.10
$196.10
$188.10
$110.30
$133.95
$110.30
$130.05
$195.10
$112.95
$54.15
$71.95
$274.30
$379.30
$211.65
NO BID
$255.90
$234.10
$332.30
$95.50
$98.95
$141.50
$59.35
$1.55
$130.75

$97.95
$67.05
$96.00
NO BID

$14.80

$490.55
$490.55
$500.45
$639.75
$500.45

$239.00
$154.25
$127.85
$174.45
$174.25
$174.25
$165.10
$196.10
$188.10
$110.30
$133.95
$110.30
$130.05
$195.10
$112.95
$54.15
$71.95
$274.30
$379.30
$211.65
NO BID
$255.90
$234.10
$332.30
$95.50
$98.95
$141.50
$59.35
$1.55
$130.75

$97.95
$67.05
$96.00
NO BID

$14.80

$490.55
$490.55
$500.45
$639.75
$500.45

FOSTER MARINE
CONTRACTORS, INC.

Unit Price  Sub Total

$150.00
$115.00
$85.00
$175.00
$75.00
$75.00
$50.00
$190.00
$170.00
$85.00
$150.00
$85.00
$135.00
$125.00
$90.00
$40.00
$75.00
$250.00
$350.00
$250.00
$250.00
$175.00
$250.00
$300.00
$80.00
$60.00
$68.00
$35.00
$8.00
$250.00

$100.00
$50.00
$75.00
$400.00

$13.00

$400.00
$475.00
$550.00
$600.00
$550.00

$150.00
$115.00
$85.00
$175.00
$75.00
$75.00
$50.00
$190.00
$170.00
$85.00
$150.00
$85.00
$135.00
$125.00
$90.00
$40.00
$75.00
$250.00
$350.00
$250.00
$250.00
$175.00
$250.00
$300.00
$80.00
$60.00
$68.00
$35.00
$4,000.00
$2,500.00

$100.00
$50.00
$75.00
$400.00

$6,500.00

$400.00
$475.00
$550.00
$600.00
$550.00
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ANNUAL PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACT - ITB #202101

Description

PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (36" - 60" DIA. DRAINAGE
PIPE) HDPE, ALUMINUM, CMP, PVC, PERFORATED

PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (72" TO 96" DIA.
DRAINAGE PIPE) HDPE, ALUMINUM, CMP, PVC,
PERFORATED,

DIVER WITH EXTERNAL AIR SOURCE

WELDING (PORTABLE) WITH COMPLETE SUPPLIES
WELDING SHOP

BOOM TRUCK WITH 25 FT. REACH

LOWBOY CAPABLE OF HAULING HEAVY EQUIPMENT

Directional Bore 2' diameter pipe
Directional Bore 4" diameter pipe
Directional Bore 6" diameter pipe
Directional Bore 8" diameter pipe
Directional Bore 10" diameter pipe

Directional Bore 12" diameter pipe

1.00

1.00

1.00
1.00
1.00
1.00
1.00

1.00
1.00
1.00
1.00
1.00
1.00

HR

HR

HR
HR
HR
HR
HR

FT
FT
FT
FT
FT
FT

MARCINKOSKI
GRADALL, INC.

Quantity Unit Unit Price Sub Total

MURRAY LOGAN
CONSTRUCTION, LLC.

Unit Price  Sub Total

RENEWAL 1/11/2025-1/11/2026

HINTERLAND GROUP,
INC

Unit Price  Sub Total

FOSTER MARINE
CONTRACTORS, INC.

Unit Price  Sub Total

NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

$700.00 $700.00
$800.00 $800.00
NO BID NO BID
$100.00 $100.00
$100.00 $100.00
$100.00 $100.00
$200.00 $200.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

$427.78 $427.78
$492.24 $492.24
$527.40 $527.40
$111.34 $111.34
$93.76 $93.76
$128.92 $128.92
$175.80 $175.80
$44.54 $44.54
$52.74 $52.74
$58.60 $58.60
$67.98 $67.98
$87.90 $87.90
$105.48 $105.48

D.S. EAKINS
CONSTRUCTION
CORP.

Unit Price  Sub Total
$450.00 $450.00
$500.00 $500.00
NO BID NO BID
$180.00 $180.00
$130.00 $130.00
NO BID NO BID
$200.00 $200.00
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID

FERREIRA
CONSTRUCTION
COMPANY, INC.

Unit Price  Sub Total
$639.75 $639.75
$769.35 $769.35
$298.05 $298.05
$146.45 $146.45

$87.30 $87.30
$148.45 $148.45
$217.35 $217.35
$16.75 $16.75
$23.90 $23.90
$32.10 $32.10
$73.50 $73.50
$87.40 $87.40
$144.35 $144.35

$600.00 $600.00
$800.00 $800.00
$400.00 $400.00
$150.00 $150.00
$100.00 $100.00
$75.00 $75.00
$200.00 $200.00
$20.00 $20.00
$30.00 $30.00
$40.00 $40.00
$50.00 $50.00
$65.00 $65.00
$90.00 $90.00




