Supply and Delivery of Road Base and Asphalt Millings

"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers

BID OPENING DATE: May 22,2025

received timely as of the above receiving date and time.

"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers
received timely as of the above receiving date and time.

"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers
received timely as of the above receiving date and time.

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers
received timely as of the above receiving date and time.

"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers
received timely as of the above receiving date and time.

BID OPENING TIME: 11:00 AM (local time) All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation. Al other offers submitted in response to this solicitation.
|TB #202517 if any, are hereby rejected as late" if any, are hereby rejected as late" if any, are hereby rejected as late" if any, are hereby rejected as late" if any, are hereby rejected as late"
VENDOR Palm Beach Aggregates, LLC. AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING INC. D.S. EAKINS CONSTRUCTION CORP JUD SOLUTION,LLC GREEN DREAM INTERNATIONAL,LLC

1. Bid submittal-If submitting a paper bid -> (1) original and one (1) PDF (CD) Copy YES YES YES YES YES

2. Bid Cover Page YES YES YES YES YES

3. Acknowledgement of Addendums 1 & 2 YES YES YES YES YES

4.Bid Submittal Form YES YES YES YES YES

5.Schedule of Value YES YES YES YES YES

6. Questionnaire YES YES YES YES YES

7. Drug Free Workplace YES YES YES YES YES

8. Sworn Statement under Section 287.133(3) (a) YES YES YES YES YES

9. Certification Pursuant To Florida Statute § 215.4725 and 287.135 YES YES YES YES YES

10. Conflict of Interest Statement YES YES YES YES YES

11. Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES YES YES YES

12. Insurance Certificates YES YES YES YES YES

13. Copy of Appropriate Licenses YES YES YES YES YES

14. E-Verify Memo of Understanding (MOU) YES YES YES YES YES

15.No Coercion for Labor or Services Affidavit YES YES YES YES YES

16. Samples - Properly Labeled YES YES YES NO NO




BID TABULATION

BID NO: 202517

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ROAD BASE AND ASPHALT MILLINGS

D.S. EAKINS GREEN DREAM
PALM BEACH |AUSTIN TUPLER JUuD
AGGREGATES, LLC | TRUCKING INC. | CONSTRUCTION | 56, yioN L c | INTERNATIONAL
Bid Opening Date: May 22, 2025 at 11:00 AM Local Time ’ Vendor Award Types
Primary Secondary
Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Vendor Vendor Tertiary Vendor
11345 | Supply and Delivery of Road Base 1.00 ™ $24.55 $28.15 No Bid Non-Responsive/ | Non-Responsive/ Palm Beach | Austin Tupler N/A
No Samples No Samples .
Aggregates,LLC| Trucking,INC.
11346 | Pick up Road Base with Wellington Vehicle 1.00 TN $18.00 No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid Palm Beach N/A N/A
Aggregates,LLC
12387 |Type Il DOT Road Base Delivered 1.00 TN $24.55 $30.15 No Bid $36.25 No Bid Palm Beach Austin Tupler ~ [Jud Solution, LLC
Aggregates,LLC| Trucking,INC.
: . Austin Tupler Palm Beach :
11347 [ Supply and Delivery of #57 Rock 1.00 N $41.60 $36.65 No Bid $51.25 $46.74 Trucking,INC. | Aggregates,LLC Jud Solution, LLC
11348 | Pick up of #57 Rock at Pit with Wellington Vehicle 1.00 TN $35.05 No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid Palm Beach N/A N/A
Aggregates,LLC
11843 |Rip Rap 6' to 12' Boulder with Wellington Vehicle 1.00 TN $48.80 No Bid No Bid Non-Responsive No Bid Palm Beach N/A N/A
Aggregates,LLC
11349 | Supply and Delivery of RCA ( Recycled Conarete 1.00 ™ No Bid $31.75 $26.50 $29.00 No Bid Comstruction | Jud Solution, LLC | Austin Tupler
Aggregate) - ( Or Equal Product) . : : . Corp ’ Trucking,INC.
11350 | Fickup of RCA (Recycled Concrete Aggregate) - 1.00 ™ No Bid Non-Responsive $18.00 Non-Responsive No Bid Comstructon N/A N/A
(Or Equal Product)at Pit with Wellington Vehicle : P - P Corp
. - . Non-Responsive/ : Austin Tupler D.S. Eakins
11844 | Supply and Delivery of Asphalt Millings 1.00 CcY No Bid $30.70 $32.00 No Samples No Bid Trucking,INC. | Construction Corp N/A
D.S. Eakins
11845 | Pick up of Asphalt Millings with Wellington Vehicle 1.00 CcY No Bid Non-Responsive $22.00 Non-Responsive No Bid Construction N/A N/A
Corp
Legend:

Green Highlight = Lowest responsive/responsible bidder

Non-Responsive = Vendor failed to meet one or more mandatory requirements of the solicitation (e.g., missing required samples, bidding under the 25-mile radius category without meeting the distance requirement).
No Samples = Vendor did not submit required product samples as outlined in the solicitation.

No Bid = Vendor did not provide pricing for this specific item.

Primary Vendor:The vendor offering the lowest responsive and responsible bid for the line item. This vendor is designated as the first choice for award and will be used unless performance issues arise.
Secondary Vendor:The vendor offering the next-lowest responsive bid. This vendor serves as a backup and may be used if the primary vendor is unable to perform, fails to deliver, or becomes non-compliant.
Tertiary Vendor: The vendor with the third-lowest responsive bid, designated as an additional backup option if both the primary and secondary vendors are unavailable or unable to fulfill the requirement.




