
Bid Tabulation

ITB #019-15/ENR

Item Description Unit 

Estimated 

Quantity

Product & Pack 

Size Unit Price Total 

Product & Pack 

Size Unit Price Total 

Product & 

Pack Size Unit Price Total 

Product & 

Pack Size Unit Price Total 

Product & 

Pack Size Unit Price Total 

1.  Liquid Biological Larvicide 

(al. Bti) or approved 

alternate (2.5 Gal. – 

preferred size) Gal. 55

Aquabac XT liquid 

larvicide - 2x2.5 

gl. case

$33.45 $1,839.75
VectoBac 12AS - 

2x2.5 gl.case

$30.79 $1,693.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.  Granular Biological 

Larvicide (al. Bti) or 

approved alternate LB. 400

Aquabac 200 G 

Granular - 40 lb. 

bag

$1.61 $644.00 VectoBac GS - 40 

lb. bag

$1.71 $684.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Sustain MGB  -  

40 lb. 

$7.40 lb. = 

$296 for 40 

lb. pack

$2,960 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.  Permanone 4-8 (Ready to 

Use) or approved alternate  

55 Gal. 

Drum 550 Gals.

Permanone RTU 4-

8  -  30 gl. drum

$32.50 $17,875.00
*Anvil 2+2  -  55 

gal. drum

$41.97 gal 

= $2,308.35 

for 55 gal. 

drum

$23,083.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Evolver 4-4 

RTV  -  55 gal. 

$26.00 gal. 

= $1,430 for 

55 gal. 

drum

$14,300.00

Genesis 

Omega RTU - 

4 drums to a 

pallet

$55.00 $30,250.00

4.  Permethrin – Evoluer 4-4 

(Ready to Use) or approved 

alternate

55 Gal. 

Drum 550 Gals.

Pursuit 4.6 ULV 4-

4 Ready to Use  -  

55 gal. drum

$19.65 $10,807.50
*BioMist 4+4  -  

55 gal. drum

$25 gal. = 

$1,375 for 

55 gal. 

drum

$13,750.00
Kontrol 4-4  -  

55 Dr. gal. 
$17.50 $9,625.00

Permethrin - 

Evoluer 4-4  -  

55 gal.

$26.00 gal. 

= $1,430 for 

55 gal. 

drum

$14,300.00

Genesis 

Omega 

Consintrate - 

4 drums to a 

pallet

$120.00 $66,000.00

5.  Altosid XR Briquettes or 

approved alternate (220 a 

case – preferred size) Case 20

Altosid XR 

Briquettes - 220 a 

case

 $697.40* $13, 948*
Altosid XR 

Briquettes - 220 

a case

$697.40 $13,948.00
Altosid XR 

Briquettes - 

220 a case

$697.40 $13,948 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MCES, LLC

Application Dynamics/Inspire 

IndustriesUnivar USA, Inc. Adapco, Inc. Clarke Mosquito


