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March 11, 2026

Howard Fertilizer and Chemicals, Inc.
P. O. Box 628202

Orlando, FL 32862
MMAGGIO@HOWARDFERT.COM

Re: ITB# 202403 - Purchase and Delivery for Public Works Chemicals
Dear Mr. Maggio,

Howard Fertilizer and Chemicals, Inc. (AWARDEE) is an awardee for contract # ITB# 202403 — Purchase
and Delivery for Public Works Chemicals. The contract is set to expire on May 13, 2026 and allows for two
(2) additional one (1) year renewals by mutual agreement. Wellington would like to exercise the second
renewal option through May 13, 2027 under the same terms and conditions as stipulated on Page 11 of the
referenced ITB which is conditioned upon subsequent approval by Wellington Council.

The award/renewal is subject to provisions of State Statutes, Palm Beach County Commission on Ethics and
Code of Ethics, and Wellington policies. All Awardees must disclose with their Renewal the name of any
officer, director, or agent who is also a Wellington employee. Further, all Awardees must disclose the name
of any Wellington employee who is employee in the Awardees firm or any of its branches.

If AWARDEE violates or is a party to a violation of the Wellington, Palm Beach County or Florida Code of
Ethics with respect to this Renewal, AWARDEE may be disqualified from performing the work described in
this Renewal or from furnishing the goods or services for which the AWARDEE submitted and shall be further
disqualified from bidding on any future Proposals/Bids for work or for goods or services for Wellington. A
copy of the Wellington, Palm Beach County Commission on Ethics and Code of Ethics and State Ethics Codes
is available at the Wellington Clerk’s Office, 12300 Forest Hill Boulevard, Wellington, FL 33414. By signing
this Renewal Agreement, AWARDEE acknowledges no such conflict.

AWARDEE shall not unlawfully discriminate against any person in its operation and activities or in its use or
expenditure of funds in fulfilling its obligations under this Agreement. AWARDEE shall affirmatively comply
with all applicable provisions of the Americans with Disabilities Act {ADA) in the course of providing any
services funded by this Agreement, including Titles I and II of the ADA (regarding nondiscrimination on the
basis of disability), and all applicable regulations, guidelines, and standards. In addition, AWARDEE shall
take affirmative steps to ensure nondiscrimination in employment against disabled persons. Such actions shall
include, but not be limited to, the following: employment, upgrading, demotion, transfer, recruitment or
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recruiting advertising, layoff, termination, rates of pay, other forms of compensation, terms and conditions of
employment, training (including apprenticeship) and accessibility.

AWARDEE's decisions regarding the delivery of services under this Agreement shall be made without regard
to or consideration of race, age, religion, color, gender, sexual orientation, gender identity, gender expression,
national origin, marital status, physical or mental disability, political affiliation, or any other factor which
cannotbe lawfully used as a basis for service delivery.

Please indicate acceptance or rejection of the renewal and return to my attention by March 18, 2026

If you should have any questions, please contact me or anyone else in the Purchasing Department.

C-‘ Ffoe""ed NCreaseS
> Accept Renewal: Michaed (MNagate /Seles VN 44; ’;Z 3 / 1L / 2026
Printed Name/Title” Signature Date

Reject Renewal:

Printed Name/Title Signature Date

Thank you,
Tisa Bracey
561-791-4112

tbracey@wellingtonfl.gov

12300 Forest Hill Boulevard « Wellington, Florida 33414 « (561) 791-4000 « Fax (561) 791-4045
www.wellingtonfl.gov

s Sl

e



CONFLICT OF INTEREST STATEMENT

This renewal is subject to the conflict of interest provisions of the policies and Code of Ordinances of
WELLINGTON, the Palm Beach County Code of Ethics, and the Florida Statutes. During the term of this
Agreement and any renewals or extensions thereof, the VENDOR shall disclose to WELLINGTON any
possible conflicts of interests. The VENDOR’s duty to disclose is of a continuing nature and any conflict of
interest shall be immediately brought to the attention of WELLINGTON. The terms below shall be defined in
accordance with the policies and Code of Ordinances of WELLINGTON, the Palm Beach County Code of
Ethics, and Ch. 112, Part III, Florida Statutes.

CHECK ALL THAT APPLY.

NO CONFLICT:

[\/T To the best of our knowledge, the work contemplated by this agreement would not create a conflict of
interest due to the undersigned’s representation of other clients on projects pending before the Village of

V\V;Hington.
[V] To the best of our knowledge, the undersigned business has no employment or other contractual
relagionship with any WELLINGTON employee, elected official or appointed official.

[ To the best of our knowledge, the undersigned business has no officer, director, partner or proprietor
that is a WELLINGTON purchasing agent, other employee, elected official or appointed official. The term
“purchasing agent”, “elected official” or “appointed official”, as used in this paragraph, shall include the
respective individual’s spouse or child, as defined in Ch. 112, Part III, Florida Statutes.

[\/f To the best of our knowledge, no WELLINGTON employee, elected official or appointed official has
a material or ownership interest (5% ownership) in our business. The term “employee”, “elected official” and
“appointed official”, as used in this paragraph, shall include such respective individual’s relatives and
household members as described and defined in the Palm Beach County Code of Ethics.

POTENTIAL CONFLICT:

[ 1 The undersigned business, by attachment to this form, submits a list of current clients and projects for
which it is currently seeking Village approval and which may cause a potential conflict of interest due to any of
the above listed reasons or otherwise.

THE UNDERSIGNED UNDERSTANDS AND AGREES THAT IT IS INELIGIBLE TO PERFORM WORK ON BEHALF OF THE VILLAGE
OF WELLINGTON FOR ANY OF THE CLIENTS OR PROJECTS LISTED IN THE ATTACHEMENT TO THIS FORM. FAILURE TO
DISCLOSE A POSSIBLE CONFLICT OF INTEREST MAY RESULT IN DISQUALIFICATION OF YOUR BID/PROPOSAL OR IN THE
IMMEDIATE CANCELLATION OF YOUR AGREEMENT, WHICHEVER IS APPLICABLE.

Howe 4 Fe,('\L \\\zer

COMPANY NAME
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5/13/2025 through 5/13/2026

HOWARD FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL, LLC

" Unit Price Unit Price
Item # Item Description Pack Size lVle:a“st?:e LI:::: f(tlar:cEI:::I AESIIi\c:éIIL) Based on Totzaslllz’?ice ::I/CZ: Based on Unit lz?erﬁ: A:j:]csy
Products) uom uom
Change
Request

Chemicals (No agricultural grade fertilizers will

be accepted) Key
12248 |0-0-22 Kmag (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.30 $15.00| 40.00% 0.420 $21.00
12249  |12-2-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 25GL 2.5GL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12250  |12-2-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12251 |15-0-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 25GL 2.5GL LPI $27.26 $27.26| 10.00% 29.980 $29.98
12252  |15-0-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $2,356.12| $2,356.12| 10.00% 2,591.730[  $2,591.73]
12253  |15-0-15 w/.67% Ronstar (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.60 $30.00|  40.00% 0.840 $42.00
12254 |15-0-15 w/merit (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.60 $30.00| 40.00% 0.840 $42.00
12255  |16-0-8 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.30 $15.00| 40.00% 0.420 $21.00
12256 |16-2-16 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.38 $19.00| 40.00% 0.532 $26.60
12257 |16-2-16 with Methalated Urea (specific blend) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.45 $22.50[ 40.00% 0.630 $31.50
12258  |18-0-18 with Dimension (specific blend) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.70 $35.00| 40.00% 0.980 $49.00
12259  |18-3-6 Liquid Fert (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5GL LPI $25.53 $25.53|  10.00% 28.080 $28.08
12260 |18-3-6 Liquid Fert (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $2,176.72]|  $2,176.72] 10.00% 2,394.390|  $2,394.39
12261 |20-0-10 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD NA NA NA
12262 |21-0-0 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.28 $14.00| 40.00% 0.392 $19.60
12263 |24-2-11 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.36 $18.00| 40.00% 0.504 $25.20
12264  |30-0-0 Liquid Fert (no substitution) 25GL 25GL LPI $27.83 $27.83|  10.00% 30.610 $30.61
12265  |30-0-0 Liquid Fert (no substitution) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $2,380.04| $2,380.04| 10.00% 2,618.040|  $2,618.04]
12266 |400 High Mn (no substitution) 2.5GL 25GL LPI NA NA NA
12267 |400 High Mn (no substitution) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $1,937.52|  $1,937.52] 10.00% 2,131.270|  $2,131.27]
12268  |8-2-12 (specific blend) *see Specifications 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.57 $28.50| 40.00% 0.798 $39.90
12269  |9-0-24 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD NA NA NA
12270  |Chelated Palm Micro Package (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5GL LPI NA NA NA
12271 |Kelp Grow (or equal) 25GL 25GL LPI NA NA NA
12398 |Kelp Grow (or equal) 55 GL DRUM | 55 DM $2,054.36|  $2,054.36| 17.49% 2,413.750|  $2,413.75|
12273 |Milorganite (no substitution) 50 LB LB MILORGANITE NA NA NA
12274  |Minors Liquid Fert (no substitution) 25GL 25GL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12275 |Mirimichi Green Carboniz PN (or equal) 40LB 40LB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GRIFFIN

12276  |Nature Safe 10-2-8 (or equal) 50 LB LB INDUSTRIES $0.70 $35.00| 40.00% 0.980 $49.00
12277  |Soluble Potassim Nitrate (or equal) 25LB 25LB YARA $31.25 $31.25 40.00% 43.750 43,75
12278 [Turf Nectar 15-0-0 w/6%Fe (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5GL LPI $22.08 $22.08] 10.00% 24.280 $24.28
12279  |Turf Nectar 15-0-0 w/6%Fe (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $1,817.92]  $1,817.92] 10.00% 1,999.710[  $1,999.71
12391 [20-0-12 (specific blend)**See Specifications** 50LB LB HOWARD $0.45) $22.50[ 40.00% 0.630 $31.50

Palm and Ornamental 8-0-12 *(Specific Blend)*see
12280  [Specifications 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.59) $29.50[ 40.00% 0.826 $41.30

Herbicide
12281 |Atra 4 (no substitution) 2.5 GL 2.5 GL DREXEL NA NA NA
12282 |Atra-5 (no substitution) 2.5 GL 2.5GL DREXEL NA NA NA
12283 [Barricade 4FL (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $166.50] $166.50] 1.00% 168.250 $168.25)
12284  |Basagran (no substitution) 128 OZ (1 GL) GL BASF NA NA NA
12285 [Celsius (no substitution) 10 0Z 10 0Z ENVU $131.20] $131.20] 131.200 $131.20]
12286 [Certainty (no substitution) 1.25 0Z 1.25 0Z NUFARM NA NA NA
12287 |Cheeta Pro (no substitution) 30 GL 30 GL NUFARM NA NA NA
12288 [Dimension (no substitution) 64 0Z 64 0Z CORTEVA $613.00] $613.00]  4.99% 643.630 $643.63|
12289 |Dismiss (no substitution) 6 0Z 6 0Z FMC NA NA NA
12290  [Dismiss NXT (no substitution) 60 0Z 60 0Z FMC $504.80) $504.80] 504.800 $504.80)
12291  [Dismiss South (no substitution) 16 OZ 16 OZ FMC $193.02) $193.02) 193.020] $193.02)
12292  |Drive XLR8 (no substitution) 64 0Z 64 0Z BASF $53.05 $53.05 53.050 $53.05
12293  [Echelon 4SC (no substitution) 128 OZ (1 GL) GL FMC $454.00] $454.00] -2.00% 444920 $444.92
12294 |Fusilade Il (no substitution) 1QT Qr SYGENTA $85.47, $85.47, 85.470) $85.47,
12295 |Garlon (no substitution) 2.5GL GL NO BID NO BID NO BID D NO BID
12296 |Garlon 3A (no substitution) 2.5GL GL CORTEVA $78.40 $196.00] 78.400 $196.00)
12297 |Garlon 4 (no substitution) 2.5GL GL CORTEVA $102.26| $255.65) 255.650 $255.65)
12399  [Manor (no substitution) 80Z 8 0Z NUFARM $38.36 $38.36 38.360 $38.36
11424  |Manuscript (no substitution) - 3GL per case 3 GL CASE SYGENTA $970.00) $970.00]  5.00% 1,019.000[  $1,019.00|
12390  [Monument 75WG (no substitution) 25 GRAM 25 GM SYGENTA $300.00) $300.00] 300.000 $300.00)
12456 [Monument 75WG (no substitution) 30 GRAM 30 GM SYGENTA $360.00) $360.00] 360.000 $360.00)
12300 [Monument 75WG (no substitution) 250 GRAM 250 GM SYGENTA $2,750.00]  $2,750.00 2,750.000]  $2,750.00
12301 [Primo (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $317.00) $317.00] 1.00% 320.000 $320.00]

10 GL MINI

12302 [Primo (no substitution) TOTE 10 GL SYGENTA $2,990.00]  $2,990.00 1.00% 3,020.000]  $3,020.00
12303 |Prosedge (no substitution) 1.33 0Z 1.33 0Z NUFARM $54.18 $54.18 54.180 $54.18
12304  |Pylex (no substitution) 40z 40z BASF $388.00) $388.00| 7.22% 416.000 $416.00)
12305 [Ranger Pro (or equal) 30 GL GL BAYER $16.27 $488.11 9.61% 17.833] $535.00]
12394  [Revolver (no substitution) 87 0Z 87 0Z ENVU $765.80) $765.60]  4.00% 796.220 $796.22)
12307 [Reward (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5 GL SYGENTA $240.00] $240.00] 1.00% 242.500 $242.50]
12308 |Round Up Pro (no substitution) 30 GL 30 GL BAYER $628.63| $628.63|  5.37% 662.400 $662.40]
12310 [Sencor 75DF (no substitution) 5LB 5LB ENVU $125.37| $626.88|  3.69% 650.000 $650.00]
12311 [Solitare (no substitution) 4LB 4LB FMC $596.40) $596.40| -2.00% 584.470 $584.47|
12312 [Specticle (no substitution) 1GL GL ENVU $2,092.80]  $2,092.80[  2.00% 2,134.660|  $2,134.66
12400 [Sure Guard (no substitution) 64 0Z oz $584.50) $584.50) 584.500 $584.50)




12314 [Tribute (no substitution) 6 0Z 6 0Z ENVU $426.40) $426.40) 426.400 $426.40)
12315 [TriMec Southern (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PBI GORDON $214.29 $214.29) 214.290 $214.29)
12316 |Xonerate (no substitution) 120Z 120z FMC $483.00) $483.00) 483.000 $483.00)
Insecticide
12317 |Arena .25G (no substitution) 30 LB 30 LB NUFARM NA NA NA
12318 [Arena 50WDG (no substitution) 25LB 25LB NUFARM $421.75] $421.75] 421.750 $421.75)
12319 [Dylox SL420 (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5 GL ENVU $236.76| $236.76]  9.29% 258.750 $258.75)
12320 |Essentria (no substitution) 1 GL GL ZOECON NA NA NA
12321 [Imdemnify (no substitution) 17.1 0Z 17.1 0Z ENVU $1,963.60]  $1,963.60 1,963.600[  $1,963.60)
12323 [Meridian 25WG (no substitution) 102 0Z 102 0Z SYGENTA $581.40) $581.40) 1.75% 591.600 $591.60)
12327 _ [Safari (no substitution) 3LB 3LB NUFARM $397.20) $397.20|  2.98% 409.050 $409.05)
12329 |Talstar (or equal) 1GL GL NUFARM NA NA NA
12330 [Talstar XTRA (no substitution) 25LB 25LB FMC $32.24 $32.24| 11.66% 36.000 $36.00
12331 [Top Choice (no substitution) 50 LB 50 LB ENVU NA NA NA
12332 [TriStar (no substitution) 1GL GL NUFARM $568.15] $568.15|  3.00% 585.200 $585.20)
Fungicides
12333 |Armada (no substitution) 2LB 2LB ENVU $129.48] NA NA NA
12334 [BannerMaxx (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $255.00) $255.00) 1.96% 260.000 $260.00)
12335 [Banol (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5 GL ENVU $1,254.00  $1,254.00(  4.00% 1,305.010|  $1,305.01
12340  [Concert (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL SYGENTA $267.50) $267.50) 1.00% 270.000 $270.00)
12342 |Daconil Weather Sticker (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL SYGENTA NA NA NA
12343 |Fore 80WP Rainshield (no substitution) 6 LB 6 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12344  [Headway (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $536.00) $536.00]  2.00% 547.000 $547.00)
12345  [Heritage TL (no substitution) 1LB LB SYGENTA $602.00) $602.00) 1.99% 614.000 $614.00)
12346 [Honor (no substitution) 3LB 3LB BASF $196.00) $588.00]  4.00% 612.000 $612.00)
12347 _[Insignia SC (no substitution) 30.50Z 30.50Z BASF $575.84] $575.84| 3.28% 594.750 $594.75)
12348  [Medallion SC (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $685.00) $685.00]  2.00% 699.000 $699.00)
12396 [Pagent (no substitution) 1LB 1LB BASF $115.00) $115.00]  3.00% 118.450] $118.45]
12351 |Prostar 70WG (no substitution) 3LB 3LB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12354  [Subdue Maxx (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $611.00) $611.00) 1.96% 623.000 $623.00)
12355 [Tartan (no substitution) 2.5 GL 2.5 GL ENVU $1,033.00 $1,033.00[ -4.50% 986.500) $986.50)
Wetting Agents
12356 [Cascade Plus (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PRECISION $261.25] $261.25|  6.00% 277.250 $277.25)
Delux (w/ammonium sulphate) (no
12357 _ [substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PRECISION $55.00 $55.00[  7.27% 59.000 $59.00
12401 |Duplex (no substitution) 20 GL 20 GL $830.00) $830.00]  7.35% 891.000 $891.00)
12359  |Envy Turf Pigment (no substitution) 1 GL GL PRECISION NA NA NA
12361 [Gypsum (no substitution) 50 LB LB OLDCASTLE $0.25) $12.35| 13.36% 0.280 $14.00
12362 |Knockdown (defoamer) (no substitution) 16 0Z 16 0Z PRECISION NA NA NA
12363 |Magnaplex (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PRECISION $142.50) $142.50]  7.10% 152.750] $152.75)
12364 |Magnaplex (no substitution) 20 GL DRUM | 20 DM PRECISION $1,060.00  $1,060.00[  7.20% 1,137.000[  $1,137.00]
12365 |[Magnus (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5 GL PRECISION $231.25] $231.25| 8.50% 251.380, $251.38]
12402 [Microyl (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5 GL $108.75] $108.75] 108.750] $108.75)
12367 [pHAcid (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5GL NUMERATOR $200.00) $200.00) 200.000 $200.00)
12368 [Surfactant 80/20 CN (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL DREXEL NA NA NA
12370 |Vivax (no substitution) 2.5 GL 2.5 GL PRECISION NA NA NA
Specialties
12371 [Marking Dust (White Chalk) 1LB LB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12372 [Turface Quickdry 1LB LB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID






