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Council Manager
Michael J. Napoleone, Mayor Jim Barnes
John T. McGovern, Vice Mayor

Tanya Siskind, Councilwoman

Maria Antuiia, Councilwoman

Amanda Silvestri, Councilwoman

April 18, 2024
NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD
Pursuant to Wellington’s Purchasing Policies and Procedures, notice is provided as follows:

INVITATION TO BID: ITB #202403 - Purchase and Delivery for Public Works Chemicals opening date and
time March 13, 2024 at 11:00 am. local time.

1. Wellington has completed its evaluation of ITB #202403 and intends to recommend to Council
the award of Purchase and Delivery for Public Works Chemicals Contracts based on the attached
bid tabulation (Exhibit A) to the bidders below:

e Heritage Landscape Supply Group, Inc.
e Howard Fertilizer and Chemicals, LLC.

e SiteOne Landscaping Supply, LLC.

2. This Notice is conditioned upon and subject to Wellington’s reservation of rights as contained in
the ITB Documents and approval by the Wellington Council

12300 Forest Hill Boulevard « Wellington, Florida 33414 « (561) 791-4000 * Fax (561) 791-4045
wellingtonfl.gov
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HOWARD FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL, LLC

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY, LLC

HERTAGE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY GROUP, INC.

Low Bid

. Brand (Include Unit Price Brand (Include o Brand (Include I
Item # Item Description Pack Size Ivtljer;;lﬂ'fe Labels f(or Equal AE:&‘:S; Based on Total Price Labels f(or Equal AE::::SIL) Ba::: :::TOM Total Price | Labels f(or Equal AE::::SIL) Bag:(;to:nl(;gM Total Price | No Bid Alfj:]iy
Products) UoM Products) Products)
Chemicals (No agricultural grade fertilizers will be
accepted) Key
12248 |0-0-22 Kmag (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.30 $15.00[Thrive 0-0-22E $0.58 $29.00 NO BID NO BID
12249 12-2-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 25GL 25GL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12250 12-2-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12251 15-0-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 25GL 25GL LPI $27.26 $27.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12252 15-0-12 Liquid Fert (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $2,356.12 $2,356.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GrowsStar
Oxadiazon 1.0% |53883-180-
12253 15-0-15 w/.67% Ronstar (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.60 $30.00(15-0-15 82757 $0.74 $37.00 NO BID NO BID
12254 15-0-15 w/merit (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.60 $30.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12255 16-0-8 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.30 $15.00|LESCO 16-0-8 $0.33 $16.50 NO BID NO BID
12256 16-2-16 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.38 $19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12257 16-2-16 with Methalated Urea (specific blend) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.45 $22.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LESCO Dimension
0.21% 18-0-18
12258 18-0-18 with Dimension (specific blend) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.70 $35.00|Mini 10404-87 $0.79 $39.50 NO BID NO BID
LESCO Green Flo
12259  |18-3-6 Liquid Fert (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5GL LPI $25.53 $25.53|18-3-6 $33.20 $33.20 NO BID NO BID
Lesco Green Flo
18-3-6
12260 18-3-6 Liquid Fert (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $2,176.72 $2,176.72((275gal/T0O) $3,331.25| $3,331.25 NO BID NO BID
12261 20-0-10 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.39 $19.50|LESCO 20-0-10 $0.38 $19.00 NO BID NO BID
LESCO 21-0-0
12262 [21-0-0 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.28 $14.00|100%AS $0.36 $18.00 NO BID NO BID
12263 [24-2-11 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.36 $18.00|LESCO 24-2-11 $0.43 $21.50 NO BID NO BID
12264  [30-0-0 Liquid Fert (no substitution) 25GL 25GL LPI $27.83 $27.83|LESCO 30-0-0 $28.54 $28.54 NO BID NO BID
12265 [30-0-0 Liquid Fert (no substitution) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $2,380.04 $2,380.04 [LESCO 30-0-0 $2,533.39| $2,533.39 NO BID NO BID
12266 |400 High Mn (no substitution) 25GL 25GL LPI $23.23 $23.23|LESCO $21.84 $21.84 NO BID NO BID
12267 400 High Mn (no substitution) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $1,937.52 $1,937.52((275 GAL/TO) $2,038.36| $2,038.36 NO BID NO BID
LESCO Palm &
12268 |8-2-12 (specific blend) *see Specifications 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.57 $28.50 Tropical 8/2/12 $0.71 $35.50 NO BID NO BID
12269 [9-0-24 (or equal) 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.46 $23.00|LESCO 9-0-24 $0.42 $21.00 NO BID NO BID
12270 |Chelated Palm Micro Package (or equal) 2.5GL 2.5GL LPI $23.23 $23.23 $21.25 $21.25 NO BID NO BID
12271 Kelp Grow (or equal) 25GL 25GL LPI $96.83 $96.83 $79.74 $79.74 NO BID NO BID
12272 Kelp Grow (or equal) 30 GL DRUM 30 DM LPI $2,054.36 $2,054.36 (265 GAL/DM) $7,170.45| $7,170.45 NO BID NO BID
12273 Milorganite (no substitution) 50 LB LB MILORGANITE $0.32 $16.00 $0.31 $15.50 NO BID NO BID
LESCO T&O
12274  |Minors Liquid Fert (no substitution) 25GL 25GL NO BID NO BID Chelated Micro $24.25 $24.25 NO BID NO BID
12275  |Mirimichi Green Carboniz PN (or equal) 40 LB 40 LB NO BID NO BID $18.03 $18.03 NO BID NO BID
GRIFFIN
12276 Nature Safe 10-2-8 (or equal) 50 LB LB INDUSTRIES $0.70 $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SQM Ultrasol K
12277 |Soluble Potassim Nitrate (or equal) 251B 251B YARA $31.25 $31.25|Plus (50 Ib) $51.85 $51.85 NO BID NO BID
Ferromec Ac 15-0-
12278  |Turf Nectar 15-0-0 w/6%Fe (or equal) 25GL 25GL LPI $22.08 $22.08|0 6Fe Sulfate $49.65 $49.65 NO BID NO BID
12279  |Turf Nectar 15-0-0 w/6%Fe (or equal) 250 GL TOTE | 250 TO LPI $1,817.92 $1,817.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12391 [20-0-12 (specific blend)**See Specifications** 50LB LB HOWARD $0.45 $22.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Palm and Ornamental 8-0-12 *(Specific Blend)*see
12280 |[Specifications 50 LB LB HOWARD $0.59 $29.50 $0.66 $33.00 NO BID NO BID

Herbicide
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HOWARD FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL, LLC

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY, LLC

HERTAGE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY GROUP, INC.

Low Bid

. Brand (Include Unit Price Brand (Include PR Brand (Include o
Item # Item Description Pack Size MU er::;t?rfe Labels f(Or Equal AE:&‘:S; Based on | Total Price | Labels f(or Equal AE::::SIL) Bag:;t :r:lfJ%M Total Price | Labels f(or Equal AE::::SIL) Bag:(;to:nl(;gM Total Price | No Bid Af::]csy
Products) uom Products) Products)
12281 Atra 4 (no substitution) 25GL 25GL DREXEL $53.00 $53.00|Atrazine 4L 19713-11 $47.79 $47.79| Winfield $ 34.13 $68.26
12282  |Atra-5 (no substitution) 25GL 25GL DREXEL $60.90 $60.90 119713-80 $60.30 $60.30 NO BID NO BID
12283 |Barricade 4FL (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $166.50 $166.50 100-1139 $166.50 $166.50( Syngenta $ 166.50| $666.00
12284 |Basagran (no substitution) 1280Z(1GL)| GL BASF $63.75 $63.75 7969-326 $58.08 $58.08| BASF $ 52.11| $104.22
12285 [Celsius (no substitution) 10 0z 10 0z ENVU $128.40 $128.40 432-1507 $128.40 $128.40| Bayer $ 128.40| $1,027.20
12286 |Certainty (no substitution) 1.250z 1.250z NUFARM $97.85 $97.85 59639-226 $82.03 $82.03| Nufarm $ 71.22| $712.20
12287 [Cheeta Pro (no substitution) 30 GL 30 GL NUFARM $3,187.20 $3,187.20 228-743 $2,105.00| $2,105.00| Nufarm $ 1,645.30| $1,645.30
12288 |Dimension (no substitution) 64 OZ 64 OZ CORTEVA $613.00 $613.00 62719-542 $613.00 $613.00| Corteva $ 245.20( $1,226.00
12289 Dismiss (no substitution) 6 0Z 6 0Z FMC $250.00 $250.00 279-3295 $240.00 $240.00( FMC $ 452.72| $1,810.88
12290 Dismiss NXT (no substitution) 60 Oz 60 Oz FMC $590.00 $590.00 279-3383 $590.00 $590.00( FMC $ 590.00| $2,360.00
12291 Dismiss South (no substitution) 16 OZ 16 OZ FMC $193.02 $193.02 279-3351 $200.20 $200.20( FMC $ 158.78| $1,270.24
12292 Drive XLR8 (no substitution) 64 OZ 64 OZ BASF $53.05 $53.05 7969-272 $56.30 $56.30| BASF $ 46.62| $186.48
12293 Echelon 4SC (no substitution) 128 OZ (1 GL) GL FMC $405.00 $405.00 279-3323 $435.00 $435.00( FMC $ 435.00| $1,740.00
12294  |Fusilade Il (no substitution) 1QT QT SYGENTA $85.47 $85.47 100-1084 $90.44 $90.44| Syngenta $ 76.63| $613.40
LESCO Triclopyr 4
12295 |Garlon (no substitution) 25GL GL NO BID NO BID Ester 10404-119 $67.84 $169.60| Corteva $ 220.00( $440.00
12296 Garlon 3A (no substitution) 25GL GL CORTEVA $78.40 $196.00 62719-37 $95.60 $239.00| Corteva $ 146.58 $293.16
12297 |Garlon 4 (no substitution) 2.5GL GL CORTEVA $102.26 $255.65 NO BID NO BID Corteva $ 182.28| $364.56
12298  [Manor (no substitution) 20z 20z NUFARM $38.36 $38.36((4 x 2 0z.) 228-373 $129.80 $129.80| Nufarm $ 39.54| $316.32
11424  |Manuscript (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $970.00 $970.00 100-1626 $970.00 $970.00( Syngenta $ 970.00| $970.00
12390  |Monument 75WG (no substitution) 25 GRAM 25 GM SYGENTA $300.00 $300.00 100-1134 $300.00|  $300.00| Syngenta $ 300.00| $300.00
12300 Monument 75WG (no substitution) 250 GRAM 250 GM SYGENTA $2,750.00 $2,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12301 |Primo (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $317.00 $317.00 100-937 $317.00| $317.00{ Syngenta $ 317.00| $634.00
Pricing Pricing
10 GL MINI Withdrawn Withdrawn
12302 Primo (no substitution) TOTE 10 GL SYGENTA $2,990.00 $2,990.00 $2,990.00( $2,990.00| Syngenta $299.00 $2,990.00
12303 Prosedge (no substitution) 1.330z 1.330z NUFARM $54.18 $54.18 228-711 $61.75 $61.75| Nufarm $ 53.51 $535.10
12304 Pylex (no substitution) 40z 40z BASF $368.00 $368.00 7969-327 $368.00 $368.00| BASF $ 368.00| $1,472.00
12305 |Ranger Pro (or equal) 30 GL GL BAYER $16.27 $488.11 524-517 $19.20 $48.00| Bayer $ 466.59| $466.59
12306 Revolver (no substitution) 320z 320z ENVU $758.00 $758.00 432-1266 $758.00 $758.00( ENVU $ 758.00| $3,032.00
12307 Reward (no substitution) 25GL 25GL SYGENTA $240.00 $240.00 NO BID NO BID Syngenta $ 240.00 $480.00
12308 Round Up Pro (no substitution) 30 GL 30 GL BAYER $628.63 $628.63 524-529 $674.79 $674.79| Bayer $ 582.64 $582.64
12310 [Sencor 75DF (no substitution) 5LB 5LB ENVU $125.37 $626.88 432-1469 $745.77 $745.77| ENVU $ 574.91| $2,299.64
12311 Solitare (no substitution) 41B 41B FMC $579.00 $579.00 279-3355 $579.00 $579.00( FMC $ 579.00| $2,316.00
12312 |Specticle (no substitution) 1GL GL ENVU $2,072.00| $2,072.00 432-1608 $2,072.00| $2,072.00| ENVU $ 2,072.00| $4.144.00
12313  [Sure Guard (no substitution) 16 OZ(1 LB) LB NUFARM $584.50 $584.50|(4 x 16 0z) 71368-114 $685.80 $685.80 (| Nufarm $ 584.50| $2,388.00
12314  [Tribute (no substitution) 6 0Z 6 0Z ENVU $413.60 $413.60 432-1519 $413.60 $413.60| ENVU $ 413.60| $2,481.60
12315  [TriMec Southern (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PBI GORDON $214.29 $214.29 2217-655 $225.00 $225.00( PBI Gordon $ 195.65( $391.30
12316 |Xonerate (no substitution) 120z 120z FMC $483.00 $483.00 378-3621 $533.00 $533.00( FMC $ 533.00| $4,264.00
Insecticide
12317 |Arena .25G (no substitution) 30LB 30LB NUFARM $69.00 $69.90 59639-157 $69.00 $69.00| Nufarm $ 69.00| $4,140.00
12318 |Arena 50WDG (no substitution) 25LB 25LB NUFARM $421.75 $421.75|Arena S .E. 59639-152 $421.75 $421.75( Nufarm $ 688.50| $2,754.00
12319 Dylox SL420 (no substitution) 25GL 25GL ENVU $236.76 $236.76 5481-643-432 $254.80 $254.80| Bayer $ 214.61 $429.22
Wellmark
12320 |Essentria (no substitution) 1GL GL ZOECON $115.00 $115.00 $101.44 $101.44 |International $ 83.59| $334.36
12321 Imdemnify (no substitution) 17.10z 17.1 0z ENVU $1,963.60 $1,963.60 432-1543 $1,963.60( $1,963.60| ENVU $ 1,963.60| $7,854.40
ltemisa ltemisa
Meridian 0.33G Substitue Substitute
12323 Meridian 25WG (no substitution) 102 Oz 102 Oz SYGENTA $581.40 $581.40((40 Ib) 100-961 $107.14 107.14 Syngenta $ 581.40| $2,325.60
12327 |Safari (no substitution) 3LB 3LB NUFARM $397.20 $397.20 86203-11-59639 $397.20 $397.20( Nufarm $ 397.20| $1,588.80
LESCO Crosscheck
12329 [Talstar (or equal) 1GL GL NUFARM $42.25 $42.25(Plus 279-3206-10404 $37.11 $37.11| FMC $ 3717 $146.68
12330 [Talstar XTRA (no substitution) 25LB 25LB FMC $32.24 $32.24 279-9552 $36.75 $36.75| FMC $ 32.01| $1,280.40
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HOWARD FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL, LLC

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY, LLC

HERTAGE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY GROUP, INC.

Low Bid

Brand (Include

Unit Price

Brand (Include

Brand (Include

—_n . i . it Pri . it Pri . . Agenc
Item # Item Description Pack Size Ivtljer;;lﬂ'fe Lab:l:) ;c:;: fsc;ual AE:&‘:S; Bajg(;lw on Total Price Lab:l:) ;c:;: fsc;ual AE::::SIL) Ba::: :::TOM Total Price Lab:l:) ;c;:: fsc;ual AE:&‘:S; Bag:(;t;‘nﬁgm Total Price | No Bid Ifemsy
12331 |Top Choice (no substitution) 50 LB 50 LB ENVU $98.58 $98.58 432-1217 $75.30 $75.30] Bayer $ 61.80| $1,236.00
12332 [TriStar (no substitution) 1GL GL NUFARM $568.15 $568.15 8033-106-1001 $568.15 $568.15| Nufarm $ 568.15| $2,272.60
Fungicides
12333 |Armada (no substitution) 2LB 2LB ENVU $129.48 $129.48 432-1513 $127.01 $127.01| Bayer $ 111.85 $671.10
12334 |BannerMaxx (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $255.00 $255.00 100-1326 $255.00 $255.00( Syngenta $ 255.00| $510.00
12335 Banol (no substitution) 25GL 25GL ENVU $1,254.00 $1,254.00 432-942 $1,254.00 $1,254.00| ENVU $ 501.60| $2,508.00
12340 [Concert (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL SYGENTA $267.50 $267.50 100-1347 $267.50 $267.50( Syngenta $ 107.00| $535.00
12342 |Daconil Weather Sticker (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL SYGENTA $265.00 $265.00 100-1695 $210.00 $210.00( Syngenta $ 210.00| $420.00
12343  |Fore 80WP Rainshield (no substitution) 6 LB 6 LB NO BID NO BID 62719-388 $92.62 $92.62| Corteva $ 49.80( $398.40
12344  |Headway (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $536.00 $536.00 100-1216 $536.00 $536.00| Syngenta $ 536.00| $1,072.00
12345 |Heritage TL (no substitution) 1LB LB SYGENTA $602.00 $602.00 100-1191 $602.00| $602.00| Syngenta $ 602.00| $1,204.00
Pricing Pricing
Withdrawn|  Withdrawn
12346 Honor (no substitution) 3LB 3LB BASF $192.00 $576.00 7969-255 $576.00 $576.00| BASF $ 576.00| $3,456.00
12347 Insignia SC (no substitution) 30.5 0z 30.5 0z BASF $564.25 $564.25 7969-290 $564.25 $564.25| BASF $ 564.25| $2,257.00
12348 Medallion SC (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $685.00 $685.00 100-1448 $685.00 $685.00( Syngenta $ 685.00| $1,370.00
12350 Pagent (no substitution) 3LB 3LB BASF $113.00 $113.00 7969-251 $113.00 $113.00| BASF $ 113.00 $452.00
12351 Prostar 70WG (no substitution) 3LB 3LB NO BID NO BID 432-1477 $176.56 $176.56 NO BID NO BID
12354  [Subdue Maxx (no substitution) 1GL GL SYGENTA $611.00 $611.00 100-796 $611.00 $611.00| Syngenta 611.00| $1,222.00
12355 [Tartan (no substitution) 25GL 25GL ENVU $1,033.00 $1,033.00 432-1446 $1,033.00 $1,033.00| ENVU $ 1,033.00| $2,066.00
Wetting Agents
Precision
12356 [Cascade Plus (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PRECISION $261.25 $261.25 $452.88 $452.88 |Laboratories $ 184.60( $369.20
Delux (w/ammonium sulphate) (no
12357  [substitution) 25GL 25GL PRECISION $55.00 $55.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12358 Duplex (no substitution) 25GL 25GL PRECISION $830.00 $830.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12359  |Envy Turf Pigment (no substitution) 1GL GL PRECISION $134.50 $134.50 $72.59 $72.59 $ 7415  $296.60
12361 Gypsum (no substitution) 50 LB LB OLDCASTLE $0.25 $12.35 $12.45 $12.45 NO BID NO BID
LESCO Recede (2 x
12362 |Knockdown (defoamer) (no substitution) 16 OZ 16 OZ PRECISION $24.00 $24.00|16 0z.) $16.30 $16.30 $ 16.77| $201.24
Precision
12363 |Magnaplex (no substitution) 2.5GL 2.5GL PRECISION $142.50 $142.50 NO BID NO BID Laboratories $ 114.05| $228.10
12364 Magnaplex (no substitution) 20 GL DRUM 20 DM PRECISION $1,060.00 $1,060.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12365 Magnus (no substitution) 25GL 25GL PRECISION $231.25 $231.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12366 Microyl (no substitution) 1GL GL PRECISION $108.75 $108.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12367 pHAcid (or equal) 25GL 25GL NUMERATOR $200.00 $200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12368 [Surfactant 80/20 CN (no substitution) 25GL 25GL DREXEL $47.62 $47.62 $26.25 $26.25 NO BID NO BID
Precision
12370 |Vivax (no substitution) 25GL 25GL PRECISION $206.25 $206.25 $140.30 $140.30|Laboratories $ 157.10 $314.20
Specialties
12371 Marking Dust (White Chalk) 1LB LB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12372  |Turface Quickdry 1LB LB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID






