Exhibit A

Annual Contract for Mulch, Pine Straw & Ground Preparation (Re-Bid) - Bid Tabulation
ITB# 016-18/ER

Key

Primary

Secondary

No Award

East Coast Mulch| *Amerigrow East Coast Mulch Amerigrow East Coast Muich Amerigrow
- Palm Beach Recycling - Palm - Palm Beach Recycling - Palm - Palm Beach Recycling - Palm
County Beach County County Beach County County Beach County
Item Item Description uom *Picked-Up Price Delivered Price Delivered & Installed (Blown-In)
1 |Feo-Mulch —Shredded (See Per Bag No Bid $ 1.40 No Bid $ 1.50 No Bid No Bid
Specs) or Approved Equal
Eco-Mulch — Shredded (S
2 co-Mulch — Shredded (See Per CY No Bid $ 13.00 $32.00yd. |3 14.00 $32.00yd. | $ 27.00
Specs) or Approved Equal
3 |Co!d Mulch-Shredded (See Per Bag No Bid $ 1.60 No Bid $ 1.70 No Bid No Bid
Specs) or Approved Equal
Mulch Gold - Shredded or
4 Approved Equal (Blown-In) (See | Per CY N/A N/A N/A N/A $32.00 yd. S 28.00
Specs)
Melal 100% (Cured) (S Per 2 Cubi
5 elaleuca 100% (Cured) (See JPer 2 Cubic No Bid $ 1.50 No Bid $ 1.60 No Bid No Bid
Specs) or Approved Equal Ft. Bag
Melaleuca 100% (Cured) (Blown+
6 In) (See Specs) or Approved Per CY N/A N/A N/A N/A $32.00 yd. S 27.00
Equal
Pine Bark Mulch Mini Nuggets |Per 2 Cubic X X . .
7 No B 2.7 No B 2. No B No B
(See Specs) or Approved Equal Ft. Bag o Bid » > o Bid 3 8 o Bid o Bid
Pine Bark Mulch Mini Nuggets
8 (Blown-In) (See Specs) or Per CY N/A N/A N/A N/A $43.00 S 44.00
Approved Equal
Certified Playground Woodchip
Mulch (Must meet ASTMF 1292-
P Y Bi 1. Bi 2. d . d
9 04 + F1951 and ASTM F2075) er C No Bid S 31.00 No Bid S 32.00 $38.00 yd S 45.00
(See Specs) or Approved Equal
Pine St Mulch (See S
10 ine Straw Mulch (See Specs)or| o g, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Approved Equal
Pi Mulch P
1 ine Straw Mulch (See Specs) or| ~ Per No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Approved Equal Truckload




Annual Contract for Mulch, Pine Straw & Ground Preparation (Re-Bid) - Bid Tabulation
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East Coast Mulch| *Amerigrow East Coast Mulch Amerigrow East Coast Muich Amerigrow
- Palm Beach Recycling - Palm - Palm Beach Recycling - Palm - Palm Beach Recycling - Palm
County Beach County County Beach County County Beach County
Item Item Description uom *Picked-Up Price Delivered Price Delivered & Installed (Blown-In)
Ryegrass seed- Royal Flush
Blend- 1/3 Sonata PRG, 1/3 Jet X . . . . .
12 PRG, 1/3 Shining Star PRG (POA Per PD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FREE) or Approved Equal
Bermuda Triangle bucket- 3
13 types blended or Approved Per PD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Equal
14 |Princess77 Bermudagrass seed | o No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
or Approved Equal
Clarified Argentine Bahia Grass
15 Seed (See Specs) or Approved Per PD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Equal

*Only Bidders within a 15 mile radius of the Village of Wellington may bid under this category (Picked-up) items.
Amerigrow Recycling is not within the 15 mile radius of the Village.




