
Annual Public Works Contract - ITB#007-15/DZ   Pricing effective 7/15/18 through 7/14/19
D. S. Eakins Marcinkoski Gradall Murray Logan West Construction Rio Bak Corporation Foster Marine Contractors

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 Long Boom Trac Backhoe (min 50' reach) 1 hr 175.00$                     195.00$                         170.00$                          325.00$                             125.00$                             225.00$                                   
2 Long Boom Rubber tired hoe (min 50' R) 1 hr no bid no bid 200.00$                          325.00$                             no bid 250.00$                                   
3 Track Backhoe (1 1/2 cy min) 1 hr 120.00$                     130.00$                         150.00$                          243.00$                             120.00$                             150.00$                                   
4 Track Backhoe (3/4 yd max - small) 1 hr 100.00$                     97.00$                           110.00$                          240.00$                             96.00$                               115.00$                                   
5 Rubber tired Backhoe/loader 1 hr 70.00$                       75.00$                           65.00$                            195.00$                             80.00$                               85.00$                                     
6 Gradall ( rubber tired) 1 hr no bid 98.00$                           140.00$                          210.00$                             no bid 175.00$                                   
7 Small Track hoe - 6 way bucket 1 hr no bid 82.00$                           65.00$                            195.00$                             no bid 175.00$                                   
8 Dump Truck - Tri-Axle (18 cy) 1 hr 70.00$                       62.00$                           65.00$                            85.00$                               75.00$                               75.00$                                     
9 Dump Truck - Tandem ( 16 cy) 1 hr 70.00$                       62.00$                           65.00$                            77.00$                               no bid 60.00$                                     
10 Dump Truck - Single Axle (8-10 cy) 1 hr no bid 72.00$                           50.00$                            68.00$                               no bid 50.00$                                     
11 Off Road Dump Truck (30 cy min) 1 hr no bid 165.00$                         200.00$                          420.00$                             135.00$                             190.00$                                   
12 Off Road Dump Truck (20 cy min) 1 hr no bid 140.00$                         150.00$                          420.00$                             120.00$                             170.00$                                   
13 Skid steer Loader (Bobcat type) 1 hr 65.00$                       70.00$                           60.00$                            195.00$                             70.00$                               85.00$                                     
14 Front end Loader (min 2.5 cy) 1 hr 80.00$                       80.00$                           75.00$                            263.00$                             97.00$                               150.00$                                   
15 Skid Steer Loader Track propelled 1 hr 80.00$                       70.00$                           60.00$                            197.00$                             70.00$                               85.00$                                     
16 Crane (25) Ton 1 hr no bid no bid 125.00$                          did not renew no bid 250.00$                                   
17 Crane (50) Ton 1 hr no bid no bid 175.00$                          did not renew no bid 300.00$                                   
18 Bulldozer (D-4 equivalent) 1 hr 100.00$                     85.00$                           125.00$                          275.00$                             100.00$                             135.00$                                   
19 Grader  (9H equivalent) 1 hr no bid 95.00$                           200.00$                          310.00$                             95.00$                               125.00$                                   
20 Box Tractor 1 hr 65.00$                       75.00$                           60.00$                            170.00$                             65.00$                               80.00$                                     
21 Trencher (walk behind) 1 hr no bid no bid 50.00$                            80.00$                               no bid 60.00$                                     
22 Trencher (mid-range - drivable) 1 hr no bid no bid 75.00$                            114.00$                             no bid 70.00$                                     
23 Vibratory Roller (10 ton min.) 1 hr 80.00$                       85.00$                           55.00$                            190.00$                             80.00$                               90.00$                                     
24 3" Pump w/hoses (Mud hog or trash) 1 hr 25.00$                       no bid 25.00$                            27.00$                               no bid 35.00$                                     
25 Laser grading (finish grading) 10,000 sy 3.50$                         0.90$                             0.80$                              2.95$                                 1.50$                                 3.00$                                       
26 Furnish & install natural stone Rip-Rap DOT Approved 500 tn 80.00$                       no bid 80.00$                            175.00$                             78.00$                               175.00$                                   
27 Skilled Laborer  1 hr 40.00$                       29.50$                           43.00$                            55.00$                               20.00$                               40.00$                                     
28 Supervisor 1 hr 80.00$                       no bid 65.00$                            75.00$                               55.00$                               75.00$                                     
*29 Dewatering System (well points)  1 hr 45.00$                       no bid 58.00$                            210.00$                             no bid 100.00$                                   
*30 6" Submersible Hydraulic Pump  1 hr 40.00$                       no bid 36.00$                            112.00$                             no bid 50.00$                                     
*31 8" Submersible Hydraulic Pump  1 hr 50.00$                       no bid 58.00$                            140.00$                             no bid 75.00$                                     
*32 3 Person Crew w/pickup truck & foreman  1 hr 160.00$                     no bid 170.00$                          210.00$                             130.00$                             250.00$                                   
*33 5 Person Crew w/pickup truck & foreman  1 hr 240.00$                     no bid 200.00$                          380.00$                             165.00$                             330.00$                                   
34 Sand Blasting - Prime and/or painting to be included  1 hr no bid no bid 200.00$                          did not renew no bid 400.00$                                   
35 Furnish, place & compact clean fill (12" lifts) 10,000 sy 12.00$                       no bid 5.00$                              6.00$                                 7.25$                                 10.00$                                     
*36 Pipe installation crew (2" to 6" dia. PVC)  1 hr 300.00$                     no bid 425.00$                          425.00$                             no bid 400.00$                                   
*37 Pipe installation crew (8" to 12" dia. PVC)  1 hr 300.00$                     no bid 425.00$                          515.00$                             no bid 475.00$                                   
*38 Pipe installation crew (15" to 30" dia. RCP)  1 hr 325.00$                     no bid 485.00$                          545.00$                             no bid 550.00$                                   
*39 Pipe installation crew (36" to 60" dia. RCP)  1 hr 400.00$                     no bid 525.00$                          585.00$                             no bid 600.00$                                   

*40 Pipe installation crew (15" to 30" dia. drainage pipe) Hdpe, 
aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated  1 hr 325.00$                     no bid 485.00$                          425.00$                             no bid 550.00$                                   

*41 Pipe installation crew (36" - 60" dia. drainage pipe) Hdpe, 
aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated  1 hr 400.00$                     no bid 525.00$                          445.00$                             no bid 600.00$                                   

*42 Pipe installation crew (72” to 96” dia. drainage pipe) Hdpe, 
aluminum, CMP, PVC, Perforated, 1 hr 400.00$                     no bid 625.00$                          520.00$                             no bid 800.00$                                   

43 Diver with external air source 1 hr no bid no bid 300.00$                          did not renew no bid 400.00$                                   
44 Welding (portable) with complete supplies 1 hr 90.00$                       70.00$                           40.00$                            150.00$                             no bid 150.00$                                   
45 Welding Shop 1 hr 75.00$                       no bid 40.00$                            165.00$                             no bid 100.00$                                   
46 Boom Truck with 25 ft. reach 1 hr 100.00$                     no bid 75.00$                            210.00$                             no bid 60.00$                                     
47 Lowboy capable of hauling heavy equipment 1 hr 100.00$                     76.00$                           150.00$                          185.00$                             110.00$                             300.00$                                   


	SOV

