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February 7, 2019

Warren Prescott
Odums Sod, Inc.
P.O. Box 865

Loxahatchee, FL 33470

RE: Contract #008-16/ENR

Dear Mr. Prescott:

Odums Sod, Inc. is o
for two (2} addition
through April 26, 20:
Council.

ne of the awardees for contract #008-16/ENR for Sod.
al one (1) year renewal by mutual agreement. Wel
20 under the same pricing,

The contract is set to expire on April 26, 2019 and allows
lington would like to exercise the first renewal option
terms and conditions which is conditioned upon subsequent approval by Wellington

In accordance with F

*alm Beach County ordinance number 2011-009, the vendor understands that any Contract that results from
an RFP/ITB may be s

ubject to investigation and/or audit by the Palm Beach County Inspector General. The offeror has reviewed

Palm Beach County ¢

The award is subject
policies. All Propose
Wellington employe
Proposer's firm or an

If any Proposer violat

yrdinance number 2011-009 and is aware of its rights and/or obligations under such ordinance.

to provisions of State Statutes, Palm Beach Count
rs must disclose with their Proposal/Renewal t
e. Further, all Proposers must disclose the na
y of its branches.

y Commission on Ethics and Code of Ethics, and Wellington
he name of any officer, director, or agent who is also a
me of any Wellington employee who is employed in the

and State Ethics Codes is available at the Wellington Cler
this renewal agreement proposer acknowledges no such conflict

Please indicate acce
you should have any

Accept Renewal: W'

ellington, Palm Beach County Commission on Ethics and Code of Ethics
ks Office, 12300 Forest Hill Boulevard, Wellington FL 33414. By signing

tance or rejection of the renewal, as indicated below, and re

turn to my attention by February 15, 2019. If
questions, please contact me or anyon

Department.

Reject Renewal:

Thank you,
Emma Ramirez
561-791-4021

A iaelse in the Purchasing C!, tment. . EDGLUCL' Der
i Y P ccepting r P
drren L,‘\Dt’fgﬁﬂ_uf. ij * ‘é‘_l—%#&o'q PVOPGS?J
Printed Name “Signature : Date Pr"{ ce Sncr anses,
Printed Name Signature Date

eramirez@wellingtonfl.gov
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~ Odums Sod Pricing
Annual Contract for Sod
Bid Tabulation: ITB #008-16/ENR

KEY

Primary

Secondary

No Bid

Current Price

Proposed Price

Current Price

Current Price

Proposed Price

Proposed Price

ltem# Item Description - UOM Picked-Up Price Delivered Price : Delivered & Installed
SOD: Various Types - ALL CERTIFIED
1 Floratam - 5t. Augustine (See Specs) PerSq.Ft. |5S 0.35 &) S 0.36 J 9_??2}, S 0.38 $ Q"f__t;—r
7 Palmetto - 5t. Augustine (See Specs) PerSg. Ft. |$ 0.36 S! !:?__L S 0.37 $! y }.‘:29.. $ 0.39 $ ‘ !L@,
=0 5 g

3 Bahia (See Specs) PerSq.Ft. | S 0.19 $! ii....g’y— S 0.22 $ g )\15_ S 0.24 5! }RB

4 UltimateFlora - Zoysia Per Sq. Ft. No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid N/A

5 SeaDwarf - Seashore Paspalum Per Sq. Ft. No Bid N/A No Bid N/A No Bid N/A

6 [Bermuda PerSq. ft. |4 0s0| )t.[_(;}_ $ 0.56 5! !"i & $ oass| . Q‘L"E_

: 1 —

7 Celebration PerSq.Ft. |$ 0.50 $ ‘i_@_ S 0.56 5! } ii_ s 0.458 $ | )"{LP;.

8 Tiftway 419 Bermuda (See Specs) PerSq. Ft. | S 0.55 5! IL! S 0.57 5! l _5 S 0.578 $ ' !Lﬁ 2
Vendor preparation of surface prior to sod

9 install of any listed sod (cut/remove Per Sq. Ft No Bid N/A No Bid N/A $ 0.20
vegetation & loosen soil) for the following 9 ’ ~ O
types: Floratam, Bahia and Bermuda —

St

Bahia Sod (Pegged/Staked) Price includes b.-

10 staking or pegging sod on various slopes — PerSq. Ft. No Bid N/A No Bid N/A s 0.05 O‘___
€.g. canal and lake banks. Slope exceeds 3:1 4






