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Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total

SECTION A - Asphalt Milling and Resurfacing

MILL EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT (1") 50,000.00 SY  $         2.10  $     105,000.00  $         2.25  $     112,500.00  $         2.97  $     148,500.00  $         1.75  $       87,500.00  $         1.85  $       92,500.00  $         1.75  $       87,500.00  $         1.90  $       95,000.00  $         2.00  $     100,000.00  $         4.45  $     222,500.00 

MILL EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT (1.5") 80,000.00 SY  $         2.15  $     172,000.00  $         2.45  $     196,000.00  $         3.21  $     256,800.00  $         1.85  $     148,000.00  $         1.95  $     156,000.00  $         2.05  $     164,000.00  $         1.95  $     156,000.00  $         2.60  $     208,000.00  $         4.90  $     392,000.00 

MILL EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT (2") 40,000.00 SY  $         2.15  $       86,000.00  $         2.65  $     106,000.00  $         3.45  $     138,000.00  $         1.95  $       78,000.00  $         1.95  $       78,000.00  $         2.45  $       98,000.00  $         2.00  $       80,000.00  $         3.00  $     120,000.00  $         5.35  $     214,000.00 

MILL EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT

(< 5,000 SY) 5.00 HR  $  8,300.00  $       41,500.00  $  8,500.00  $       42,500.00  $  9,484.53  $       47,422.65  $  6,500.00  $       32,500.00  $  4,900.00  $       24,500.00  $  8,755.00  $       43,775.00  $  7,000.00  $       35,000.00  $  6,090.00  $       30,450.00  $  7,984.50  $       39,922.50 

PORTABLE MILLING MACHINE 100.00 HR  $     240.00  $       24,000.00  $     300.00  $       30,000.00  $     396.05  $       39,605.00  $     200.00  $       20,000.00  $     220.00  $       22,000.00  $     430.00  $       43,000.00  $     220.00  $       22,000.00  $     125.00  $       12,500.00  $     274.25  $       27,425.00 

MANHOLE ADJUSTMENT (F&I ADAPTER RINGS) 100.00 EA  $     190.00  $       19,000.00  $     200.00  $       20,000.00  $     727.98  $       72,798.00  $     150.00  $       15,000.00  $     180.00  $       18,000.00  $     195.00  $       19,500.00  $     178.00  $       17,800.00  $     450.00  $       45,000.00  $     220.25  $       22,025.00 

TRAFFIC CONTROL OFFICERS 4.00 HR  $       70.00  $            280.00  $     100.00  $            400.00  $       78.87  $            315.48  $       65.00  $            260.00  $       68.00  $            272.00  $     100.00  $            400.00  $       69.75  $            279.00  $       90.00  $            360.00  $       74.75  $            299.00 

F&I PRIME FOR EXISITING FINISHED BASE 5,000.00 SY  $         0.45  $         2,250.00  $         2.00  $       10,000.00  $         0.53  $         2,650.00  $         0.35  $         1,750.00  $         0.43  $         2,150.00  $         0.55  $         2,750.00  $         0.40  $         2,000.00  $         0.80  $         4,000.00  $         2.80  $       14,000.00 

ADJUST VALVE BOXES & MISC STRUCTURES 150.00 EA  $       95.00  $       14,250.00  $     100.00  $       15,000.00  $     363.99  $       54,598.50  $       85.00  $       12,750.00  $       90.00  $       13,500.00  $     150.00  $       22,500.00  $       90.00  $       13,500.00  $     450.00  $       67,500.00  $     265.10  $       39,765.00 

Asphalt Items #10 through #16 shall include tack coat

SP 12.5 LEVEL C  (< 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 300.00 TN  $     145.00  $       43,500.00  $     220.00  $       66,000.00  $     312.70  $       93,810.00  $     143.00  $       42,900.00  $     110.00  $       33,000.00  $     175.00  $       52,500.00  $     145.00  $       43,500.00  $     149.24  $       44,772.00  $     145.20  $       43,560.00 

SP 12.5 LEVEL D (< 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 300.00 TN  $     152.00  $       45,600.00  $     230.00  $       69,000.00  $     312.70  $       93,810.00  $     135.00  $       40,500.00  $     110.00  $       33,000.00  $     175.00  $       52,500.00  $     154.75  $       46,425.00  $     152.32  $       45,696.00  $     145.20  $       43,560.00 

SP 12.5 LEVEL C (> 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 10,000.00 TN  $     100.00  $  1,000,000.00  $     180.00  $  1,800,000.00  $     141.53  $  1,415,300.00  $     109.00  $  1,090,000.00  $     110.00  $  1,100,000.00  $     110.00  $  1,100,000.00  $     110.00  $  1,100,000.00  $     125.91  $  1,259,100.00  $     103.50  $  1,035,000.00 

SP 12.5 LEVEL D (> 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 10,000.00 TN  $     105.00  $  1,050,000.00  $     190.00  $  1,900,000.00  $     141.53  $  1,415,300.00  $     109.00  $  1,090,000.00  $     110.00  $  1,100,000.00  $     112.00  $  1,120,000.00  $     110.00  $  1,100,000.00  $     139.01  $  1,390,100.00  $     103.50  $  1,035,000.00 

SP  9.5 LEVEL C  (< 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 300.00 TN  $     150.00  $       45,000.00  $     220.00  $       66,000.00  $     312.70  $       93,810.00  $     111.00  $       33,300.00  $     100.00  $       30,000.00  $     175.00  $       52,500.00  $     150.00  $       45,000.00  $     153.32  $       45,996.00  $     153.00  $       45,900.00 

SP  9.5 LEVEL C  (> 300 TONS) INCLUDING TACK 10,000.00 TN  $     110.00  $  1,100,000.00  $     140.00  $  1,400,000.00  $     141.53  $  1,415,300.00  $     113.00  $  1,130,000.00  $     110.00  $  1,100,000.00  $     110.00  $  1,100,000.00  $     114.00  $  1,140,000.00  $     133.75  $  1,337,500.00  $     111.00  $  1,110,000.00 

ASPHALT OVERBUILD/FULL DEPTH (2" LIFTS) 

INCLUDING TACK 3,000.00 TN  $     130.00  $     390,000.00  $     160.00  $     480,000.00  $     164.25  $     492,750.00  $     148.00  $     444,000.00  $     130.00  $     390,000.00  $     120.00  $     360,000.00  $     133.00  $     399,000.00  $     132.06  $     396,180.00  $     131.00  $     393,000.00 

Total Section A  $  4,138,380.00  $  6,313,400.00  $  5,780,769.63  $  4,266,460.00  $  4,192,922.00  $  4,318,925.00  $  4,295,504.00  $  5,107,154.00  $  4,677,956.50 

SECTION B - Pathway Resurfacing

OVERLAY EXISTING ASPAHLT MULTI PURPOSE 

PATHWAY (6' WIDE X 1-1/4" INCLUDING TACK) 2,000.00 SY  NO BID  NO BID  $       11.00  $       22,000.00  $       11.80  $       23,600.00  $         8.25  $       16,500.00  $         8.00  $       16,000.00  $       16.15  $       32,300.00  $         8.45  $       16,900.00  $         8.44  $       16,880.00  $       13.40  $       26,800.00 

OVERLAY EXISTING ASPAHLT MULTI PURPOSE 

PATHWAY  (8' WIDE X 1-1/4" INCLUDING TACK) 2,000.00 SY  NO BID  NO BID  $       11.00  $       22,000.00  $       11.80  $       23,600.00  $         8.25  $       16,500.00  $         8.00  $       16,000.00  $       12.10  $       24,200.00  $         8.45  $       16,900.00  $         8.44  $       16,880.00  $       13.00  $       26,000.00 

F&I 1-1/4" OF TYPE S-III ASPHALT TO BASE. PRIME 

INCLUDED. 2,000.00 SY  NO BID  NO BID  $       13.00  $       26,000.00  $       10.36  $       20,720.00  $         8.25  $       16,500.00  $         8.00  $       16,000.00  $       12.10  $       24,200.00  $         8.45  $       16,900.00  $         9.06  $       18,120.00  $       13.40  $       26,800.00 

FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION OF EXISTING ASPHALT 

PATHWAY (4-6" DEEP) 2,000.00 SY  NO BID  NO BID  $       25.00  $       50,000.00  $       11.53  $       23,060.00  $       18.50  $       37,000.00  $       19.00  $       38,000.00  $       26.75  $       53,500.00  $       16.00  $       32,000.00  $       24.56  $       49,120.00  $         6.75  $       13,500.00 

REMOVAL OF EXISTING ASPHALT PATHWAY 

SURFACE (1-2"), REFINISH EXISTING BASE, PRIME 

INCLUDED (READY TO PAVE)
2,000.00 SY  NO BID  NO BID  $         3.77  $         7,540.00  $       11.93  $       23,860.00  $       18.50  $       37,000.00  $         4.75  $         9,500.00  $         7.90  $       15,800.00  $         5.00  $       10,000.00  $       10.23  $       20,460.00  $       10.95  $       21,900.00 

MISC ASPHALT PATCHING (< 50 TONS) 200.00 TN  NO BID  NO BID  $     250.00  $       50,000.00  $     312.70  $       62,540.00  $     195.00  $       39,000.00  $     155.00  $       31,000.00  $     470.00  $       94,000.00  $     198.00  $       39,600.00  $     136.75  $       27,350.00  $     370.40  $       74,080.00 

MISC ASPHALT PATCHING (> 50 TONS) 200.00 TN  NO BID  NO BID  $     230.00  $       46,000.00  $     185.13  $       37,026.00  $     175.00  $       35,000.00  $     155.00  $       31,000.00  $     200.00  $       40,000.00  $     170.00  $       34,000.00  $     136.75  $       27,350.00  $     328.40  $       65,680.00 

F&I ASPAHLT MOWING STRIP PRIOR TO GUARDRAIL 

PLACEMENT 

(3' WIDE X 3" THICK)
1,000.00 LF  NO BID  NO BID  $       30.00  $       30,000.00  $         6.46  $         6,460.00  $       15.00  $       15,000.00  $       24.00  $       24,000.00  $       16.00  $       16,000.00  $       25.00  $       25,000.00  $         7.61  $         7,610.00  $       26.90  $       26,900.00 

F&I FLOWABLE FILL GUARDRAIL MOWING STRIP (3" 

THICK) AROUND EXISTING POSTS 1,000.00 SY  NO BID  NO BID  $       60.00  $       60,000.00  $       15.29  $       15,290.00  $       40.00  $       40,000.00  $       48.00  $       48,000.00  $       46.35  $       46,350.00  $       50.00  $       50,000.00  $       14.84  $       14,840.00  $       62.95  $       62,950.00 

F&I 8" THICK BASE ROCK AND FINISH GRADE WITH 

PRIME 2,500.00 SY  NO BID  NO BID  $       30.00  $       75,000.00  $       17.16  $       42,900.00  $       18.50  $       46,250.00  $       19.00  $       47,500.00  $       16.75  $       41,875.00  $       20.00  $       50,000.00  $       21.18  $       52,950.00  $       18.60  $       46,500.00 

Total Section B  NO BID  $     388,540.00  $     279,056.00  $     298,750.00  $     277,000.00  $     388,225.00  $     291,300.00  $     251,560.00  $     391,110.00 

SECTION C - Seal Coating

ASPHALT SEAL COATING (<3,000 SY) 3,000.00 SY  NO BID  NO BID  $         2.20  $         6,600.00  $         2.09  $         6,270.00  $         2.05  $         6,150.00  $         1.50  $         4,500.00  $         5.00  $       15,000.00  $         1.95  $         5,850.00  $         2.25  $         6,750.00  $         3.20  $         9,600.00 

ASPHALT SEAL COATING (>3,000 SY) 3,000.00 SY  NO BID  NO BID  $         2.00  $         6,000.00  $         1.52  $         4,560.00  $         1.95  $         5,850.00  $         1.50  $         4,500.00  $         5.00  $       15,000.00  $         1.90  $         5,700.00  $         2.25  $         6,750.00  $         3.10  $         9,300.00 

Total Section C  NO BID  $       12,600.00  $       10,830.00  $       12,000.00  $         9,000.00  $       30,000.00  $       11,550.00  $       13,500.00  $       18,900.00 

ALL PAVING INC R & D PAVING, LLC
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