
"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers

BID OPENING DATE: December 1, 2020 received timely as of the above receiving date and time.

BID OPENING TIME: 11:00 AM (local time) All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation,

ITB #202101 if any, are hereby rejected as late"
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SOUTH FLORIDA 
BUILDING, INC DBA BDI 

MARINE 
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FERREIRA 
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CO., INC
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ANNUAL PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACT

VENDOR
D.S. EAKINS 

CONSTRUCTION 
CORPORATION

RIO-BAK 
CORPORATION

2. Bid Cover Page YES

YES

YES

YES

1. Bid submittal-one (1) original and one (1) PDF (CD) Copy YES

5. Schedule of Subcontractors/Supplies YES

4. Schedule of Value YES

3. Acknowledgement of Addendums (if any) YES YES

YES

6. Schedule of Equipment and Materials YES YES

7. Drug Free Workplace YES YES

8. Trench Safety Affidavit YES YES

10. References YES YES

YES9. Questionnaire

YES

12.  Certification Pursuant to Florida Statue § 215.4725 YES YES

YES

11. Sworn Statement under Section 287.133(3) (a) YES

15. Proof of Workers Compensation Insurance/Workers 
Compensation Exemption Affidavit YES YES

13.  Insurance Certificates YES YES

14. Copy of Appropriate Licenses YES YES

18. Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES

16. Wellington Local Preference Affidavit PALM BEACH 
COUNTY

WESTERN 
COMMUNITIES

17. Conflict of Interest YES YES



Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total
TRACK BACKHOE (1 1/2 CY MIN) 1.00 HR $165.00 $165.00 $254.50 $254.50 $155.00 $155.00 $300.00 $300.00 $125.00 $125.00 $118.00 $118.00 $155.00 $155.00 $119.00 $119.00 $168.00 $168.00 $150.00 $150.00

TRACK BACKHOE (3/4 YD MAX - SMALL) 1.00 HR $150.00 $150.00 $231.00 $231.00 $115.00 $115.00 $300.00 $300.00 $85.00 $85.00 $100.00 $100.00 $135.00 $135.00 $95.00 $95.00 $120.25 $120.25 $115.00 $115.00

RUBBER TIRED BACKHOE/LOADER 1.00 HR $120.00 $120.00 $200.50 $200.50 $70.00 $70.00 $300.00 $300.00 $75.00 $75.00 $70.00 $70.00 $94.00 $94.00 $70.00 $70.00 $96.80 $96.80 $85.00 $85.00

GRADALL ( RUBBER TIRED) 1.00 HR $99.00 $99.00 $231.00 $231.00 $145.00 $145.00 $300.00 $300.00 $120.00 $120.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $100.00 $100.00 $159.75 $159.75 $175.00 $175.00

DUMP TRUCK - TRI-AXLE (18 CY) 1.00 HR $67.00 $67.00 $90.00 $90.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $90.00 $90.00 $70.00 $70.00 $83.00 $83.00 $70.00 $70.00 $103.05 $103.05 $75.00 $75.00

DUMP TRUCK - TANDEM ( 16 CY) 1.00 HR $64.00 $64.00 $90.00 $90.00 $70.00 $70.00 $65.00 $65.00 $80.00 $80.00 $70.00 $70.00 NO BID NO BID $70.00 $70.00 $103.05 $103.05 $75.00 $75.00

DUMP TRUCK - SINGLE AXLE (8-10 CY) 1.00 HR $72.00 $72.00 $90.00 $90.00 $70.00 $70.00 $60.00 $60.00 $75.00 $75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.00 $60.00 $90.80 $90.80 $50.00 $50.00

OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK (30 CY MIN) 1.00 HR $260.00 $260.00 $250.00 $250.00 $225.00 $225.00 $500.00 $500.00 $150.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID $160.00 $160.00 $140.00 $140.00 $181.20 $181.20 $190.00 $190.00

OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK (20 CY MIN) 1.00 HR $210.00 $210.00 $250.00 $250.00 $200.00 $200.00 $400.00 $400.00 $140.00 $140.00 NO BID NO BID $145.00 $145.00 $130.00 $130.00 $173.25 $173.25 $170.00 $170.00

SKID STEER LOADER (BOBCAT TYPE) 1.00 HR $120.00 $120.00 $156.50 $156.50 $65.00 $65.00 $100.00 $100.00 $65.00 $65.00 $80.00 $80.00 $94.00 $94.00 $60.00 $60.00 $83.20 $83.20 $85.00 $85.00

FRONT END LOADER (MIN 2.5 CY) 1.00 HR $125.00 $125.00 $180.50 $180.50 $80.00 $80.00 $300.00 $300.00 $85.00 $85.00 $80.00 $80.00 $110.00 $110.00 $74.00 $74.00 $99.20 $99.20 $150.00 $150.00

SKID STEER LOADER TRACK PROPELLED 1.00 HR $125.00 $125.00 $188.50 $188.50 $65.00 $65.00 $100.00 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 $80.00 $80.00 $94.00 $94.00 $59.00 $59.00 $83.20 $83.20 $85.00 $85.00

BULLDOZER (D-4 EQUIVALENT) 1.00 HR $150.00 $150.00 $173.50 $173.50 $150.00 $150.00 $300.00 $300.00 $85.00 $85.00 $150.00 $150.00 $120.00 $120.00 $90.00 $90.00 $100.55 $100.55 $135.00 $135.00

GRADER  (9H EQUIVALENT) 1.00 HR $180.00 $180.00 $195.00 $195.00 $220.00 $220.00 $300.00 $300.00 $95.00 $95.00 $150.00 $150.00 $110.00 $110.00 $100.00 $100.00 $176.00 $176.00 $125.00 $125.00

VIBRATORY ROLLER (10 TON MIN.) 1.00 HR $110.00 $110.00 $141.25 $141.25 $60.00 $60.00 $275.00 $275.00 $65.00 $65.00 $60.00 $60.00 $90.00 $90.00 $60.00 $60.00 $89.10 $89.10 $90.00 $90.00

SKILLED LABORER 1.00 HR $35.00 $35.00 $32.75 $32.75 $45.00 $45.00 $60.00 $60.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $40.00 $40.00 $45.00 $45.00 $42.35 $42.35 $40.00 $40.00

SUPERVISOR 1.00 HR $65.00 $65.00 $146.25 $146.25 $65.00 $65.00 $125.00 $125.00 $85.00 $85.00 $90.00 $90.00 $80.00 $80.00 $65.00 $65.00 $61.55 $61.55 $75.00 $75.00

3 PERSON CREW W/PICKUP TRUCK & FOREMAN 1.00 HR $170.00 $170.00 $246.50 $246.50 $175.00 $175.00 $200.00 $200.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $165.00 $165.00 $160.00 $160.00 $208.65 $208.65 $250.00 $250.00

5 PERSON CREW W/PICKUP TRUCK & FOREMAN 1.00 HR $240.00 $240.00 $320.00 $320.00 $220.00 $220.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $210.00 $210.00 $245.00 $245.00 $220.00 $220.00 $286.90 $286.90 $350.00 $350.00

LONG BOOM TRAC BACKHOE (MIN 50' REACH) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $420.75 $420.75 $175.00 $175.00 $300.00 $300.00 $160.00 $160.00 $180.00 $180.00 $160.00 $160.00 $150.00 $150.00 $162.25 $162.25 $250.00 $250.00

LONG BOOM RUBBER TIRED HOE (MIN 50' R) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $300.00 $300.00 $225.00 $225.00 $300.00 $300.00 $225.00 $225.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $250.00 $250.00

SMALL TRACK HOE - 6 WAY BUCKET 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $231.00 $231.00 $70.00 $70.00 $300.00 $300.00 $75.00 $75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.00 $64.00 $237.50 $237.50 $175.00 $175.00

CRANE (25) TON 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $445.25 $445.25 $140.00 $140.00 $300.00 $300.00 $200.00 $200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $100.00 $100.00 $176.40 $176.40 $250.00 $250.00

CRANE (50) TON 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $679.00 $679.00 $185.00 $185.00 $300.00 $300.00 $350.00 $350.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 $175.00 $249.95 $249.95 $300.00 $300.00

BOX TRACTOR 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $155.25 $155.25 $65.00 $65.00 $300.00 $300.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $85.00 $85.00 $59.00 $59.00 $71.80 $71.80 $80.00 $80.00

TRENCHER (WALK BEHIND) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $121.50 $121.50 $55.00 $55.00 $50.00 $50.00 $48.00 $48.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.00 $49.00 $85.05 $85.05 $60.00 $60.00

TRENCHER (MID-RANGE - DRIVABLE) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $200.50 $200.50 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $70.00 $70.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $68.00 $68.00 $127.15 $127.15 $68.00 $68.00

3" PUMP W/HOSES (MUD HOG OR TRASH) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $25.75 $25.75 $25.00 $25.00 $100.00 $100.00 $20.00 $20.00 $30.00 $30.00 NO BID NO BID $20.00 $20.00 $48.75 $48.75 $35.00 $35.00

LASER GRADING (FINISH GRADING) 500.00 SY NO BID NO BID $5.00 $2,500.00 $1.00 $500.00 $35.00 $17,500.00 $3.00 $1,500.00 $2.00 $1,000.00 $1.75 $875.00 $0.79 $395.00 $1.45 $725.00 $8.00 $4,000.00

FURNISH & INSTALL NATURAL STONE RIP-RAP DOT 
APPROVED

10.00 TN NO BID NO BID $250.00 $2,500.00 $85.00 $850.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $95.00 $950.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $165.00 $1,650.00 $95.00 $950.00 $96.50 $965.00 $250.00 $2,500.00

DEWATERING SYSTEM (WELL POINTS) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $567.00 $567.00 $60.00 $60.00 $600.00 $600.00 $85.00 $85.00 $50.00 $50.00 NO BID NO BID $42.50 $42.50 $72.40 $72.40 $100.00 $100.00

6" SUBMERSIBLE HYDRAULIC PUMP 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $62.50 $62.50 $38.00 $38.00 $150.00 $150.00 $45.00 $45.00 $40.00 $40.00 NO BID NO BID $35.00 $35.00 $55.55 $55.55 $50.00 $50.00

8" SUBMERSIBLE HYDRAULIC PUMP 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $62.50 $62.50 $60.00 $60.00 $250.00 $250.00 $65.00 $65.00 $50.00 $50.00 NO BID NO BID $50.00 $50.00 $76.30 $76.30 $75.00 $75.00

SAND BLASTING - PRIME AND/OR PAINTING TO BE 
INCLUDED

1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $128.75 $128.75 $225.00 $225.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $200.00 $200.00 NO BID NO BID $400.00 $400.00

FURNISH, PLACE & COMPACT CLEAN FILL (12" LIFTS) 500.00 SY NO BID NO BID $20.00 $10,000.00 $7.00 $3,500.00 $20.00 $10,000.00 $10.00 $5,000.00 $10.00 $5,000.00 $9.50 $4,750.00 $5.00 $2,500.00 $13.75 $6,875.00 $13.00 $6,500.00

PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (2" TO 6" DIA. PVC) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $764.75 $764.75 $425.00 $425.00 $600.00 $600.00 $280.00 $280.00 $290.00 $290.00 NO BID NO BID $300.00 $300.00 $369.70 $369.70 $400.00 $400.00

PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (8" TO 12" DIA. PVC) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $764.75 $764.75 $425.00 $425.00 $600.00 $600.00 $300.00 $300.00 $290.00 $290.00 NO BID NO BID $300.00 $300.00 $369.70 $369.70 $475.00 $475.00

PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (15" TO 30" DIA. RCP) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $833.75 $833.75 $485.00 $485.00 $700.00 $700.00 $325.00 $325.00 $290.00 $290.00 NO BID NO BID $310.00 $310.00 $379.50 $379.50 $550.00 $550.00

PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (36" TO 60" DIA. RCP) 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $970.25 $970.25 $525.00 $525.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $380.00 $380.00 $340.00 $340.00 NO BID NO BID $375.00 $375.00 $488.20 $488.20 $600.00 $600.00

PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (15" TO 30" DIA. 
DRAINAGE PIPE) HDPE, ALUMINUM, CMP, PVC, 
PERFORATED

1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $833.75 $833.75 $485.00 $485.00 $600.00 $600.00 $300.00 $300.00 $290.00 $290.00 NO BID NO BID $300.00 $300.00 $379.50 $379.50 $550.00 $550.00

PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (36" - 60" DIA. DRAINAGE 
PIPE) HDPE, ALUMINUM, CMP, PVC, PERFORATED

1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $970.25 $970.25 $525.00 $525.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $365.00 $365.00 $324.00 $324.00 NO BID NO BID $325.00 $325.00 $488.20 $488.20 $600.00 $600.00

PIPE INSTALLATION CREW (72” TO 96” DIA. 
DRAINAGE PIPE) HDPE, ALUMINUM, CMP, PVC, 
PERFORATED,

1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $970.25 $970.25 $625.00 $625.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $420.00 $420.00 $390.00 $390.00 NO BID NO BID $395.00 $395.00 $594.65 $594.65 $800.00 $800.00

DIVER WITH EXTERNAL AIR SOURCE 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $175.00 $175.00 $325.00 $325.00 $300.00 $300.00 $450.00 $450.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $100.00 $100.00 $283.50 $283.50 $400.00 $400.00 *
WELDING (PORTABLE) WITH COMPLETE SUPPLIES 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $150.00 $150.00 $60.00 $60.00 $300.00 $300.00 $95.00 $95.00 $90.00 $90.00 NO BID NO BID $40.00 $40.00 $112.05 $112.05 $150.00 $150.00

WELDING SHOP 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $125.00 $125.00 $60.00 $60.00 $500.00 $500.00 $80.00 $80.00 $75.00 $75.00 NO BID NO BID $40.00 $40.00 $71.80 $71.80 $100.00 $100.00

BOOM TRUCK WITH 25 FT. REACH 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $275.00 $275.00 $75.00 $75.00 $300.00 $300.00 $110.00 $110.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.00 $75.00 $115.30 $115.30 $75.00 $75.00

LOWBOY CAPABLE OF HAULING HEAVY EQUIPMENT 1.00 HR NO BID NO BID $350.00 $350.00 $150.00 $150.00 $400.00 $400.00 $150.00 $150.00 $120.00 $120.00 $165.00 $165.00 $100.00 $100.00 $154.60 $154.60 $200.00 $200.00

Directional Bore 2' diameter pipe 1.00 FT NO BID NO BID $14.50 $14.50 NO BID NO BID $10.00 $10.00 $38.00 $38.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.80 $13.80 $20.00 $20.00

Directional Bore 4" diameter pipe 1.00 FT NO BID NO BID $20.75 $20.75 NO BID NO BID $12.00 $12.00 $45.00 $45.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.05 $20.05 $30.00 $30.00

Directional Bore 6" diameter pipe 1.00 FT NO BID NO BID $32.25 $32.25 NO BID NO BID $14.00 $14.00 $50.00 $50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.25 $26.25 $40.00 $40.00

Directional Bore 8" diameter pipe 1.00 FT NO BID NO BID $39.75 $39.75 NO BID NO BID $16.00 $16.00 $58.00 $58.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.30 $59.30 $50.00 $50.00

Directional Bore 10" diameter pipe 1.00 FT NO BID NO BID $50.25 $50.25 NO BID NO BID $18.00 $18.00 $75.00 $75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $70.35 $70.35 $65.00 $65.00

Directional Bore 12" diameter pipe 1.00 FT NO BID NO BID $57.50 $57.50 NO BID NO BID $20.00 $20.00 $90.00 $90.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $115.95 $115.95 $90.00 $90.00

MINOR ERROR 
ON SOV

Non-Responsive

FOSTER MARINE 
CONTRACTORS, INC.

TOP GRADE CONTRACTING, 
INC.HINTERLAND GROUP, INC D.S. EAKINS 

CONSTRUCTION CORP. RIO BAK CORPORATION SOUTH FLORIDA BUILDING, 
INC

FERREIRA CONSTRUCTION 
COMPANY, INC.

MARCINKOSKI GRADALL, 
INC. MAN CON INC. MURRAY LOGAN 

CONSTRUCTION, INC. FG CONSTRUCTION, LLC

ANNUAL PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACT - ITB #202101


