
Annual Sod Contract 

Bid Tabulation: ITB #202111

Date: March 8, 2021

Odums Sod Agricultural Land Odums Sod Agricultural Land Odums Sod Agricultural Land Primary Secondary

Item # Item Description UOM

SOD:  Various Types - ALL CERTIFIED

1
Floratam – St. Augustine                  

(See Specs)           
Per Sq. Ft. 0.36$                          0.45$                           0.38$                          0.65$                           0.41$                          0.44$                           

2
Palmetto - St. Augustine                   

(See Specs)
Per Sq. Ft.  $                          0.37  $                           0.48  $                          0.39  $                           0.68 0.42$                          0.47$                           

3
Citra Blue - St. Augustine              (See 

Specs)
Per Sq. Ft.  $                          0.42  $                           0.75  $                          0.44  $                           0.85  $                          0.47  $                           0.74 

4
Bitter Blue - St. Augustine              

(See Specs)
Per Sq. Ft.  No Bid  $                           0.75  No Bid  $                           0.85  No Bid  $                           0.74 

5 Bahia (See Specs) Per Sq. Ft.  $                          0.24  $                           0.25  $                          0.26  $                           0.35  $                          0.30  $                           0.26 

6 UltimateFlora - Zoysia Per Sq. Ft.  No Bid  $                           1.25  No Bid  $                           1.75  No Bid  $                           1.25 

7 SeaDwarf - Seashore Paspalum Per Sq. Ft.  No Bid  $                           2.75  No Bid  $                           3.75  No Bid  $                           2.75 

8 Bermuda Per Sq. Ft.  $                          0.40  $                           0.48  $                          0.42  $                           0.58  $                          0.46  $                           0.48 

9 Celebration Per Sq. Ft.  $                          0.40  $                           0.50  $                          0.42  $                           0.60  $                          0.46  $                           0.55 

10 Tiftway 419 Bermuda (See Specs) Per Sq. Ft.  No Bid  $                           0.55  No Bid  $                           0.75  No Bid  $                           0.65 

11

Vendor preparation of surface prior 

to sod install of any listed sod 

(cut/remove vegetation & loosen 

soil) for the following types: 

Floratam, Bahia and Bermuda

Per Sq. Ft. N/A N/A N/A N/A  $                          0.20  $                           0.35 

12

Bahia Sod (Pegged/Staked) Price 

includes staking or pegging sod on 

various slopes – e.g. canal and lake 

banks.  Slope exceeds 3:1

Per Sq. Ft. N/A N/A N/A N/A  $                          0.07  $                           0.30 

Pine Straw & Ground Preparation 

13 Pine Straw Mulch (See Specs) Per Bale N/A N/A N/A N/A  No Bid  No Bid 

14 Pine Straw Mulch (See Specs)
Per 

Truckload
N/A N/A N/A N/A  No Bid  No Bid 

MISC ITEMS

15 Seed and Mulch (See Specs) Per Sq. Yd. N/A N/A N/A N/A  No Bid  $                           0.49 

16 Hydro Seed (See Specs) Per Sq. Yd. N/A N/A N/A N/A  No Bid  $                           0.90 

Key

Exhibit A

 Delivered & Installed  Picked-Up Price   Delivered Price 


