
A GREAT HOMETOWN 
Council 
Anne ,crwig. 1layor 
John T. i\lcGo,·crn . Vice ~1:iyor 
Michael Drahos. Councilman 
Michael J. Napolcone. Councilman 
Tanya Siskind. Councilwoman 

September 2, 2021 

Mike Maggio 
Howard Fertilizer and Chemical Co. 
1107 Gateway Blvd 
Boynton Beach, FL 33426 
mmaggio@howardfert.com 

RE: ITB#201918 Contract Renewal 

Dear Mr. Maggio, 

M■n■i;rr 

Jim Borne 

Howard Fertilizer and Chemical Co. is an awardee for contract # 201918 Purchase and Delivery for PW 
Chemicals .. The contract is set to expire on December 9, 2021 and allows for three (3) additional one ( 1) year 
renewals by mutual agreement. Wellington would like to exercise the second renewal option through 
December 8, 2022 under the same terms and conditions as stipulated on Page 12 of the referenced 1TB which 
is conditioned upon subsequent approval by Wellington Council. 

Pursuant to sections 215.4725 and 287.135 of the Florida Statutes, by accepting this renewal, AWARDEE 
certifies that it, its affiliates, suppliers, subcontractors, and consultants who will perform or benefit hereunder, 
are not on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List and are not participating in a boycott of Israel. If 
this Agreement is valued greater than $1 million, AW ARDEE further certifies pursuant to sections 215.473 
and 287.135, Florida Statutes, that it, its affiliates, suppliers, subcontractors, and consultants who will perform 
or benefit hereunder, (a) have not been placed on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List ar 
the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petrolewn Energy Sector List; and (b) do not have 
business operations in Cuba or Syria. Submitting a false certification shall be deemed a material breach of this 
Agreement. If the Village detennines, using credible information available to the public, that AW ARDEE has 
submitted a false certification, the Village may terminate this Agreement and pursue the remedies set forth in 
section 287.135, Florida Statutes, and any other available remedies. 

The award/renewal is subject to provisions of State Statutes, Palm Beach County Commission on Ethics and 
Code of Ethics, and Wellington policies. All Awardees must disclose with their Renewal the name of any 
officer, director, or agent who is also a Wellington employee. Further, all Awardees must disclose the name 
of any Wellington employee who is employee in the Awardees finn or any of its branches. 

If AW ARD EE violates or is a party to a violation of the Wellington, Palm Beach County or Florida Code of 
Ethics with respect to this Renewal, AW ARDEE may be disqualified from performing the work described in 
this Renewal or from furnishing the goods or services for which the AW ARD EE submitted and shall be further 
disqualified from bidding on any future Proposals/Bids for work or for goods or services for Wellington. A 
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copy of the Wellington, Palm Beach County Commission on Ethics and Code of Ethics and State Ethics Codes 
is available at the Wellington Clerk's Office, 12300 Forest Hill Boulevard, Wellington, FL 33414. By signing 
this Renewal Agreement, AW ARD EE acknowledges no such conflict 

Compliance with F.S. 448.095 - Wellington requires all contractors and subcontractors to register with the 
U.S. Department of Homeland Security's E-Verify system to verify the work authorization status of their 
newly hired employees. All contractors performing work for Wellington are required to provide proof.of 
registration with the E-Verify System and must provide an affidavit stating that each subcontractor it hires 
does not employ, contract with, or subcontract with an unauthorized alien. 

AW ARD EE shall not unlawfully discriminate against any person in its operation and activities or in its use or 
expenditure of funds in fulfilling its obligations under this Agreement. AW ARD EE shall affirmatively comply 
with all applicable provisions of the Americans with Disabilities Act {ADA) in the course of providing any 
services funded by this Agreement, including Titles I and Il of the ADA (regarding nondiscrimination on the 
basis of disability), and all applicable regulations, guidelines, and standards. In addition, A WARDEE shall 
take affirmative steps to ensure nondiscrimination in employment against disabled persons. Such actions shall 
include, but not be limited to, the following: employment, upgrading, demotion, transfer, recruitment or 
recruiting advertising, layoff, termination, rates of pay, other forms of compensation terms and conditions of 
employment, training (including apprenticeship) and accessibility. 

AW ARDEE's decisions regarding the delivery of services under this Agreement shall be made without regard 
to or consideration of race, age, religion, color, gender, sexual orientation, gender identity, gender expression, 
national origin, marital status, physical or mental disability, political affiliation, or any other factor which 
cannot be lawfully used as a basis for service delivery. 

Please indicate acceptance or rejection of the renewal and return to my attention by September 17, 2021. 
If you should have any questions, please contact me or anyone else in the Purchasing Department. 

/ w 1' -\.-h 1o r o f o Se...cl .pr ~ ce._ c. h l!"'j e..$ 

<--. AcceptRenewal: MIG\,-\~e..,\ M~§z)~u ~h/h , - 9 / 14 f-z_oz...( 
Printed Name/fitle Signatur:4~ Date 

Reject Renewal: __________ _ 
Printed Name/Title 

Thank you, 
Maria Miserendino 
561-791-4154 
rnrniserendino@wellingtontlgoy 

Signature Date 
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Purc.ha<0 & Delivery for Public Works Chemicals 

Bid Tabulation - ITB 1201918 

REVISED SCHEDULE OF VALUES EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 9, 2020 THROUGH DECEMBER 8, 2021 

VENDORS 

Howard Fertill,er & H1l1n1 Acri 
SlteOne landscape 

Supply, LLC 
Chemlul Enterprises, LLC 

Non-Loul 
Non-LDQI Non-Loul 

Item• Item Description Unit of Mr.11ure Unlt Prlte Unit Price Unit Price 

IC 0·0 ·22 Km•g (or equal) lb s !1 ~} s t))) s 0.34 

2C 12-2-12 Liqu id Fort (orequ•II gal No Bid No Bid s 10.84 

3C 15-0-12 liauld Fort {or •quail lb s 7.12 No Bid No Bid 

•C 15-0 -15 w/.67" Ron>tor (or equal) lb s 0.53 No Bid s 0.86 

SC lS•O•lS w/me ri t (or equall lb s 040 No Bid s 0.43 

6C 16-0•8 (or equ•II lb s 014 s 01> s 0.24 

7C 16-2 -16 for •qu•II lb s 0 1i No8id s 0.3S 

BC 16-2-16 with Metfulated Ur~a (s~dfk blend, lb s OH No Bid No Bid 

9C 18·0-18 with Dimension (lpe-ctflc blend) lb s 0.56 No Bid s 0.69 

IOC 18·3·6 Liauid !en (or equal! ul s 7.11 s llOO s 13.00 

IJC 20-0· 10 {o, ••u•II ul s 0.33 No 8,d s 0.30 

J2C 21 -0-0 (or eou•II lb s 0.24 s 0.2S No Bid 

J3C 24-2-11 (o, ••••II lb s 0.31 No 81d s 0.26 

14C 30-0 -0 Uau,d F•rt (no ,ubst~utlon) ul s 6.99 No Bid s 9.SB 

ISC 400 High Mn (no substitution! ul s 8.00 No Bid No 81d 

l6C 8-2-12 fspecific blend) •see bid pate 16 lb s 0.43 No Bid s 0.54 

17C 9 -0-24 lo• equal) lb s 0.33 No Bid s 0.41 

!BC Chel;Ued Pilm Micro P~chFJe lor equal) gal No8id No Bid s 8.58 

19C ~clp Grow for equal) ul s 38.00 s 10000 No 01d 

lOC M1lorurute (no substitution) lb s 0.27 s 0 24 No Bid 

21C M inors Liquid Fe-rt (no substitutlonl gol No8id s 12.00 No81d 

22( M lrlmlc.hl G,ee:n ca,boni1 PN {or tqual) lb No8ld No Bid s 0.42 

23C N•tur• S•fe 10-2·8 (or equ•I) lb s 0.61 :- (t 6C. No8id 

24C Solublt Potanim Nitt~t t for tqu.al) lb s 0.62 No 8id No 81d 

2SC Turf Nec1•r IS -0 -0 w/6"F• (orequ•II ,.1 s 5.79 s 7.SO s 8 .14 

P1lm1ry Aw•rdet 

No Award l!tms 
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Howard Fenlllzer & 
Chemical 
Non-Local 

Item# Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Prtce 

Htrblcido 

IH Atra 4 (no substitution\ ul s 12.00 

2H At~-5 (no substitution) aal s 16.80 

3H Ba rricade 4Fl (no n,bstltution) gal s 143.00 

4H Basatr.in lno substitution} ul s 69,00 

SH Celsius {no substitution} 10oz s 104 ,00 

6H Cenalntv (no substitution) Ot s SS.36 

7H Che-cu Pro (no sub5titutlon) gal s 6000 

SH D1mcns1on (no substitution) ul s 215.S0 

9H D•sm,ss (no substitution) &401 s 460.00 

I0H Dismiss NXT (no substitution) Ot s 10,82 

IIH Dismiss South (no substitution) 16oz s 119.00 

12 H Drive XLAS (no substttutfon) Ol s 0.70 

13H Ech~lon 4SC (no substitution} gal s 343.00 

14H Fus1ladt II lno substitution) Ol s 2.08 

!SH G11rlon (no substitu0on) ul No Bid 

16H Garlon 3A. lno substitution) ga l No Bid 

17H Garlon 4 (no substitution) ga l s 9S.96 

!SH llo•an (no substitut ion) aal No Bid 

19H M~nor (no substitution) Ol 5 8.00 

20H Manus,cnpt (no substi1ution) ul S636 a CO!O 

21H Monumtnl 7SWG (no substitution) 250 Kt~m s 225.00 

22H Primo (no substitut ion) gal s 274.00 

23H Princ~p (no substitution} gal s 19.70 

24H P,osedv.e lno substitution) Ol s 40 75 

25H l>ytex (no substitution} Ol s 66.00 

26H Quick Sllve, tno subultution) 01 $ ll (, J 

VENDORS 

Helena Acri 
Enterprises, UC 

Non-Local 

Unit Price 

No81d 

No81d 

s ll7.00 

s 100.00 

s 104.00 

s 68.00 

s 65.00 

s 215.S0 

s 578.00 

s 10.82 

s 151.00 

s (l<J,: 

s 343.00 

s 2.19 

s 58.00 

s 58.00 

s 80.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

S636 • cose 

s 225.00 

s 29000 

s 20.00 

s 43,61 

s 66.00 

s 20.00 

SlteOne landscape 
Supply, UC 

Non-Local 

Unit Price 

No Bid 

No 81d 

s 143.00 

s 72.00 

s 104.00 

s S9.20 

s 65.60 

s 21s.20 

s 615.00 

s 10.29 

s 172.00 

s 0.80 

s 326.00 

s 2.27 

No 81d 

s 75,20 

No 81d 

~oBld 

No 8,d 

S1S9 a gal. = $636 • 

cue-

5250 

s 290.00 

s 22.32 

s 45.49 

s 66.00 

s 19.38 

Primary Awia,dtt Seconcfary Awardte 
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Howard Fertilizer & 
Chemlal 
Non-Local 

Item I Item Oescrlptlon Unit of Measure Unit Price 

27H Ran,<r Pro lor O<lluall .. , $ 1193 

28H Rcvol...,cr (no subs.:tltution) 8701 s 595.00 

29H Reward (no s.ub~hutlon) 2.s .. 1 s 19750 

30H Round Up Pro (no substitution) .. , s 17.72 

31H Scdae Hammer (no substltutlonl Ol No81d 

32H Segment ll (no substltutionl ,., s 196.00 

33H S>encor 7SOF" (J\O substi1utlon) lb s 125.00 

34H Solit.irc (no substitution) lb s 90.00 

35H Spect1cle Ina subnitutionl ul s 1,700.00 

36H Stonewall (or t-Qual) lb s 16 85 

37H Sure Guilrd (no subslitvtion) lb s 8.7' 

38H Trnac1ty (no substitvtion) •al s 775.00 

39H Tribute (no substi1:utk>n) 6oz s 360.00 

40H TrlM cc Southern (no s.ubstltudonl gal s 58.00 

41H Xoneratc (no subnitution) 01 s 35.84 

1-cld• 

II Arcn~ 25G {no subnltu11on) lb s 1.85 

21 Arena SOWOG (no substitution) 2.5 lb $ 239.10 

31 Oylo11t Sl 420 (no subftilut.ionl ul s 70.20 

41 E.s.scntrl~ (no subs1itutlonJ .. , s 92.00 

SI lmdt-mn1fv (no substitution) Ol $ 99.42 

61 Mer ld,~n .33G (no substhutionl lb s 2.00 

71 Met1d lan 2SWG (no sub,titutJonl 102 Ol s 510.00 

81 Merit 7SWP (or equ,111 R•I $3.20 ""' o, . 

91 N 1m1tt1 P,o (no substitutlonl lb No Sid 

513.27 per .773 lb 
101 Onhene 7S (no substituOonl lb bag 

VENDORS 

Helen1A&rl 
Enterprises, UC 

Non•Loal 

Unit Price 

$ 12.50 

s 595.00 

s 197.50 

s 21.00 

$ 43.61 

s 215.00 

s 79.20 

s 119 .00 

s 1,671.25 

s 10.00 

5550.96 • 
bonlc/Surccuard SC. 
WOG11:cne 

No Bod 

s 360.00 

s 56.70 

$ 35.84 

s 185 

s 239.10 

s 72.45 

No Bid 

s 99.41 

s 2.20 

s 51000 

$60 • R•I. 

s S.00 

No Bid 

SlleOne Landscape 
Supply, LLC 

Non-Local 

Unit Price 

s 13.30 

s 595.00 

s 197.50 

No81d 

s 39.10 

s 257.07 

s 81.00 

s 107.25 

s 1,700.00 

s 9.88 

s B 6 1 

s 775.00 

s 360.00 

s 61 .37 

$ 34.09 

s 1.85 

s 597.75 

s 78.00 

No81d 

s 99,42 

s 2.23 

s 510.00 

No Bid 

s S.00 

No81d 

Primary Aw•rdt!e s«ond1ry .Aw,rdtt 

NoAWMdh.trM Acencyllems 

Ad1u,l~(l t0 ? drdm,11 pofnt:; ~, 

h d do,rum.e nh 

no b i d 
<3510.:> 
)\""1 , ero 

!"730' 
l'-'oo 

oO 

5~1 So ?~r 
7ct1S , "l..':> 
'37d- , <.c,O 
l.oJ...'00 
3i,C,375 o-Z.. 

\.C\O 
3CS &1, '2.-5 
,q. 7 (.p 

t05 



Howard Fenil l,er & 
Chemical 

Non-Local 

Item• Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Price 

Ill Provaunt (no substhvtionl 120oz s 852,00 s 

121 S•larl (no sub1IIM!on) lb s 111.10 s 

131 Sevin St. (no substitution) gal s 41.96 s 

141 hlst.1, (or equal) •al s 40,00 s 

151 hlsrar Pl (no ,ubsUtutlon) lb s 0.79 s 

161 Talslar XTRA (no substjtution) lb s 1.09 s 

171 Top Choic e fno substitution} lb s 2.13 s 

181 TriSur (no subst.llutlon) .,, s 515.00 s 

191 Upsti r Go ld (no substitution) •al s 47.86 s 

201 Zen ith 21= [no substitution) gal s 48.00 

Fun•lddes 

IF Armad .a (no substitution) lb s 45.00 s 

2F BannerMau (no substitution I ••I s 21800 s 

3F 8anol (no substitution) 2.s .. 1 s 982.SO s 

4F Chipco 26 GT (no substitution) gol s 130.96 s 

SF Chipco S1S!.nature XTRA (no substitution) lb s 30.00 s 

6F Clean{• 26/36 FLO (no substitution) ••I s 122.60 s 

7F Clearv's 3336 FLO (no substitution) gal s 93.00 s 

BF Concen (no substitution I 2.S B•I s 202.SO s 

9F Oeconil Ultrcx (no subnitutlon) lb s 12.60 s 

!OF Oeconil Weather Sticker fno s:ubstrtutlonl 2.5 •al s 64,00 s 

llf £uh~ 20 EW (no substitutlon) gal s 139.00 s 

12F Fort SOWP Rainshield (no substitution) lb s 7,83 s 

13F Headw~v (no 1ubstltution) gal s 438,00 s 

14F Heritage TL (no substl1utlon) lb s 530.00 

!SF Honor (no substitut ion) 3 lb s 4S9.00 s 

16F Insignia SC (no substitution) 30,501 s 449.88 s 

VENDORS 

Helena Acri 
SlteO ne Landscape 

Supply, llC 
Enterprises, llC 

Non-Local 
Non-Local 

Unit Price Unit Price 

852,00 s 852,00 

111.10 s lll.10 

40,00 s 44.92 

45.00 s 42.00 

0.90 s 0.87 

1.17 s 1.20 

2.10 s 2.30 

515.00 s 515.00 

45.00 No Bid 

No Bid s 52,12 

S2.00 s S4.98 

218.00 s 218.00 

982.SO s 982.50 

141.00 s 159.20 

31.82 s 31.82 

122.60 s 122.60 

86,00 No Bid 

202.50 s 202.S0 

12 .60 s 12.60 

64 .00 s 64.00 

ISB.00 s 140,00 

8.75 s 37.SO 

438.00 s 438,00 

ss10 ... 1. s 530.00 

459.00 s 459,00 

449 88 s 449,88 

Primary Aw.ardtt Secoridary Aw~rdtt 

NoA.wo,dltlms Af;encyllems 
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Howord Fer1ll11er & 
Chemical 

Non-Local 

Item I Item Oescriptlon Unit of Measure Unit Price 

17F lnst~ta (no substitution) 1 S ral s 405.00 

18F Medallion SC lno ,ubstitutlont ul s S70,00 

19F Mlragr Stressgard (no substhuUon) ,.1 $ 182.SO 

10f P.11en1 (no subsntutlon) lb s 89.SS 

llF Prost a, 70\VG (no subnltutlon} lb s 46 67 

12F Securf (no substitution) 1.Sul s 1,S41.SO 

13F Specuo 90 WOG (no substitution) lb s 11 .60 

2•F Subdue M;iin (no substttuOonJ gal s 538.00 

25F T;iirtan (no substi1~ion) 2.5ul s 8SO.OO 

26F ze,oTol (no subs1itution) ral s 39.46 

Wettln1 Aaenb 

IW Case.ad!!! Plus (no subt'litutlon) gal s 99,68 

Delux (w/ammonlum sulphate) 

1W llno subs-titutlon\ ral s 20.64 

3W Oualcx (no substitution\ ul s 38,35 

4W Eco Sand (no iubstitution) lb No81d 

SW Envy Turf Pitment (no substhuOon) ul s 120.44 

6W fo;iim (or e-qu;iiU .. 1 s 44,00 

7W Gypsum (no substihrt1ont lb s 0.23 

8W ICnoc.kdown (defoamerl (no substitution) oz s 1.53 

9W Magnapler: (no substitution) R•I s 46,74 

!OW Magnus (no substitution) a•I s 69.80 

IIW M1crovl lno substltutlonl HI s 4028 

12W pHAcld (or iequ1il) gal s 80.00 

13W Surfactant 80/10 CN (no ,ubsUtutlon) gal s 10.00 

ldW Triplo (no substltUllon} R>I s 51.31 

!SW Vrv,u: (no Jubstitution) RJI s 70,57 

Sped1IUts 

15 Mark1n 1: Oust !White Chalk) lb No Did 

VEN DORS 

Helena Aarl 
Enterprises, LLC 

Non-Local 

Unit Price 

s 405.00 

s 570.00 

$ 187.00 

s !14.30 

s 64.95 

s 1.541.SO 

s 1•.77 

s 538 00 

s 8S0.00 

s 84.31 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No 81d 

No Bid 

No Bid' 

No8id 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Std 

No Bid 

SlteOne Landscape 

Supply, UC 
Non-Local 

Unit Price 

s 405,00 

$ S70.00 

s 187.00 

$ 89.SS 

s 65,81 

s 1,625.00 

s 16.44 

s 538.00 

s 850,00 

s 56.30 

s 28.83 

No81d 

No Bid 

NoBld 

No Bid 

No Sid 

s 0.34 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No81d 

s 38.61 

No Bid 

No Bid 

s 68.14 

s 0 .1S 

Primary Awi1,du Se<onduy Awitdff 
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lt.m • Item Daatptlon 

2S Tutface MVP lled 

3S Turf ace Qulctd 

VENDORS 

Howard Fenlllier a Holen• Acri 
Chemlcal EnterpnMI, LlC 
Non-I.Gui Non-Local 

Unit of MH1ure Unit Price Unit Price 

lb 

lb 

SlleOne undscape 
Supply, LLC 
Non-Local 

Unit Price 
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